This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular vendor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
RFB No. 22-0027; Side Loader Refuse Trucks
March 16, 2022

recommendation for approval by the appropriate persons and/or by Columbus Council.

Peterbilt of Atlanta

Burroughs Diesel, Inc.”

Amrep Manufacturing Company LLC

RFC Equipment Solutions LLC

Truck Equipment Sales, Inc.

Vendors (Jackson, GA) (Laurel, MS) (Ontario, CA) (Jacksonville, FL) (Mobile, AL)
Communication Page (Form 4) v v v v v
"Federal Compliance Pages v v v v v
"Business License v v v v v
Form W-9 v v v v v
Addenda Acknowledgement (Form 5) - (4) v v v v v
SAM.gov UEI (Form 6) v v v v v
OPTION 1: CAB & CHASSIS
"Product Literature v v
"Warranty Information v v
"Det. Spec. Response Pages (Form 1A-REV) v v
Manufacturer/Model PETERBILT 520 DUAL STEER DU AEESNFE'ESREF‘}%\E”EW NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lead time 360 DAYS 120 DAYS
Form 1B-REV2 Pricing Page / UNIT PRICE $160,828.00 $203,793.00
TOTAL PRICE (40 UNITS) $6,433,120.00 $8,151,720.00
OPTION 2: BODY
Product Literature v v v
"Warranty Information v v v
"Det. Spec. Response Pages (Form 2A-REV) v v v
Manufacturer/Model NO BID NO BID AMREP AMHASLTPO19 BRIDGEPORT RANGER BRIDGEPORT RANGER
Lead time 100 DAYS 150 DAYS 150 DAYS
Form 2B-REV2 Pricing Page / UNIT PRICE $139,962.00 $139,995.00 $148,677.00
TOTAL PRICE (40 UNITS) $5,598,480.00 $5,599,800.00 $5,947,080.00

* Burroughs Diesel, Inc. will give a $4,000 discount per truck if CCG is willing to pay for chassis within 30 days of delivery to body builder; also provided delivery timeline.

2 Environmental Products Group, Inc. - If there is a massive supply upcharge, the prices will be passed at cost to the City.

? Associated Fuel Systems, Inc. failed to include the required Detailed Specifications pages; failure to include automatically renders vendor's response non-responsive.

4 Action Truck Center failed to include the required form 'Communication Concerning This Solicitation’; failure to include automatically renders vendor's response non-responsive.

® McNeilus Truck & Manufacturing failed to include the required form 'Communication Concerning This Solicitation’; failure to include automatically renders vendor's response non-responsive.




This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular vendor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
RFB No. 22-0027; Side Loader Refuse Trucks
March 16, 2022

recommendation for approval by the appropriate persons and/or by Columbus Council.

Sansom Equipment Company

Environmental Products Group, Inc.’

Carolina Environmental Systems, Inc.

Associated Fuel Systems, Inc.?

Action Truck Center’

Ll (Stonecrest, GA) (Atlanta, GA) (Austell, GA) (Conley, GA) (Dothan, AL)
Communication Page (Form 4) v v v v *
"Federal Compliance Pages v v v v v
"Business License v v v v v
Form W-9 v v v v *
Addenda Acknowledgement (Form 5) - (4) v v v v v
SAM.gov UEI (Form 6) v v v v L
OPTION 1: CAB & CHASSIS
Product Literature v v
"Warranty Information v v
"Det. Spec. Response Pages (Form 1A-REV) * v
Manufacturer/Model NO BID NO BID NO BID - A??:ENﬁgng'SEFETZ 4 AUTOCAR ACX64
Lead time 150 DAYS 150 DAYS
Form 1B-REV2 Pricing Page / UNIT PRICE $175,456.00 $176,749.00
TOTAL PRICE (40 UNITS) $7,018,240.00 $7,069,960.00
OPTION 2: BODY
Product Literature v v v
"Warranty Information v v v
"Det. Spec. Response Pages (Form 2A-REV) v v v
Manufacturer/Model NEW WAY SIDEWINDER ASL LABRIE AUTOMIZER HEIL DURAPACK PJJ:SSRAUTOMATED SIDE NO BID NO BID
Lead time 90-120 DAYS 60-80 DAYS 180-210 DAYS
Form 2B-REV2 Pricing Page / UNIT PRICE $149,547.00 $160,923.00 $169,989.00
TOTAL PRICE (40 UNITS) $5,981,880.00 $6,436,920.00 $6,799,560.00

* Burroughs Diesel, Inc. will give a $4,000 discount per truck if CCG is willing to pay for chassis within 30 days of delivery to body builder; also provided delivery timeline.

2 Environmental Products Group, Inc. - If there is a massive supply upcharge, the prices will be passed at cost to the City.

? Associated Fuel Systems, Inc. failed to include the required Detailed Specifications pages; failure to include automatically renders vendor's response non-responsive.

“ Action Truck Center failed to include the required form 'Communication Concerning This Solicitation’; failure to include automatically renders vendor's response non-responsive.

® McNeilus Truck & Manufacturing failed to include the required form 'Communication Concerning This Solicitation’; failure to include automatically renders vendor's response non-responsive.




COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
RFB No. 22-0027; Side Loader Refuse Trucks
March 16, 2022

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular vendor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award
recommendation for approval by the appropriate persons and/or by Columbus Council.

e McNeilus Truck & Manufacturing’
(Villa Rica, GA)
Communication Page (Form 4) &
"Federal Compliance Pages w
"Business License v
Form W-9 v
Addenda Acknowledgement (Form 5) - (4) v
SAM.gov UEI (Form 6) v
OPTION 1: CAB & CHASSIS
Product Literature
"Warranty Information
"Det. Spec. Response Pages (Form 1A-REV)
Manufacturer/Model NO BID
Lead time|
Form 1B-REV2 Pricing Page / UNIT PRICE
TOTAL PRICE (40 UNITS)
OPTION 2: BODY
Product Literature v
"Warranty Information v
"Det. Spec. Response Pages (Form 2A-REV) v
MCNEILUS ZERO RADIUS
Manufacturer/Model MODEL 3148
Lead time 150 DAYS
Form 2B-REV?2 Pricing Page / UNIT PRICE $168,695.00
TOTAL PRICE (40 UNITS) $6,747,800.00

* Burroughs Diesel, Inc. will give a $4,000 discount per truck if CCG is willing to pay for chassis within 30 days of delivery to body builder; also provided delivery timeline.

2 Environmental Products Group, Inc. - If there is a massive supply upcharge, the prices will be passed at cost to the City.

? Associated Fuel Systems, Inc. failed to include the required Detailed Specifications pages; failure to include automatically renders vendor's response non-responsive.

“ Action Truck Center failed to include the required form 'Communication Concerning This Solicitation’; failure to include automatically renders vendor's response non-responsive.

® McNeilus Truck & Manufacturing failed to include the required form 'Communication Concerning This Solicitation’; failure to include automatically renders vendor's response non-responsive.



