

INMATE SUPPLIES (Annual Contract) RFB 21-0021					This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.										
					Bob Barker Company (Fuquay Varina, NC)		Charm-Tex (Brooklyn, NY)		Marina Textiles, Inc (Duluth, GA)		Uniforms Mfg of Arizona (Phoenix, AZ)		Victory Supply, LLC (Mount Pleasant, TN)		
Addendum No. 1					X		X		X		X		X		
Addendum No. 2					X		X		X		X		X		
Addendum No. 3					X		X		X		X		X		
Communication Page (Form 1)					X		X		X		X		X		
Bid Form (Form 2)					X		X		X		X		X		
REVISED Pricing Pages (Excel Format)					X		X		X		X		X		
Minimum Award Agreement (Form 3)					X		X		X		X		X		
Contract Signature Page (Form 4)					X		X		X		X		X		
Product Literature					X		X		X		X		X		
Product Samples					X		X				X		X		
Mattress/Mattress Cover Warranty					X		X				N/A				
Sample Itemized Invoice					X										
Business License 2021					2015		X				will obtain if awarded		X		
W-9 Rev Oct 2018 Form					X		X				X		X		
NOTES: "No Bid" Statement from McKesson Medical-Surgical Govt Solutions, LLC															
ITEM					SIZES	EST Annual Usage	Unit of Measure	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE
CATEGORY A: INMATE CLOTHING															
1	Trousers - Mens - Navy - TriStitch				Small	100	ea	\$6.39	\$639.00	\$8.72	\$872.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.75	\$575.00
2	Trousers - Mens - Navy - TriStitch				Medium	200	ea	\$6.39	\$1,278.00	\$8.72	\$1,744.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.75	\$1,150.00
3	Trousers - Mens - Navy - TriStitch				Large	500	ea	\$6.39	\$3,195.00	\$8.72	\$4,360.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.75	\$2,875.00

	ITEM	SIZES	EST Annual Usage	Unit of Measure	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE
4	Trousers - Mens - Navy - TriStitch	Xlarge	500	ea	\$6.39	\$3,195.00	\$8.72	\$4,360.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.75	\$2,875.00	\$6.75	\$3,375.00
5	Trousers - Mens - Navy - TriStitch	XXLarge	500	ea	\$6.39	\$3,195.00	\$8.72	\$4,360.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.95	\$2,975.00	\$7.35	\$3,675.00
6	Trousers - Mens - Navy - TriStitch	XXXLarge - 14XL	250	ea	\$6.90	\$1,725.00	\$8.72	\$2,180.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.80	\$1,700.00	\$7.75	\$1,937.50
7	Trousers - Womens - Brown - TriStitch	Small	160	ea	\$6.55	\$1,048.00	\$6.54	\$1,046.40	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$990.40	\$6.75	\$1,080.00
8	Trousers - Womens - Brown - TriStitch	Medium	160	ea	\$6.55	\$1,048.00	\$6.54	\$1,046.40	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$990.40	\$6.75	\$1,080.00
9	Trousers - Womens - Brown - TriStitch	Large	320	ea	\$6.55	\$2,096.00	\$6.54	\$2,092.80	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$1,980.80	\$6.75	\$2,160.00
10	Trousers - Womens - Brown - TriStitch	XLarge	80	ea	\$6.55	\$524.00	\$6.54	\$523.20	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$495.20	\$6.75	\$540.00
11	Trousers - Womens - Brown - TriStitch	XXLarge	80	ea	\$6.55	\$524.00	\$6.54	\$523.20	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$495.20	\$7.35	\$588.00
12	Trousers - Womens - Brown - TriStitch	XXXLarge - 14XL	20	ea	\$6.55	\$131.00	\$6.72	\$134.40	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$7.20	\$144.00	\$7.75	\$155.00
13	Inmate Pants- Mens only	Small	50	ea	\$6.55	\$327.50	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.75	\$287.50	\$6.75	\$337.50
14	Inmate Pants- Mens only	Medium	200	ea	\$6.55	\$1,310.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.75	\$1,150.00	\$6.75	\$1,350.00
15	Inmate Pants- Mens only	Large	200	ea	\$6.55	\$1,310.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.75	\$1,150.00	\$6.75	\$1,350.00
16	Inmate Pants- Mens only	X Large	200	ea	\$6.55	\$1,310.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.75	\$1,150.00	\$6.75	\$1,350.00
17	Inmate Pants- Mens only	XX Large	200	ea	\$6.55	\$1,310.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.95	\$1,190.00	\$7.35	\$1,470.00
18	Inmate Pants- Mens only	XXX Large - 14 XL	50	ea	\$6.55	\$327.50	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$309.50	\$7.75	\$387.50
19	Jeans	Small	50	ea	\$7.55	\$377.50	\$9.18	\$459.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$309.50	\$10.77	\$538.50
20	Jeans	Medium	50	ea	\$7.55	\$377.50	\$9.18	\$459.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$309.50	\$10.77	\$538.50
21	Jeans	Large	50	ea	\$7.55	\$377.50	\$9.18	\$459.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$309.50	\$10.77	\$538.50
22	Jeans	XLarge	50	ea	\$7.55	\$377.50	\$9.18	\$459.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$309.50	\$10.77	\$538.50
23	Jeans	XXLarge	50	ea	\$7.55	\$377.50	\$9.18	\$459.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.19	\$309.50	\$10.77	\$538.50
24	Jeans	XXXLarge - 14XL	50	ea	\$7.55	\$377.50	\$9.72	\$486.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$7.20	\$360.00	\$11.77	\$588.50
25	Belts - Blue - Webbed	48"	200	ea	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$3.00	\$600.00	\$1.75	\$350.00

	ITEM	SIZES	EST Annual Usage	Unit of Measure	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE
26	Belts - Blue - Webbed	52"	200	ea	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$3.00	\$600.00	\$1.75	\$350.00
27	Belts - Blue - Webbed	62"	50	ea	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$3.00	\$150.00	\$2.25	\$112.50
28	Socks (Sample Required)	Sizes 10 - 15	300	doz	\$5.10	\$1,530.00	\$4.90	\$1,470.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$4.42	\$1,326.00	\$4.67	\$1,401.00
29	Shoes - Canvas	Sizes 6 - 15	500	pair	\$3.12	\$1,560.00	\$4.36	\$2,180.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.25	\$2,625.00	\$3.97	\$1,985.00
30	Shoes - Heavy Duty Canvas Step-ins (Sample Required)	Whole Sizes 5 - 16	1000	pair	\$4.27	\$4,270.00	\$5.18	\$5,180.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$7.58	\$7,580.00	\$4.64	\$4,640.00
31	Boots	Sizes 5-16	100	pair	\$13.95	\$1,395.00	\$13.72	\$1,372.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$26.48	\$2,648.00	\$12.24	\$1,224.00
32	Shirts / Inmate Uniform Shirts	Med - Large	100	cs	\$4.89	\$489.00	\$6.18	\$618.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$4.88	\$488.00	\$5.95	\$595.00
33	Shirts / Inmate Uniform Shirts	XLarge	100	cs	\$4.89	\$489.00	\$6.18	\$618.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$4.88	\$488.00	\$5.95	\$595.00
34	Shirts / Inmate Uniform Shirts	2XLarge	100	cs	\$5.35	\$535.00	\$6.18	\$618.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$4.88	\$488.00	\$6.45	\$645.00
35	Shirts / Inmate Uniform Shirts	3XLarge	50	cs	\$5.60	\$280.00	\$6.54	\$327.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.24	\$262.00	\$6.95	\$347.50
36	Shirts / Inmate Uniform Shirts	4XLarge	50	cs	\$5.90	\$295.00	\$6.72	\$336.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.46	\$273.00	\$7.35	\$367.50
37	Shirts / Inmate Uniform Shirts	5XLarge	20	cs	\$6.10	\$122.00	\$6.90	\$138.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.64	\$112.80	\$7.75	\$155.00
38	Shirts / Inmate Uniform Shirts	6XLarge	20	cs	\$6.20	\$124.00	\$6.90	\$138.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.84	\$116.80	\$8.25	\$165.00
39	Shirts - Poplin Work Shirts	Size Med	120	ea	\$6.33	\$759.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.94	\$712.80	\$9.75	\$1,170.00
40	Shirts - Poplin Work Shirts	Size Large	120	ea	\$6.67	\$800.40	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.94	\$712.80	\$9.75	\$1,170.00
41	Shirts - Poplin Work Shirts	Size XLarge	120	ea	\$7.00	\$840.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.94	\$712.80	\$9.75	\$1,170.00
42	Shirts - Poplin Work Shirts	Size 2XLarge	120	ea	\$7.33	\$879.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.94	\$712.80	\$11.25	\$1,350.00
43	Shirts - Poplin Work Shirts	Size 3XLarge	120	ea	\$7.33	\$879.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.10	\$732.00	\$12.25	\$1,470.00
44	Shirts - Poplin Work Shirts	Size 4XLarge	120	ea	\$7.33	\$879.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.15	\$738.00	\$13.25	\$1,590.00
45	Shirts - Poplin Work Shirts	Size 5XLarge	120	ea	\$7.33	\$879.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.25	\$750.00	\$14.25	\$1,710.00
46	Shirts - Poplin Work Shirts	6XLarge - 9XLarge	120	ea	\$7.67	\$920.40	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.85	\$822.00	\$15.25	\$1,830.00
47	Shirts - Poplin Work Shirts	10XLarge - 14XLarge	120	ea	\$7.67	\$920.40	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$7.96	\$955.20	\$20.25	\$2,430.00
48	Sweatshirt - Gray	Sizes Small - XXLarge	100	ea	\$5.35	\$535.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$9.17	\$917.00	\$5.24	\$524.00
49	Sweatshirt - Gray	Sizes 3XLarge - 6XLarge	50	ea	\$6.45	\$322.50	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$12.12	\$606.00	\$6.31	\$315.50
50	Sweatshirt - Gray	Sizes 8XLarge - 10XLarge	25	ea	\$9.65	\$241.25	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$20.64	\$516.00	\$9.97	\$249.25
51	Jackets (Outerwear) (Sample Required)	Med - 10XL	500	ea	\$19.25	\$9,625.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$27.48	\$13,740.00	\$22.25	\$11,125.00
52	Coat - Blue - 100% Cotton	Large - 2XLarge	200	ea	\$19.25	\$3,850.00	\$15.90	\$3,180.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$20.34	\$4,068.00	\$17.24	\$3,448.00
53	Coat - Blue - 100% Cotton 54-56	3XL	100	ea	\$19.25	\$1,925.00	\$16.90	\$1,690.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$21.36	\$2,136.00	\$17.97	\$1,797.00

	ITEM	SIZES	EST Annual Usage	Unit of Measure	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE
54	Coat - Blue - 100% Cotton 58-60	4XL	100	ea	\$19.25	\$1,925.00	\$17.90	\$1,790.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$22.40	\$2,240.00	\$17.97	\$1,797.00
55	Coat - Blue - 100% Cotton 66-68	Sizes 6XL - 8XL	50	ea	\$19.25	\$962.50	\$18.90	\$945.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$27.48	\$1,374.00	\$19.24	\$962.00
56	Toboggan/Cap - Watch, Orange (Jail) <i>(Sample Required)</i>	one size fits all	60	doz	\$13.80	\$828.00	\$12.90	\$774.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$13.43	\$805.80	\$14.24	\$854.40
57	Toboggan/Cap - Watch, Blue (Prison) <i>(Sample Required)</i>	one size fits all	60	doz	\$13.80	\$828.00	\$12.90	\$774.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$13.43	\$805.80	\$14.24	\$854.40
58	Inmate Cap - White with blue bill	Med, L, XL, 2XL	600	ea	\$6.75	\$4,050.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$8.00	\$4,800.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00
59	Jumpsuit - Orange SM - XL	SM - XL	120	ea	\$12.75	\$1,530.00	\$14.18	\$1,701.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$12.41	\$1,489.20	\$15.24	\$1,828.80
60	Jumpsuit - Orange 2XL	2XL	120	ea	\$14.75	\$1,770.00	\$14.18	\$1,701.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$12.71	\$1,525.20	\$16.24	\$1,948.80
61	Jumpsuit - Orange 3XL	3XL	120	ea	\$14.75	\$1,770.00	\$14.18	\$1,701.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$12.71	\$1,525.20	\$17.24	\$2,068.80
62	Jumpsuit - Orange 4XL	4XL	120	ea	\$14.75	\$1,770.00	\$14.72	\$1,766.40	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$12.71	\$1,525.20	\$17.24	\$2,068.80
63	Jumpsuit - Orange 5XL	5XL	120	ea	\$15.75	\$1,890.00	\$15.18	\$1,821.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$12.94	\$1,552.80	\$18.24	\$2,188.80
64	Jumpsuit - Orange 7XL	7XL	120	ea	\$15.75	\$1,890.00	\$15.90	\$1,908.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$13.22	\$1,586.40	\$19.24	\$2,308.80
65	T-Shirts - White	SM - XL	200	doz	\$22.94	\$4,588.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$27.51	\$5,502.00	\$29.24	\$5,848.00
66	T-Shirts - White	2XLarge	200	doz	\$22.94	\$4,588.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$30.13	\$6,026.00	\$35.97	\$7,194.00
67	T-Shirts - White	3XLarge	200	doz	\$22.94	\$4,588.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$32.75	\$6,550.00	\$35.97	\$7,194.00
68	T-Shirts - White	4XLarge	100	doz	\$22.94	\$2,294.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$35.73	\$3,573.00	\$37.97	\$3,797.00
69	T-Shirts - White	5XLarge	125	doz	\$22.94	\$2,867.50	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$22.58	\$2,822.50	\$39.97	\$4,996.25
70	Boxers - Mens	SM - XL	100	doz	\$12.97	\$1,297.00	\$12.90	\$1,290.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$12.78	\$1,278.00	\$12.24	\$1,224.00
71	Boxers - Mens	2XL-4XL	50	doz	\$13.97	\$698.50	\$13.90	\$695.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$15.07	\$753.50	\$13.24	\$662.00
72	Boxers - Mens	5XL-10XL	50	doz	\$13.97	\$698.50	\$16.54	\$827.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$19.33	\$966.50	\$15.44	\$772.00
73	Panty - Cotton - Women's Brief	Sizes 5 - 9	25	doz	\$6.60	\$165.00	\$7.54	\$188.50	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$8.01	\$200.25	\$6.97	\$174.25
74	Panty - Cotton - Women's Brief	Sizes 10 - 14	25	doz	\$8.16	\$204.00	\$8.90	\$222.50	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$11.15	\$278.75	\$8.04	\$201.00
75	Panty - Cotton - Women's Brief	Sizes 15 - 16	25	doz	\$9.00	\$225.00	\$9.90	\$247.50	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$12.78	\$319.50	\$8.04	\$201.00
76	Thermal Tops - White	Small - XLg	200	doz	\$30.29	\$6,058.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$35.52	\$7,104.00	\$30.41	\$6,082.00
77	Thermal Tops - White	2XLarge	200	doz	\$30.29	\$6,058.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$35.52	\$7,104.00	\$31.97	\$6,394.00
78	Thermal Tops - White	3XLarge	200	doz	\$30.29	\$6,058.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$35.52	\$7,104.00	\$33.24	\$6,648.00
79	Thermal Tops - White	4XLarge	100	doz	\$30.29	\$3,029.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$35.52	\$3,552.00	\$35.24	\$3,524.00

	ITEM	SIZES	EST Annual Usage	Unit of Measure	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE
80	Thermal Tops - White	5XLarge	125	doz	\$30.29	\$3,786.25	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$35.52	\$4,440.00	\$37.24	\$4,655.00
81	Thermal Pants - White	Small - XLg	100	doz	\$30.29	\$3,029.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$26.52	\$2,652.00	\$30.41	\$3,041.00
82	Thermal Pants - White	2XL	100	doz	\$30.29	\$3,029.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$26.52	\$2,652.00	\$31.97	\$3,197.00
83	Thermal Pants - White	3XL	100	doz	\$30.29	\$3,029.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$31.92	\$3,192.00	\$33.24	\$3,324.00
84	Thermal Pants - White	4XL	100	doz	\$30.29	\$3,029.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$41.52	\$4,152.00	\$35.24	\$3,524.00
85	Thermal Pants - White	5XL	100	doz	\$30.29	\$3,029.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$41.52	\$4,152.00	\$37.24	\$3,724.00
CATEGORY A: TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE INMATE CLOTHING						\$143,666.20		\$62,242.70		\$0.00		\$164,583.10		\$167,054.85
CATEGORY B: MATTRESSES & LINENS														
86	Mattress - Prison	26x72x4	1000	ea	\$36.60	\$36,600.00	\$59.90	\$59,900.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$67.00	\$67,000.00
87	Mattress - Jail	30x75x4	1000	ea	\$31.60	\$31,600.00	\$47.90	\$47,900.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$67.00	\$67,000.00
88	Mattress Cover	30x75x4	4000	ea	\$21.35	\$85,400.00	\$13.90	\$55,600.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$21.00	\$84,000.00
89	Blanket	66x90	1200	ea	\$5.20	\$6,240.00	\$5.36	\$6,432.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$5.45	\$6,540.00
90	Blanket - Thermal	66x90	100	ea	\$6.95	\$695.00	\$5.54	\$554.00	\$6.75	\$675.00	\$11.65	\$1,165.00	\$5.77	\$577.00
91	Blanket - Thermal	74"x108"	100	ea	\$13.00	\$1,300.00	\$15.54	\$1,554.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$21.86	\$2,186.00	\$12.21	\$1,221.00
92	Blankets - Cozy	66x90	100	cs	\$78.00	\$7,800.00	\$5.36	\$536.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$81.75	\$8,175.00
93	Blankets - Gray, 50% Wool	66x90	600	ea	\$13.17	\$7,902.00	\$5.54	\$3,324.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$6.95	\$4,170.00
94	Blankets - Orange	66x90	50	ea	\$7.60	\$380.00	\$6.54	\$327.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$12.00	\$600.00
95	Towels; Orange; 20"x40"	20x40	500	doz	\$17.95	\$8,975.00	\$18.18	\$9,090.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$13.19	\$6,595.00
96	Bath Towels; 22x44 (Sample Required)	22"x44"	500	doz	\$14.19	\$7,095.00	\$17.90	\$8,950.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$13.41	\$6,705.00
97	Wash Cloths; White; 12x12 (Sample Required)	12x12	525	doz	\$1.88	\$987.00	\$2.18	\$1,144.50	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$2.12	\$1,113.00
98	Wash Cloths; Orange; 12x12	12x12	20	cs	\$2.93	\$58.60	\$3.18	\$63.60	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$3.44	\$68.80
99	Sheet Flat - ORANGE T130	Twin	5	cs	\$34.92	\$174.60	\$35.18	\$175.90	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$38.77	\$193.85
100	Sheet Flat - Navy - 58x90	58x90	400	doz	\$34.92	\$13,968.00	\$35.18	\$14,072.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$36.51	\$14,604.00
101	Sheet Flat - White, 54x90	54"x90"	600	doz	\$25.92	\$15,552.00	\$26.54	\$15,924.00	\$28.00	\$16,800.00	\$38.89	\$23,334.00	\$25.77	\$15,462.00
102	Sheet Flat - White, 66x104	66"x104"	600	doz	\$38.92	\$23,352.00	\$35.18	\$21,108.00	\$33.00	\$19,800.00	\$46.77	\$28,062.00	\$29.77	\$17,862.00
CATEGORY B: TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE MATTRESSES & LINENS						\$248,079.20		\$246,655.00		\$37,275.00		\$54,747.00		\$301,886.65

ITEM	SIZES	EST Annual Usage	Unit of Measure	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	
CATEGORY C: INMATE PERSONAL CARE ITEMS														
103	Shower Shoes (Sample Required)	Sizes 6 - 15	500	pr	\$1.97	\$985.00	\$1.84	\$920.00	no bid	\$0.00	\$3.08	\$1,540.00	\$2.09	\$1,045.00
104	Comb - 5"	5"	10	cs	\$41.75	\$417.50	\$38.90	\$389.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
105	Razor (Sample Required)		100	cs	\$11.10	\$1,110.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
106	Hair Clippers Kit	10 pc set	100	ea	\$15.34	\$1,534.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
107	Shampoo (Sample Required)	.75 oz	100	cs	\$57.25	\$5,725.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
108	Shampoo (Sample Required)	.35 oz	25	cs	\$26.94	\$673.50	\$49.90	\$1,247.50	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
109	Soap	.50 oz	200	cs	\$32.50	\$6,500.00	\$44.90	\$8,980.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
110	Soap	1.25 oz	400	cs	\$40.50	\$16,200.00	\$49.90	\$19,960.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
111	Toothpaste (Sample Required)	.6 oz tube	150	cs	\$28.97	\$4,345.50	\$15.90	\$2,385.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
112	Toothpaste (Sample Required)	.6 oz tube	475	cs	\$28.97	\$13,760.75	\$15.90	\$7,552.50	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
113	Toothbrush (Sample Required)	144 per case	150	cs	\$4.60	\$690.00	\$9.90	\$1,485.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
114	Toothsponges - DentalSwab	4"	5	cs	\$48.25	\$241.25	\$108.90	\$544.50	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
115	Deodorant	1.5 oz	600	cs	\$26.88	\$16,128.00	\$33.90	\$20,340.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
116	Sanitary Napkins (Sample Required)	12 to 24	200	cs	\$24.77	\$4,954.00	\$27.90	\$5,580.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
117	Sanitary Napkins (Sample Required)	12 to 24	200	cs	\$24.48	\$4,896.00	\$24.90	\$4,980.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
118	Feminine Hygiene (Sample Required)	6 oz	800	cs	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
CATEGORY C: TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE INMATE PERSONAL CARE ITEMS						\$78,160.50		\$74,363.50		\$0.00		\$1,540.00		\$1,045.00
CATEGORY D: OTHER INMATE & FACILITY ITEMS														
119	Tumblers	12 oz	50	doz	\$5.40	\$270.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
120	Flex Coffee Mug	10 oz	250	doz	\$38.52	\$9,630.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
121	Plates	9"	100	doz	\$35.25	\$3,525.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
122	Spork		50	cs	\$10.50	\$525.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
123	Tray - Marathon		75	cs	\$101.00	\$7,575.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
124	Tray - Flex		100	cs	\$118.00	\$11,800.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
125	Laundry Truck		10	ea	\$341.50	\$3,415.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
126	Laundry Bag	24 x 36	100	doz	\$23.00	\$2,300.00	\$26.90	\$2,690.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
127	Lock - Existing Code		200	ea	\$6.68	\$1,336.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
128	Net Box	16x24x12	400	ea	\$9.95	\$3,980.00	\$10.90	\$4,360.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00
129	Cuff Tie - 24" long	24" Long	1000	pk	\$91.00	\$91,000.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	\$0.00

	ITEM	SIZES	EST Annual Usage	Unit of Measure	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE	Per Unit Price	EXTENDED PRICE
130	Handcuffs	14"	20	cs	\$220.30	\$4,406.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00
131	Armbands	1" x 10"	20	cs	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00
132	Armbands	1" x 12"	10	cs	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00
133	Suicide Spoon	2500 /case	10	cs	\$229.90	\$2,299.00	\$149.90	\$1,499.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00
134	Suicide Smock - JR/BLUE - Juvenile	Chest 38"-48"	20	ea	\$78.00	\$1,560.00	\$72.90	\$1,458.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$57.00	\$1,140.00
135	Suicide Smock - SM/BLUE - Standard	Chest 44"-56"	20	ea	\$78.00	\$1,560.00	\$74.90	\$1,498.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$57.00	\$1,140.00
136	Suicide Smock - XXL/BLUE - XXL	Chest 56"-72"	20	ea	\$100.00	\$2,000.00	\$118.90	\$2,378.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$75.00	\$1,500.00
137	Suicide Blanket - BL/GREEN	Size 54"x 80"	50	ea	\$75.00	\$3,750.00	\$64.90	\$3,245.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$57.00	\$2,850.00
138	Suicide Blanket - BL/BLUE	Size 54"x 80"	50	ea	\$75.00	\$3,750.00	\$69.90	\$3,495.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	\$57.00	\$2,850.00
139	Inmate Property Storage System	26# roll	24	ea	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00
140	Inmate Property Storage System		24	cs	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00
141	Inmate Property Storage System	18x28	30	cs	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00	<i>no bid</i>	\$0.00
CATEGORY D: TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE OTHER INMATE & FACILITY ITEMS						\$154,681.00		\$20,623.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$9,480.00
GRAND TOTAL ESTIMATED PRICE						\$624,586.90		\$403,884.20		\$37,275.00		\$220,870.10		\$479,466.50