

PAPER & PLASTIC PRODUCTS (Annual Contract)
RFB No. 21-0016

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Description	All American Poly (Piscataway, NJ)	Central Poly-Bag Corp (Linden, NJ)	Copaco, Inc (Columbus, GA)	Interboro Packaging (Montgomery, NY)	NuSpoon (Smyrna, GA)	Pyramid School Products (Tampa, FL)	Southeastern Paper Group (College Park, GA)	Staples (Atlanta, GA)	Tek POS Paper (Kennesaw, GA)	Unipack Corp (Brooklyn, NY)
Addendum No. 1	X	X	X	X		X	X	X		X
Samples of Products	X	X	X	X			X	X		
SECTION I: CUPS	no bid	no bid	8,386.00	no bid		no bid	8,336.25	10,304.00	10,841.03	no bid
SECTION II: PLATES / DINING UTENSILS	no bid	no bid	2,259.05	no bid		no bid	2,022.70	3,933.60	2,754.12	no bid
SECTION III: NAPKINS / TISSUE / TOWELS	no bid	145,445.50	78,539.50	no bid		3,899.00	116,217.00	141,809.50	197,179.45	no bid
SECTION IV: SOAPS / DISPENSERS	no bid	no bid	57,152.00	no bid		no bid	73,524.00	no bid	59,904.00	no bid
SECTION V: BAGS / TRASH CAN LINERS	39,369.00	57,065.25	61,826.50	49,868.00		67,204.75	73,053.50	79,528.00	164,106.80	51,990.00
Total Bid										

NOTES:

- "No Bid" Statement submitted by VERITIV

bid some items in Section V	bid some in Section III; bid all in Section V	bid all items in all Sections	bid all items in Section V	no documents submitted	bid some in Section III; bid all in Section V	bid all items in all Sections	bid all items in Section I, II, III and V	bid some items in Section IV; bid all items in Sections I, II, III, V	bid all items in Section V
-----------------------------	---	-------------------------------	----------------------------	------------------------	---	-------------------------------	---	---	----------------------------