

**AMMUNITION FOR PUBLIC SAFETY DEPARTMENTS
RFB NO. 20-0062**

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

BID SUBMISSION DOCUMENTS	Blackfox Tactical (Chapel Hill, TN)	Dana Safety Supply (Greensboro, NC)	Gulf States Distributors (Montgomery, AL)	Master Cartridge Inc (Villa Rica, GA)	Precision Delta Corp (Ruleville, MS)	RTP Armor LLC (Lincoln, NE)	Smyrna Police Distributors (Smyrna, GA)
Addendum 1 - Revised Pricing Pages	x	x	x		x	x	x
Communication Concerning This Solicitation (Form 1)	x	x	x	x	x	x	x
Bid Form (Form 2) and Revised Pricing Pages	not Revised pages	x	x	not Revised pages	not Brand Names	x	x
Contract Signature Page (Form 3)	x	x	x	x	x	x	x
Product Literature		x	x		x		
Warranty / Shelf Life	x	x	x	x	x		x
Sample Invoice	x	x	x	x	x		x
Business License		x	x	2019	x	x	x
W-9 Rev 2018 (Form 4)	x	x	x	2005	x	x	x

Item	Estimated Quantity	Unit Item	Unit Price	Blackfox Tactical	Unit Price	Dana Safety Southern Pub	Unit Price	Gulf States Distributors	Unit Price	Master Cartridge Inc	Unit Price	Precision Delta Corp	Unit Price	RTP Armor LLC	Unit Price	Smyrna Police Distributors	
<u>POLICE DEPARTMENT - Section I Ammunition</u>																	
1	12 GAUGE - Federal - 00 Buck Shot - Reduced Recoil, 9 pellet	25,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.4798	11,995.00	0.84	21,000.00	0.459	11,475.00	0.75	18,750.00	0	no bid
2	223 - Hornady - 55gr - TAP	15,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.61625	9,243.75	0	no bid	0.715	10,725.00	0.79	11,850.00	0.5995	8,992.50
3	5.56 - NATO - 55gr - Ball - Reloaded	75,000	RDS	0.31	23,250.00	0	no bid	0.33	24,750.00	0.39	29,250.00	0.315	23,625.00	0.35	26,250.00	0.28	21,000.00
4	38 SPL - Precision - 148gr - Hollow Base Wadcutter	25,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.26	6,500.00	0.273	6,825.00	0	no bid	0	no bid
5	9mm - Winchester - 147gr - Sub sonic FMJ	20,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.34	6,800.00	0.205	4,100.00	0.45	9,000.00	0	no bid
6	45 ACP - Federal - 230gr - Ball - Standard Velocity	10,000	RDS	0.27	2,700.00	0	no bid	0.279	2,790.00	0.32	3,200.00	0.245	2,450.00	0.35	3,500.00	0.295	2,950.00
7	308 - Hornady - 168gr - Match	2,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.9775	1,955.00	0.96	1,920.00	0.941	1,882.00	0	no bid	1.10	2,200.00
8	9mm - Federal - 124gr - Reload - FMJ	20,000	RDS	0.19	3,800.00	0	no bid	0.185	3,700.00	0.24	4,800.00	0.183	3,660.00	0.25	5,000.00	0.18	3,600.00
9	223 - Federal - 55BT - Gold Match Boat Tail, Hollow Point	3,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.738	2,214.00	0.49	1,470.00	0	no bid	0.99	2,970.00	0	no bid
10	9mm - Hornady- 135gr - Luger +P Flexlock Critical Duty	10,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.4125	4,125.00	0	no bid	0.425	4,250.00	0.82	8,200.00	0.3938	3,938.00
Total Section I				29,750.00	0	0	60,772.75	74,940.00	68,992.00	85,520.00	42,680.50						
<u>POLICE DEPARTMENT - Section II Less Lethal</u>																	
1	CTS 37mm CS Liquid Barricade Smokeless	10	ea	0	no bid	17.17	171.70	18.00	180.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid
2	CTS 37mm CS Powder Barricade Smokeless	10	ea	0	no bid	19.17	191.70	22.50	225.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid
3	CTS 37mm OC Liquid Barricade Smokeless	10	ea	0	no bid	17.45	174.50	20.50	205.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid
4	CTS Indoor OC Vapor Grenade	5	ea	0	no bid	33.89	169.45	40.00	200.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid
5	CTS CS Baffled Canister Grenade, Pyro Low Flame Potential	5	ea	0	no bid	33.34	166.70	39.00	195.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid
6	40 mm Rotary - OC Muzzle Blast Rounds	200	ea	0	no bid	20.28	4,056.00	24.00	4,800.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid
7	40 mm Rotary - Long Range CS	100	ea	0	no bid	16.39	1,639.00	21.00	2,100.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid
8	12 guage Defense Technology Corp Desc Drag Stabilized Bean Bag	100	ea	0	no bid	4.84	484.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid
Total Section II				0	7053.05	7,905.00	0	0	0	0	0						
Grand Total Police Dept (Sections I and II)				29,750.00	7,053.05	68,677.75	74,940.00	68,992.00	85,520.00	42,680.50							

Item		Estimated Quantity	Unit Item	Unit Price	Blackfox Tactical	Unit Price	Dana Safety Southern Pub	Unit Price	Gulf States Distributors	Unit Price	Master Cartridge Inc	Unit Price	Precision Delta Corp	Unit Price	RTP Armor LLC	Unit Price	Smyrna Police Distributors
<u>MARSHAL'S OFFICE - Section I Ammunition</u>																	
1	12 Gauge - Remington LE - 00 Buck, 8 Pellets - Reduced Recoil, PR12BK8-00	1,500	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.469	703.50	0	no bid	0.67	1,005.00
2	223 - Remington - 55gr - Remintong Premier Accutip (PRA223RD)	4,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.715	2,860.00	0.66	2,640.00	0.65	2,600.00
3	9mm - Federal Tactical - 147gr - HST HP (P9HST2), New, Bonded	3,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.289	867.00	0	no bid	0.425	1,275.00	0.49	1,470.00	0	no bid
4	.40 Caliber - Federal Tactical - 165gr - Tactical HP (LE40T3), Bonded	1,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.2907	290.70	0	no bid	0	no bid
Total Section I					-	0	867.00	0	5,129.20	4,110.00	3,605.00						
<u>MARSHAL'S OFFICE - Section II Practice Ammunition</u>																	
1	9mm - Federal - 147gr - JHP 850 FPR + P Ball	4,500	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.195	877.50	0.29	1,305.00	0.205	922.50	0	no bid	0	no bid
2	.40 Caliber -Federal - 165gr- JHP / Ball	500	RDS	0.32	160.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.37	185.00	0.215	107.50	0	no bid	0	no bid
3	.223 Caliber - Remington - 55gr - Ball L223R3BPLE	8,000	RDS	0.31	2,480.00	0	no bid	0.33	2,640.00	0.39	3,120.00	0.315	2,520.00	0.59	4,720.00	0.28	2,240.00
Total Section II					2,640.00	0	3,517.50	4,610.00	3,550.00	4,720.00	2,240.00						
Grand Total Marshal's Office (Sections I and II)					2,640.00	0	4,384.50	4,610.00	8,679.20	8,830.00	5,845.00						
<u>MUSCOGEE COUNTY PRISON - Practice Ammunition</u>																	
1	9 mill Automatic - Remington - 115gr - FMJ	67,000	RDS	0.19	12,730.00	0.2292	15,356.40	0.185	12,395.00	0.23	15,410.00	0.1795	12,026.50	0.24	16,080.00	0.18	12,060.00
2	223 / 556 Rifle - Remington - 65gr - FMJ	2,000	RDS	0.31	620.00	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.315	630.00	0	no bid	0.28	560.00
3	12 Gauge - Remington - 00 Buckshot - Reduced Recoil, 8 Pellet	2,000	RDS	0	no bid	0	no bid	0	no bid	0.84	1,680.00	0.469	938.00	0	no bid	0.67	1,340.00
Grand Total MC Prison					13,350.00	15,356.40	12,395.00	17,090.00	13,594.50	16,080.00	13,960.00						

