
BID TABULATION SHEET 
 

DATE:  March 25, 2020 

RFB NAME:  Tree Removal & Stump Grinding/Removal 
  Services (Annual Contract) (Re-Bid) 
RFB NO.  20-0051 
 

 
DESCRIPTION/VENDORS 

Elite Tree Service, Inc. 
(Columbus, GA) 

Atlanta Premier Tree 
Solutions 

(Cumming, GA) 

New Urban Forestry 
(Athens, GA) 

The M. Mitchell Group* 
(Carrollton, GA) 

Addenda (1)     

Insurance (Form 1)     

GSICA/E-Verify (Form 2)     
Communication Concerning This 
Solicitation (Form 3)     

List of Equipment     
Tree Removal Service Agreement 
(Form 4A)     
Stump Grinding Removal Agreement 
(Form 4B)  N/A   
Statement of Qualifications & Work 
Guarantee Form (Form 5A)     
Statement of Qualifications & Work 
Guarantee Form (Form 5B)  N/A   

Certifications & Proof of Experience     

Contract Signature Page (Form 6)     

Business License     

W-9 (Form 7)     
OPTION 1 – TREE REMOVAL SERVICES 

Diameter-Breast-Height Unit Prices for Tree Removal 

     6" - 11" 300.00 585.00 425.00 
     12" - 17" 500.00 875.00 650.00 
     18" - 23" 850.00 1,500.00 1,000.00 
     24" - 29" 1,300.00 1,900.00 1,600.00 
     30" - 35" 1,975.00 2,500.00 2,250.00 
     36" - 41" 2,675.00 3,100.00 3,000.00 
     42" - 47" 3,250.00 3,850.00 3,600.00 
     48" - 53" 3,800.00 4,500.00 4,300.00 
     54" - 60" 4,700.00 5,000.00 5,250.00 
OPTION 2 – STUMP GRINDING/REMOVAL SERVICES 

Diameter-Breast-Height Unit Prices for Stump Grinding/Removal 

     6" - 11" 150.00 No Bid 100.00 
     12" - 17" 200.00 No Bid 150.00 
     18" - 23" 225.00 No Bid 225.00 
     24" - 29" 300.00 No Bid 300.00 
     30" - 35" 350.00 No Bid 400.00 
     36" - 41" 400.00 No Bid 500.00 
     42" - 47" 500.00 No Bid 700.00 
     48" - 53" 550.00 No Bid 900.00 
     54" - 60" 650.00 No Bid 1,100.00 

  *Vendor submitted two (2) sets of pricing for Option 1 – Tree Removal Services.   

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or 
intent to award to a particular contractor.  Bid responses 
are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will 
provide an award recommendation for approval by 
Columbus Council.


