BID TABULATION
Transit Enhancements (Annual Contract)
RFB No. 20-0049

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an
award or intent to award to a particular
Bidder. Submittal copies are being forwarded
to the department representative, who will
provide an award recommendation for
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“E 'd? ﬂmn'gr Aprll 1’ 2020 approval by Columbus Council.
Innocom Transit, LLC Swartz Associates, Inc.
Description Qty. (Worthington, OH) (Naples, FL)
Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Steel Trash Receptacles 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Benches with Back 30 No Bid No Bid 734.00 22,020.00
Benches without Back 50 No Bid No Bid 468.00 23,400.00
Jumbo Horizontal Message Centers 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Single-Face Info Center 13 164.93 2,144.09 No Bid No Bid
Year One Total] 2,144.09 45,420.00
Steel Trash Receptacles 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Benches with Back 30 No Bid No Bid 770.00 23,100.00
Benches without Back 50 No Bid No Bid 492.00 24,600.00
Jumbo Horizontal Message Centers 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Single-Face Info Center 13 164.93 2,144.09 No Bid No Bid
Year Two Total] 2,144.09 47,700.00
Steel Trash Receptacles 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Benches with Back 30 No Bid No Bid 808.00 24,240.00
Benches without Back 50 No Bid No Bid 516.00 25,800.00
Jumbo Horizontal Message Centers 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Single-Face Info Center 13 168.22 2,186.86 No Bid No Bid
Year Three Totall 2,186.86 50,040.00

Innocom Transit, LLC: Need two weeks to make the product and 2-3 days for shipping/delivery.

Swartz Associates, Inc.: Must order a minimum quantity of 10 benches (either style) every time. Delivery in 14-30 days ARO.



