OIL & LUBRICANTS FOR PUBLIC WORKS

(ANNUAL CONTRACT)
RFB No. 20-0027

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular
contractor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide
an award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.
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Taylor Lubricants

Brewer-Hendley Oil

Cadence Petroleum

McPherson Oil

Boswell Oil Company

Description/Vendors Unit Quantity (Spartanburg, SC) (Lithonia, GA) (Norcross, GA) (Trussville, AL) (Athens, GA)
Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Hydraulic Fluid (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 7,200 Gallons $3.99 $28,728.00 $4.30 $30,960.00 $4.79 $34,488.00 $4.75 $34,200.00 $4.63 $33,336.00
Per 55 Gal Drum
Hydraulic Fluid (Pinegrove Way) (using Gal univcos) | 300 Gallons $4.55 $1,365.00 $4.80 $1,440.00 $5.44 $1,632.00 $5.25 $1,575.00 $5.13 $1,539.00
15W40 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $5.60 $22,400.00 $5.77 $23,080.00 $5.40 $21,600.00 $6.35 $25,400.00 $6.29 $25,160.00
Per 55 Gal Drum

15W40 Oil (Pinegrove Way) (using Gal unitcost) | 450 Gallons $6.10 $2,745.00 $6.25 $2,812.50 $6.05 $2,722.50 $6.85 $3,082.50 $6.79 $3,055.50
5W20 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 2,000 Gallons $4.69 $9,380.00 $4.63 $9,260.00 $4.37 $8,740.00 $5.10 $10,200.00 $5.06 $10,120.00
Automatic Transmission Fluid

(Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $7.50 $7,500.00 $4.85 $4,850.00 $7.30 $7,300.00 $6.26 $6,260.00 $8.05 $8,050.00
10W30 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $4.69 $4,690.00 $4.63 $4,630.00 $4.55 $4,550.00 $5.50 $5,500.00 $5.06 $5,060.00
Grease (Multi-Purpose)

(Cusseta Road) Per Pound 400 Pounds $1.68 $672.00 $2.07 $828.00 $1.57 $628.00 $1.67 $668.00 $1.71 $684.00
Grease (Multi-Purpose)

(Pinegrove Way) Per Pound 120 Pounds $2.08 $249.60 $2.07 $248.40 $1.57 $188.40 $1.67 $200.40 $1.71 $205.20
Anti-Freeze (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 250 Gallons $5.90 $1,475.00 $7.40 $1,850.00 $5.18 $1,295.00 $6.26 $1,565.00 $9.88 $2,470.00
|30W90 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 110 Gallons $7.44 $818.40 $8.05 $885.50 $7.50 $825.00 $8.20 $902.00 $9.99 $1,098.90
|30W90 Oil (Pinegrove Way) Per Gallon 110 Gallons $7.44 $818.40 $8.05 $885.50 $7.50 $825.00 $8.20 $902.00 $9.99 $1,098.90
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 3,400 Gallons $1.39 $4,726.00 $1.29 $4,386.00 $1.25 $4,250.00 $1.22 $4,148.00 $1.15 $3,910.00
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (Pinegrove Way) Per Gallon 3,400 Gallons $1.39 $4,726.00 $1.29 $4,386.00 $1.25 $4,250.00 $1.22 $4,148.00 $1.15 $3,910.00

GRAND TOTAL COST $90,293.40 $90,501.90 $93,293.90 $98,750.90 $99,697.50
Bulk Tank, Drums, & Truck Bulk Tank, Drums, & Truck D & Truck w/P Bulk Tank, Drums, & Truck
Method Of De|lvel'y W/Pump W/Pump rums ruck w7Fump W/Pump
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OIL & LUBRICANTS FOR PUBLIC WORKS

(ANNUAL CONTRACT)
RFB No. 20-0027

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular
contractor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide
an award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Y E AR O N E A N D Y E AR T W O
Safety Kleen Fletcher Oil Co. &C EEEZI::;?IE;gC Northeast Lubricants Sprague's Supply, Inc.
Description/Vendors Unit Quantity (Morrow, GA) (Columbus, GA) (Kgnn’;saw Py (Doraville, GA) (Columbus, GA)
Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Hydraulic Fluid (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 7,200 Gallons $4.42 $31,824.00 $4.95 $35,640.00 $5.35 $38,520.00 $5.84 $42,048.00 $5.28 $38,016.00
Per 55 Gal Drum
Hydraulic Fluid (Pinegrove Way) (using Gal unitcost) | 300 Gallons $6.36 $1,908.00 $5.31 $1,593.00 $5.98 $1,794.00 $6.84 $2,052.00 $5.54 $1,662.00
15W40 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $6.25 $25,000.00 $6.95 $27,800.00 $5.95 $23,800.00 $6.66 $26,640.00 $7.77 $31,080.00
Per 55 Gal Drum
15W40 Oil (Pinegrove Way) (using Gal unitcost) | 450 Gallons $8.18 $3,681.00 $7.29 $3,280.50 $6.60 $2,970.00 $7.66 $3,447.00 $8.06 $3,627.00
5W20 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 2,000 Gallons $5.24 $10,480.00 $6.25 $12,500.00 $4.95 $9,900.00 $5.29 $10,580.00 $5.61 $11,220.00
Automatic Transmission Fluid
(Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $8.50 $8,500.00 $5.95 $5,950.00 $7.95 $7,950.00 $9.00 $9,000.00 $12.50 $12,500.00
10W30 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $7.39 $7,390.00 $6.25 $6,250.00 $5.35 $5,350.00 $5.84 $5,840.00 $5.61 $5,610.00
Grease (Multi-Purpose)
(Cusseta Road) Per Pound 400 Pounds $2.29 $916.00 $2.86 $1,144.00 $2.25 $900.00 $3.12 $1,248.00 $1.78 $712.00
Grease (Multi-Purpose)
(Pinegrove Way) Per Pound 120 Pounds $2.29 $274.80 $2.86 $343.20 $2.25 $270.00 $3.12 $374.40 $1.78 $213.60
Anti-Freeze (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 250 Gallons $9.30 $2,325.00 $9.95 $2,487.50 $5.95 $1,487.50 $5.46 $1,365.00 $6.17 $1,542.50
|30W90 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 110 Gallons $11.97 $1,316.70 $10.50 $1,155.00 $7.75 $852.50 $10.15 $1,116.50 $9.61 $1,057.10
|30W90 Oil (Pinegrove Way) Per Gallon 110 Gallons $11.97 $1,316.70 $10.50 $1,155.00 $7.75 $852.50 $10.15 $1,116.50 $9.61 $1,057.10
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 3,400 Gallons $1.60 $5,440.00 $1.20 $4,080.00 $1.95 $6,630.00 $1.35 $4,590.00 $1.67 $5,678.00
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (Pinegrove Way) Per Gallon 3,400 Gallons $1.60 $5,440.00 $1.20 $4,080.00 $1.95 $6,630.00 $1.35 $4,590.00 $1.67 $5,678.00
GRAND TOTAL COST $105,812.20 $107,458.20 $107,906.50 $114,007.40 $119,653.30
Bulk Tank & D Bulk Tank, Drums, & Truck Bulk Tank, Drums, & Truck Bulk Tank, Drums, & Truck Bulk Tank, Drums, & Truck
Method of Delivery urkeran rums w/Pump w/Pump w/Pump w/Pump
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OIL & LUBRICANTS FOR PUBLIC WORKS

(ANNUAL CONTRACT)
RFB No. 20-0027

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular
contractor. Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide
an award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Y E AR O N E A ND Y E AR T W O
Whatley Oil Company Rush Truck Center of Columbus Lubrication Engineers, Inc. Rossee Oil Company, Inc.*
Description/Vendors Unit Quantity (Columbus, GA) (Columbus, GA) (Wichita, KS) (Eatonton, GA)
Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost | Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Hydraulic Fluid (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 7,200 Gallons $6.55 $47,160.00 $10.00 $72,000.00 $26.95 $194,040.00
Per 55 Gal Drum
Hydraulic Fluid (Pinegrove Way) (using Gal uniticost) 300 Gallons $7.10 $2,130.00 $9.20 $2,760.00 $26.95 $8,085.00
15W40 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 4,000 Gallons $8.96 $35,840.00 $10.99 $43,960.00 $12.76 $51,040.00
Per 55 Gal Drum

15W40 Oil (Pinegrove Way) (using Gal uniticost) 450 Gallons $9.51 $4,279.50 $13.72 $6,174.00 $12.76 $5,742.00

5W20 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 2,000 Gallons $6.19 $12,380.00 $13.28 $26,560.00 $30.71 $61,420.00

Automatic Transmission Fluid

(Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $9.35 $9,350.00 $26.16 $26,160.00 $29.54 $29,540.00

10W30 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 1,000 Gallons $6.29 $6,290.00 $13.08 $13,080.00 No Bid

REJECTED

Grease (Multi-Purpose)

(Cusseta Road) Per Pound 400 Pounds $2.23 $892.00 $2.50 $1,000.00 $7.05 $2,820.00

Grease (Multi-Purpose)

(Pinegrove Way) Per Pound 120 Pounds $2.23 $267.60 $2.50 $300.00 $7.05 $846.00

Anti-Freeze (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 250 Gallons $9.89 $2,472.50 $9.27 $2,317.50 No Bid
|80W90 Oil (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 110 Gallons $10.00 $1,100.00 $9.12 $1,003.20 $38.78 $4,265.80
|80W90 Oil (Pinegrove Way) Per Gallon 110 Gallons $10.00 $1,100.00 $9.12 $1,003.20 $38.78 $4,265.80

Diesel Exhaust Fluid (Cusseta Road) Per Gallon 3,400 Gallons $1.35 $4,590.00 $2.09 $7,106.00 No Bid

Diesel Exhaust Fluid (Pinegrove Way) Per Gallon 3,400 Gallons $1.35 $4,590.00 $2.09 $7,106.00 No Bid

GRAND TOTAL COST $132,441.60 $210,529.90 $362,064.60
Bulk Tank, Drums, & Truck "
Method of Delivery w/Pump Drums & Truck w/Pump

*Rossee Oil rejected due to General Provisions, 19. Disqualification of Bidders and Rejection of Bids: Item (B) Any irregularities contrary to the General Provisions or bid specifications.
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