OIL & LUBRICANTS FOR METRA

(ANNUAL CONTRACT)
RFB No. 20-0026

McPherson Oil Rush Truck Center of Columbus Five Point Service Taylor Enterprises Fletcher Oil
Description/Vendors Unit Quantity (Trussville, AL) (Columbus, GA) (Ft. Valley, GA) (Spartanburg, SC) (Columbus, GA)
Unit Cost | Total Cost Unit Cost | Total Cost Unit Cost | Total Cost Unit Cost | Total Cost Unit Cost | Total Cost
Y E AR O N E

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil | Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $1.10 $1,100.00 $2.38 $2,380.00 $7.25 $7,250.00 $7.70 $7,700.00 $10.75 $10,750.00
Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $6.76 $6,760.00 $5.00 $5,000.00 $6.00 $6,000.00 $3.65 $3,650.00 $6.25 $6,250.00
Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $10.95 $10,950.00 $6.81 $6,810.00 $6.50 $6,500.00 $4.30 $4,300.00 §7.15 $7,150.00
15W40 Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $6.26 $25,040.00 NO BID $7.75 $31,000.00 $5.65 $22,600.00 $6.95 $27,800.00
Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $15.88 $63,520.00 $25.44 $101,760.00 $40.00 $160,000.00 $20.50 $82,000.00 $21.47 $85,880.00
Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon | 3,300 Gallons $1.80 $5,940.00 $1.79 $5,907.00 $1.25 $4,125.00 $1.19 $3,927.00 $1.32 $4,356.00
Chassis Grease: 76 Megaplex XD3 | Per Pound | 1,000 Pounds $3.19 $3,190.00 $2.51 $2,510.00 $4.00 $4,000.00 $2.25 $2,250.00 $3.45 $3,450.00
SAE 5W20 Per Gallon | 2,000 Gallons $7.28 $14,560.00 WITHDRAWN $8.00 $16,000.00 $4.95 $9,900.00 $6.25 $12,500.00

GRAND TOTAL COST $131,060.00 $124,367.00 $234,875.00 $136,327.00 $158,136.00

Y E AR T W O

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $1.15 $1,150.00 $2.38 $2,380.00 $7.25 $7,250.00 $7.90 $7,900.00 $11.30 $1 1,300.00
Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $11.25 $1 1,250.00 $5.00 $5,000.00 $6.00 $6,000.00 $3.75 $3,750.00 $6.75 $6,750.00
Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons §7.06 $7,060.00 $6.81 $6,810.00 $6.50 $6,500.00 $4.42 $4,420.00 §7.35 $7,350.00
15W40 Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $6.56 $26,240.00 NO BID $7.75 $31,000.00 $5.80 $23,200.00 $7.45 $29,800.00
Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $16.38 $65,520.00 $25.44 $101,760.00 $40.00 $160,000.00 $21.00 $84,000.00 $21.97 $87,880.00
Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon | 3,300 Gallons $1.80 $5,940.00 $1.79 $5,907.00 $1.25 $4,125.00 $1.22 $4,026.00 $1.82 $6,006.00
Chassis Grease: 76 Megaplex XD3 Per Pound | 1,000 Pounds $3.24 $3,240.00 $2.51 $2,5 10.00 $4.00 $4,000.00 $2.30 $2,300.00 $3.95 $3,950.00
SAE 5W20 Per Gallon | 2,000 Gallons $7.58 $15,160.00 WITHDRAWN $8.00 $16,000.00 $5.10 $10,200.00 $6.75 $13,500.00

GRAND TOTAL COST $135,560.00 $124,367.00 $234,875.00 $139,796.00 $166,536.00

Y E AR T HRE E

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil | Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $1.19 $1,190.00 $2.38 $2,380.00 $8.34 $8,340.00 $8.10 $8,100.00 $11.80 $11,800.00
Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $11.55 $11,550.00 $5.00 $5,000.00 $6.90 $6,900.00 $3.85 $3,850.00 §7.25 $7,250.00
Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $7.36 $7,360.00 $6.81 $6,810.00 $7.48 $7,480.00 $4.55 $4,550.00 $7.88 $7,880.00
15W40 Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $6.86 $27,440.00 NO BID $8.91 $35,640.00 $5.97 $23,880.00 $7.95 $31,800.00
Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $16.88 $67,520.00 $25.44 $101,760.00 $46.00 $184,000.00 $21.50 $86,000.00 $22.47 $89,880.00
Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon | 3,300 Gallons $1.80 $5,940.00 $1.79 $5,907.00 $1.44 $4,752.00 $1.25 $4,125.00 $2.32 $7,656.00
Chassis Grease: 76 Megaplex XD3 | Per Pound | 1,000 Pounds $3.28 $3,280.00 $2.51 $2,510.00 $4.60 $4,600.00 $2.35 $2,350.00 $4.45 $4,450.00
SAE 5W20 Per Gallon | 2,000 Gallons $7.88 $15,760.00 WITHDRAWN $9.20 $18,400.00 $5.25 $10,500.00 §7.25 $14,500.00

GRAND TOTAL COST $140,040.00 $124,367.00 $270,112.00 $143,355.00 $175,216.00




OIL & LUBRICANTS FOR METRA (continued)
(ANNUAL CONTRACT)
RFB No. 20-0026

Lubrication Engineers, Inc. CTEEZ Trucking & Equipment, LLC North American Lubricants Boswell Oil Company Whatley Oil & Auto Parts Co., Inc.

Description /Vendors Unit Quantity (Wichita, KS) (Kennesaw, GA) (Snellville, GA) (Athens, GA) (Columbus, GA)

Unit Cost | Total Cost Unit Cost | Total Cost Unit Cost | Total Cost Unit Cost | Total Cost Unit Cost | Total Cost
Y E AR O N E

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil | Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $42.11 | $42,110.00 NO BID $10.39 $10,390.00 $9.41 $9,410.00 INELIGIBLE
Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons NO BID NO BID $6.02 $6,020.00 $5.69 $5,690.00 $7.59 $7,590.00
Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons NO BID NO BID $8.97 $8.970.00 $6.87 $6,870.00 $7.99 $7,990.00
15W40 Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $21.76 $87,040.00 NO BID $6.41 $25,640.00 $6.99 $27,960.00 $8.65 $34,600.00
Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $32.08 $128,320.00 NO BID $13.50 $54,000.00 $18.59 $74,360.00 $21.76 $87,040.00
Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon | 3,300 Gallons NO BID $1.75 | $5,775.00 $3.31 $10,923.00 $1.15 $3,795.00 $1.39 $4,587.00
Chassis Grease: 76 Megaplex XD3 | Per Pound | 1,000 Pounds $7.24 $7,240.00 NO BID $3.67 $3,670.00 $2.66 $2,660.00 2.925 $2,925.00
SAE 5W20 Per Gallon | 2,000 Gallons $33.35 $66,700.00 NO BID $6.93 $13,860.00 $5.74 $11,480.00 $7.32 $14,640.00

GRAND TOTAL COST $331,410.00 $5,775.00 $133,473.00 $142,225.00 $159,372.00

Y E AR T W O

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil | Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $42.11 | $42,110.00 NO BID $10.59 $10,590.00 $9.91 $9,910.00 INELIGIBLE
Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons NO BID NO BID $6.22 $6,220.00 $6.19 $6,190.00 7.72 $7,720.00
Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons NO BID NO BID $8.97 $8,970.00 $7.37 $7,370.00 8.12 $8,120.00
15W40 Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $21.76 $87,040.00 NO BID $6.61 $26,440.00 $7.49 $29,960.00 8.78 $35,120.00
Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $32.08 $128,320.00 NO BID $13.70 $54,800.00 $19.09 $76,360.00 21.89 $87,560.00
Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon | 3,300 Gallons NO BID $1.85 | $6,105.00 $3.40 $11,220.00 $1.65 $5,445.00 1.40 $4,620.00
Chassis Grease: 76 Megaplex XD3 | Per Pound | 1,000 Pounds $7.24 $7,240.00 NO BID $3.75 $3,750.00 $2.71 $2,710.00 2.953 $2,953.00
SAE 5W20 Per Gallon | 2,000 Gallons $33.35 $66,700.00 NO BID $6.93 $13,860.00 $6.24 $12,480.00 7.45 $14,900.00

GRAND TOTAL COST $331,410.00 $6,105.00 $135,850.00 $150,425.00 $160,993.00

Y E AR T HRE E

High Performance 80-90 Gear Oil | Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons $42.11 | $42,110.00 NO BID $10.69 $10,690.00 $10.41 $10,410.00 INELIGIBLE
Anti-Freeze - Green Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons NO BID NO BID $6.42 $6,420.00 $6.69 $6,690.00 $7.85 $7,850.00
Anti-Freeze - Red Per Gallon | 1,000 Gallons NO BID NO BID $8.97 $8.970.00 $7.87 $7,870.00 $8.25 $8.250.00
15W40 Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $21.76 $87,040.00 NO BID $6.71 $26,840.00 $7.99 $31,960.00 $8.91 $35,640.00
Triton Heavy Duty ATF Per Gallon | 4,000 Gallons $32.08 $128,320.00 NO BID $13.80 $55,200.00 $19.59 $78,360.00 $22.02 $88,080.00
Defendal Diesel Exhaust Fluid Per Gallon | 3,300 Gallons NO BID $1.95 | $6,435.00 $3.50 $11,550.00 $2.15 $7,095.00 $1.41 $4,653.00
Chassis Grease: 76 Megaplex XD3 | Per Pound | 1,000 Pounds $7.24 $7.,240.00 NO BID $3.85 $3,850.00 $2.76 $2,760.00 2.981 $2,981.00
SAE 5W20 Per Gallon | 2,000 Gallons $33.35 $66,700.00 NO BID $7.03 $14,060.00 $6.74 $13,480.00 $7.58 $15,160.00

GRAND TOTAL COST $331,410.00 $6,435.00 $137,580.00 $158,625.00 $162,614.00




