Alternators & Starters for Metra (Re-Bld) This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or
(Annual Contract)

RFB No. 20-0025

intent to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses
are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will
provide an award recommendation for approval by
Columbus Council.

YEAR ONE
Description/Vendors AA?SS&?;&?E?;’ e Romaine 52:: isvio)rpomﬁon
Part Number Vendor # Unit Cost g?;: Vendor # Unit Cost | Core Cost
1113168 STARTER 24V $148.50 | $50.00 | 1113108 | $289.00 | $100.00
1113276 STARTER, TROLLEY $160.00 | $70.00 | 6583N | $111.83 $0.00
3165 STARTER, FORD TRUCK $45.00 | $12.00 | 3165N $94.45 $0.00
2002834 AC FAN MOTOR $190.00 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
97-4250-00001 BLOWER MOTOR $185.00 | $100.00 | noBID $0.00 $0.00
97-4250-1 MIOTOR EVAPORATOR $220.00 | $50.00 | wNoBID $0.00 $0.00
104343 MOTOR EVAPORATOR $340.00 | $100.00 | noBID $0.00 $0.00
TKC 104-343 MOTOR BLOWER EVAPORATOR A/C $340.00 $100.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
104467 MOTOR CONDENSER ORION $241.75 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
36-8358
1117705 GENERATOR 24V Gear unit
$899.00 | $100.00 | notbert | $1,250.00 |  $0.00

order?

Delivery will be made within 48 hours after receipt of

Yes Yes

sheet at a plus or minus percent.

Items listed on the pricing page will be priced at jobber

- 5%




YEAR TWO

AAMCO of Columbus

Romaine Electric Corporation

Description/Vendors (Columbus, GA) (Kent, WA)
Part Number Vendor # Unit Cost (é?;f Vendor # Unit Cost Core Cost
1113168 STARTER 24V $148.50 | $50.00 | 1113108 | $289.00 | $100.00
1113276 STARTER, TROLLEY $160.00 | $7000 | 6583N | $111.83 $0.00
3165 STARTER, FORD TRUCK $45.00 | $12.00 | 3165N $94.45 $0.00
2002834 AIC FAN MOTOR $190.00 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
97-4250-00001 BLOWER MOTOR $185.00 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
97-4250-1 MOTOR EVAPORATOR $220.00 | $50.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
104343 MOTOR EVAPORATOR $340.00 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
TKC 104-343 MOTOR BLOWER EVAPORATOR A/C $34000 $100.00 NO BID $000 $0.00
104467 MOTOR CONDENSER ORION $241.75 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
36-8358

1117705 GENERATOR 24V Gear unit

$899.00 | $100.00 | notbelt | $1.250.00 |  $0.00
Delivery will be made within 48 hours after receipt of
order? Yes Yes
Items listed on the pricing page will be priced at jobber
sheet at a plus or minus percent. _ 5%,




YEAR THREE

AAMCO of Columbus

Romaine Electric Corporation

Description/Vendors (Columbus, GA) (Kent, WA)
Part Number Vendor # Unit Cost (é?;f Vendor # Unit Cost Core Cost
1113168 STARTER 24V $148.50 | $50.00 | 1113108 | $289.00 | $100.00
1113276 STARTER, TROLLEY $160.00 | $70.00 6583N $115.83 $0.00
3165 STARTER, FORD TRUCK $45.00 $12.00 3165N $96.45 $0.00
2002834 AIC FAN MOTOR $190.00 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
97-4250-00001 BLOWER MOTOR $185.00 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
97-4250-1 MOTOR EVAPORATOR $220.00 | $50.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
104343 MOTOR EVAPORATOR $340.00 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
TKC 104-343 MOTOR BLOWER EVAPORATOR A/C $340'00 $100.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
104467 MOTOR CONDENSER ORION $241.75 | $100.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00
36-8358

1117705 GENERATOR 24V Gear unit

$899.00 | $100.00 | notbelt | $1.250.00 | $0.00
Delivery will be made within 48 hours after receipt of
order? Yes Yes
Items listed on the pricing page will be priced at jobber
sheet at a plus or minus percent. _ 5%,




