
      

  
  
  

CATERPILLAR
25903

CASE
TV370

JOHN DEERE 325G 
COMPACT TRACKED 

LOADER

$65,124.00 $74,633.12 $61,376.00





SURETRAC
#ST8216TAT-B-100

$4,030.00

$8,060.00





SURETRAC
#ST8216TAT-B-100

$4,630.00

$9,260.00

Product Literature

Manufacturer/Model

Warranty Information
Det. Spec. Resp. Pages (Form 4A)

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE [2 UNITS]

Product Literature






2020 BIG TEX

70 PI-X-16

$2,950.00

$5,900.00

2020 BIG TEX
70 LR-16

Det. Spec. Resp. Pages (Form 5A)



Warranty Information 

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
RFB No. 20-0022; Miscellaneous Equipment

January 15, 2020

Moridge
Manufacturing Inc.
(Moundridge, KS)

Mercaterra
Atlantic LLC

(Round Rock, TX)

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

Manufacturer/Model

Warranty Information
Product Literature

Vendors

Manufacturer/Model

Filnt Construction 
& Forestry

(Columbus, GA)

Chattahoochee 
Trailer, LLC

(Columbus, GA)

$4,670.00

Trax & Trailers
(Perry, GA)

OPTION 3: DUAL AXLE UTILITY TRAILERS WITH TOOL CARRYING CAGE


Yancey Bros.
(Fortson, GA)

OPTION 1: COMPACT TRACKED SKID STEER LOADER W/ATTACHMENTS

OPTION 2: DUAL AXLE UTILITY TRAILERS

 Communication Concerning Page 

Tidewater
(Smithville, GA)

Wastebuilt 
Environmental 

Solutions
(Austell, GA)

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Det. Spec. Resp. Pages (Form 3A)

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL PRICE [2 UNITS] $9,340.00

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular 
contractor.  Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an 
award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.







GRASSHOPPER
735BT/3661PF

$17,796.75

$35,593.50

 
 
 

K&M 
INTERNATIONAL
ASD-8000TEDD

SPAULDING 4-TON
ROAD SAVER

$48,990.00 $39,485.00

Warranty Information

Det. Spec. Resp. Pages (Form 8A)

Manufacturer/Model

UNIT PRICE

Warranty Information

UNIT PRICE

Det. Spec. Resp. Pages (Form 7A)

Manufacturer/Model

OPTION 5: FORKLIFT

Det. Spec. Resp. Pages (Form 6A)

OPTION 4: ZERO-TURN MOWERS WITH METAL COLLECTION UNIT
Product Literature

NO BIDManufacturer/Model

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE [2 UNITS]

NO BIDNO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

OPTION 6: ASPHALT HOTBOX WITH INFRARED RECYCLER
Product Literature

Product Literature
Warranty Information

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID


