
Description/Vendor AAMCO of Columbus
(Columbus, GA)

Jasper Engines & Transmissions
(Jasper, IN)

A. FIELD SERVICE
TRANSMISSION

1. 4R70W Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
2. 4R75EW Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
3. 5R110W Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
4. 5R55W Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
5. 5R55S Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
6. Torque Shift Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
7. A618 Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
8. 42RE Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
9. 48RE Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
10. 5-45FE Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
11. A606 Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00

I. TRANSMISSION REPAIR

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Transmissions and Transmission Services for Public Works (Annual Contract)

RFB No. 20-0011
October 9, 2019

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to award to a particular contractor.  Bid responses are being forwarded 
to the Project Manager, who will provide an award recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Initial Period - 3 Year Cost
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NO BID
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NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



Description/Vendor AAMCO of Columbus
(Columbus, GA)

Jasper Engines & Transmissions
(Jasper, IN)

A. FIELD SERVICE (cont.)
TRANSMISSION

12. 4L80E Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
13. 4T60E Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00
14. 4T65E Transmission
Labor Charge (Per Hour) $99.00
Mileage Rate (Per Mile) $3.00
Labor Charge (Driver) $12.00

COMPLY: YES / NO COMPLY: YES / NO
1. 4R70W Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $720.00
2. 4R75E Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $720.00
3. 5R110W Transmission Yes / $600.00 Yes / $1,500.00
4. 5R55W Transmission Yes / $500.00 Yes / $600.00
5. 5R55S Transmission Yes / $500.00 Yes / $600.00
6. Torque Shift Transmission Yes / $600.00 Yes / $2,000.00
7. A618 Transmission Yes / $600.00 Yes / $600.00
8. 42RE Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $480.00
9. 48RE Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $2,000.00
10. 5-45RFE Transmission Yes / $400.00 Yes / $500.00
11. A606 Transmission Yes / $500.00 Yes / NO BID
12. 4L60E Transmission Yes / $500.00 Yes / $400.00
13. 4L80E Transmission Yes / $600.00 Yes / $800.00
14. 4T65E Transmission Yes / $550.00 Yes / $1,200.00

*Core charge only applied if
transmission is damaged

beyond repair.

B. EXCHANGE PRICES
1. 4R70W Transmission $2,000.00 $2,133.00
2. 4R75E Transmission $2,000.00 $2,133.00
3. 5R110W Transmission $2,500.00 $3,224.00
4. 5R55W Transmission $2,300.00 $2,452.00
5. 5R55S Transmission $2,300.00 $2,452.00
6. Torque Shift Transmission $2,400.00 $3,863.00
7. A618 Transmission $2,500.00 $2,612.00
8. 42RE Transmission $2,000.00 $1,790.00
9. 48RE Transmission $2,000.00 $2,943.00
10. 5-45RFE Transmission $2,000.00 $2,505.00
11. A606 Transmission $2,100.00 NO BID
12. 4L60E Transmission $2,200.00 $1,915.00
13. 4L80E Transmission $2,500.00 $2,454.00
14. 4T65E Transmission $2,350.00 $3,434.00

C. LABOR CHARGES

1. 4R70W Transmission $99.00 / 8.9 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
2. 4R75E Transmission $99.00 / 8.9 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
3. 5R110W Transmission $99.00 / 8.7 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
4. 5R55W Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID

II. TRANSMISSION PRICING

I. TRANSMISSION REPAIR

Initial Period - 3 Year Cost

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Initial 3 Year Contract Period - Cost Per Unit

Initial 3 Year Contract Period - Cost Per Unit
Flat Rate Hour / Rebuild Time / Valve Body & Governor Test / Dyno Test



Description/Vendor AAMCO of Columbus
(Columbus, GA)

Jasper Engines & Transmissions
(Jasper, IN)

C. LABOR CHARGES (cont.)

5. 5R55S Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
6. Torque Shift Transmission $99.00 / 7.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
7. A618 Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
8. 42RE Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
9. 48RE Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
10. 5-45RFE Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
11. A606 Transmission $99.00 / 9.0 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
12. 4L60E Transmission $99.00 / 8.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
13. 4L80E Transmission $99.00 / 10.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID
14. 4T65E Transmission $99.00 / 10.5 hrs. / $120.00 / NA $85.00 / NO BID

20% NO BID
E. WARRANTY
1. 4R70W Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
2. 4R75E Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
3. 5R110W Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
4. 5R55W Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
5. 5R55S Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
6. Torque Shift Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
7. A618 Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
8. 42RE Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
9. 48RE Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
10. 5-45RFE Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
11. A606 Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
12. 4L60E Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
13. 4L80E Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months
14. 4T65E Transmission Yes / Twelve (12) Months

1. 4R70W Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
2. 4R75E Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
3. 5R110W Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
4. 5R55W Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
5. 5R55S Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
6. Torque Shift Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
7. A618 Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
8. 42RE Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
9. 48RE Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
10. 5-45RFE Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
11. A606 Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
12. 4L60E Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
13. 4L80E Transmission 10 Units 10 Units
14. 4T65E Transmission 10 Units 10 Units

D. PARTS

Initial 3 Year Contract Period - Cost Per Unit
Flat Rate Hour / Rebuild Time / Valve Body & Governor Test / Dyno Test

SEE ATTACHMENT

% REDUCED FROM LIST PRICE

DENSITY LIST OF TRANSMISSIONS
ESTIMATED NUMBER OF UNITS PER YEAR

Delivery will be made within __ days
after receipt of  notice to proceed. 3 Days 2 Days


