

<b>CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES</b>											
<b>RFB NO. 19-0039</b>											
	<b>Est Qty</b>	<b>Key Maintenance</b>	<b>Robinson</b>	<b>Southeastern</b>	<b>Veritiv</b>	<b>Pyramid School</b>	<b>COPACO</b>	<b>Grainger</b>	<b>Associated</b>	<b>Zep Sales</b>	<b>Imperial</b>
		<b>Supply</b>	<b>Supply, Co.</b>	<b>PaperGroup</b>	<b>Operating Co.</b>	<b>Products</b>	<b>Inc.</b>	<b>Industrial</b>	<b>Paper</b>	<b>&amp; Service</b>	<b>Dade</b>
<b>A. CUSTODIAL CHEMICALS</b>											
1. Ammonia; Household strength	125 Cases	38.42/4,802.50	48.00/6,000.00	12.48/1,560.00	no bid	no bid	15.16/1,895.00	68.43/8,553.75	no bid	no bid	11.00/1,375.00
2. Toilet Chemical; Used In Portable Toilet	6 Cases	74.29/445.76	66.00/396.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	28.71/172.26	1.39/8.34	no bid	24.75/99.00	no bid
<b>B. DETERGENTS/BLEACH</b>											
1. Cascade; 6/85 oz.	12 Cases	34.16/409.92	54.00/648.00	58.15/697.80	no bid	38.98/467.76	56.50/678.00	41.57/498.84	no bid	no bid	54.51/654.15
2. Bleach 6 or Whitner; 15% Chlorine	800 Cases	14.75/11,802.35	21.10/16,880.00	14.56/11,648.00	14.17/11,336.00	no bid	15.74/12,592.00	4.23/3,384.00	no bid	no bid	12.38/9,900.00
3. Ivory Dishwashing Liquid; 25/12.6 oz Bottle PH:13	55 Cases	30.11/1,656.11	42.00/2,310.00	31.07/1,708.85	32.75/1,801.25	31.89/1,753.95	33.51/1,843.05	44.75/2,461.25	no bid	no bid	29.12/1,601.88
4. Tide; 14/49 oz.	75 Cases	no bid	68/00/5,100.00	no bid	74.04/5,553.00	no bid	40.08/3,006.00	45.23/3,392.25	45.05/3,378375	3.06/49.00	78.56/5,892.19
<b>C. DEODORIZERS</b>											
1. Carpet Deodorizer, 12 oz can	30 Cases	32.58/977.40	42.00/1,260.00	31.52/945.60	no bid	39.98/1,199.40	30.81/924.30	126.24/3,787.20	no bid	no bid	no bid
2. Deo Urinal; Individually wrapped; 4 oz.	300 Dozen	8.07/2,421.00	8.25/2,475.00	7.63/228.90	no bid	4.99/1,1497.00	8.25/2,475.00	43.63/13,089.00	no bid	no bid	8.42/2,527.50
3. Deo Block Urinal Screen	100 Cases	17.00/1,700.00	22.10/2,210.00	10.53/1,053.00	no bid	10.98/1,098.00	25.55/2,555.00	28.87/2,887.00	no bid	2.24/26.91	18.25/1,825.00
4. Deo Wall Blocks W/Hanger; 24 Oz.	36 Dozen	24.94/897.84	58.60/2,109.60	24.40/878.40	no bid	42.99/1,547.64	51.86/1,866.96	63.84/2,298.24	no bid	no bid	no bid
5. Deo Toilet Bowl Hanging Urinal	100 Cases	14.18/1,418.00	103.20/10,320.00	10.07/1,007.00	no bid	6.29/629.00	10.62/1,062.00	16.08/1,608.00	no bid	no bid	13.04/1,303.75
6. Deo Air Freshner: Wall Plug-Ins; Glade Refills 1.34 FL. Oz	100 Cases	28.82/2,882.00	21.00/2,100.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	9.13/913.00	58.46/5,846.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
7. Deo Air Freshner: Fefill for Metered Dispenser 5.3 to 7 Oz.	300 Cases	44.97/13,491.00	34.00/10,200.00	30.67/9,201.00	35.12/10,536.00	27.98/8,394.00	37.37/11,211.00	42.97/12,891.00	no bid	no bid	40.20/12,060.00
8. Deo Air Freshener Misty Dispenser	50 Cases	28.03/1,401.50	21.00/1,050.00	24.00/1,200.00	15.00/750.00	155.88/7,794.00	12.94/647.00	61.89/3,094.50	no bid	no bid	30.41/1,520.62
9. Deo Cherry (Bid) Concentrated Liquid; 4/1 Gal	1,200 Cases	53.30/63,960.00	29.80/35,760.00	32.13/38,556.00	37.74/45,288.00	no bid	28.29/33,948.00	24.82/29,784.00	56.73/68.76	no bid	33.28/39,930.00
10. Deo Ecobreeze Liquid Air Freshener; 1 Gal	100 Cases	no bid	43.20/4,320.00	43.20/4,320.00	no bid	no bid	24.87/2,487.00	52.33/5,233.00	no bid	no bid	44.79/4,478.75
<b>D. DISINFECTANTS</b>											
1. Disinfectant Cleaner; w/Pure Pine Oil, Pinesol or Equal	24 Cases	31.03/744.80	32.40/777.60	35.04/840.96	33.33/799.92	no bid	29.50/708.00	59.42/1,426.08	26.69/640.56	no bid	32.85/788.40
2. Lemon/Pine; gal, Active Ingredients 5%-Inert Ingredients 95%	1,200 Gallon	28.41/34,093.33	25.90/31,080.00	32.96/39,552.00	26.42/31,704.00	no bid	19.58/23,496.00	49.77/59,724.00	26.69/32,028.00	no bid	21.69/26,025.00
3. Disinfectant Spray; Hospital Strength Aerosol Can	100 Cases	46.85/4,685.00	37.60/3,760.00	34.93/3,493.00	32.51/3,251.00	23.98/2,398.00	25.11/2,511.00	90.65/9,065.00	34.61/3,461.00	3.00/36.00	32.55/3,255.00
4. Disinfectant Spray; Lysol or Equal	100 Cases	64.37/6,437.00	72.40/7,240.00	55.68/5,568.00	90.17/9,017.00	78.98/7,898.00	86.25/8,625.00	2.69/269.00	34.61/3,461.00	3.75/39.00	85.24/8,523.75
5. Tub & Tile Mildew Cleaner - 4/1 Gal Per Cs	200 Cases	32.34/3,234.44	39.20/7,840.00	32.77/6,554.00	no bid	no bid	28.93/5,786.00	62.22/12,444.00	37.54/7,508.00	2.50/30.00	31.69/6,337.50
6. Hand Sanitizer, Instant Concentrated; 4 oz	100 Cases	51.74/5,174.00	44.00/4,400.00	28.03/2,803.00	48.98/4,898.00	35.76/3,576.00	44.50/445.00	66.43/6,643.00	no bid	no bid	47.10/4,710.00
7. Disinfectant Cleaner; Crew, Non-Acid Concentrated	100 Cases	32.61/3,261.00	27.20/2,720.00	33.20/3,320.00	28.58/2,858.00	no bid	27.93/2,793.00	128.16/12,816.00	45.44/4,544.00	no bid	33.15/3,315.00
<b>E. FURNITURE POLISH</b>											
1. Pledge Lemon Scent; (Aerosol Can)	24 Cases	59.86/1,436.64	72.00/728.00	31.75/762.00	no bid	26.98/647.52	28.40/681.60	67.92/1,630.08	33.32/799.68	no bid	48.00/1,152.00
2. Upholstery Cleaner Spray Can, 14oz Can	10 Cases	28.61/286.11	54.00/540.00	24.72/247.20	27.39/273.90	no bid	38.79/387.90	4.51/45.10	33.90/339.00	no bid	47.52/475.25
<b>F. INSECT REPELLANT</b>											
1. Insect Repellant; Off or Equal	60 Cases	45.16/2,709.88	98.00/5,880.00	54.93/3,295.80	70.60/4,236.00	59.98/3,598.80	63.74/3,824.40	3.67/220.20	no bid	no bid	64.60/3,876.00
2. Wasp Spray; Aerosol 12 cans per case	120 Cases	49.70/5,964.00	58.00/6,960.00	42.67/5,120.40	66.36/7,963.20	36.96/4,435.20	44.55/5,346.00	4.45/534.00	42.00/5,040.00	4.58/55.00	50.16/6,019.50
3. Crawling & Flying Insect Spray; Aerosol 12 cans per case	120 Cases	52.93/5,293.33	58.00/6,960.00	39.51/4,741.20	55.55/6,666.00	34.98/4,197.60	39.90/4,788.00	69.49/8,338.80	32.20/3,864.00	no bid	48.32/5,799.00

<b>CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES</b>	<b>Est Qty</b>	<b>Key Maintenance</b>	<b>Robinson</b>	<b>Southeastern</b>	<b>Veritiv</b>	<b>Pyramid School</b>	<b>COPACO</b>	<b>Grainger</b>	<b>Associated</b>	<b>Zep Sales</b>	<b>Imperial</b>
<b>RFB NO. 13-0043</b>		<b>Supply</b>	<b>Supply, Co.</b>	<b>PaperGroup</b>	<b>Operating Co.</b>	<b>Products</b>	<b>Inc.</b>	<b>Industrial</b>	<b>Paper</b>	<b>&amp; Service</b>	<b>Dade</b>
4. Fire Ant Killer; White Powdered Insecticide	200 Cases	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	17.87/3,574.00	no bid	6.66/79.99	no bid
<b>G. SOAP</b>											
1. Ivory Bath Soap; 96 Bars Per Cs; 3.5 oz Size Bar	36 Cases	34.40/1,238.40	78.00/2,808.00	35.84/1,290.24	no bid	32.99/1,187.64	38.82/1,397.52	84.29/3,034.44	no bid	no bid	33.60/1,209.60
2. Antibacterial Liquid Soap 4/1 Per Gallon	150 Cases	45.63/6,844.99	48.00/7,200.00	50.35/7,552.50	27.21/4,081.50	29.98/4,497.00	49.95/7,492.50	52.84/7,926.00	45.50/6,810.00	12/48.00	46.04/6,905.62
3. Lava Hand Soap; Individual Pkg.; 48 Bars Per Cs	175 Cases	40.54/7,094.50	49.80/8,715.00	44.33/7,757.75	45.96/8,043.00	39.96/6,993.00	43.37/7,589.75	45.40/7,945.00	40.00/7,000.00	no bid	41.34/7,234.06
4. Dial Hand Soap Liquid Pump 7.5 Oz; 12 Bottles Per Case	200 Cases	25.60/5,120.00	57.80/11,560.00	29.47/5,894.00	32.92/6,584.00	28.99/5,798.00	29.06/5,812.00	44.31/8,862.00	26.45/5,290.00	no bid	26.95/5,390.00
5. Soap; Purell; Hand Sanitizer Refill; Size ML 24 FL Oz	200 Cases	91.66/18,332.00	89.00/17,800.00	66.88/1,337.60	no bid	no bid	68.28/13,656.00	104.40/20,880.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
6. Soap; Purell; 5392 Hand Sanitizer Refill for Size Dispenser	100 Cases	59.10/5,910.00	98.00/9,800.00	63.56/6,356.00	70.72/7,072.00	no bid	59.58/5,958.00	70.11/7,011.00	no bid	no bid	68.00/6,800.00
7. Soap Foam; GoJo; 5362 Antibacterial Soap Bottle Refill	100 Cases	45.53/4,553.00	76.00/7,600.00	46.40/4,640.00	51.61/5,161.00	no bid	43.50/4,350.00	72.97/7,297.00	40.03/4,003.00	no bid	49.62/4,962.50
8. Soap Foam; GoJo; 5361 Soap W/Skin Cond Rfill for Dispenser	100 Cases	41.40/4,140.00	98.00/9,800.00	42.19/4,219.00	46.93/4,693.00	no bid	40.13/4,013.00	53.13/5,313.00	34.77/3,477.00	no bid	45.12/4,512.50
9. Soap Foam; GoJo; 5161 Soap for Disp (Park Serv; Size 1250)	300 Cases	39.63/11,889.99	89.00/26,700.00	42.81/12,843.00	47.66/14,298.00	no bid	39.55/3,955.00	54.18/16,254.00	34.77/10,431.00	no bid	45.81/13,747.50
10. Soap Hand; GoJo Jar 4.5 LB	75 Cases	81.78/6,133.50	78.00/5,850.00	85.81/6,435.75	92.35/6,926.25	no bid	80.45/6,033.75	94.01/7,050.75	no bid	no bid	no bid
<b>H. GLASS CLEANER</b>											
1. Glass Cleaner; Windex or Equal; 1 Qt Bottles w/Trigger	50 Cases	20.46/1,023.00	25.38/1,269.00	23.44/1,172.00	19.10/955.00	no bid	27.90/1,395.00	54.77/2,738.50	22.18/1,109.00	2.66/32.00	20.51/1,025.62
2. Windex; 1 Qt Bottles w/Trigger	200 Cases	40.48/8,096.00	54.80/10,960.00	45.17/9,034.00	40.30/8,060.00	no bid	41.52/8,304.00	74.27/14,854.00	18.79/3,758.00	2.50/30.00	41.09/8,217.50
<b>I. MISCELLANEOUS CLEANERS</b>											
1. 409 Cleaner; 12/1 Qt Bottles W/Trigger	200 Cases	35.32/7,064.00	48.00/9,600.00	38.88/7,776.00	40.82/8,164.00	no bid	38.43/7,686.00	17.30/3,460.00	16.77/3,354.00	2.75/33.00	37.50/7,500.00
2. All Purpose Liquid Cleaner; 409 or Equal; 12 Qts per case	12 Cases	35.32/423.97	27.60/331.20	30.56/366.72	40.82/489.84	no bid	27.75/333.00	66.11/793.32	39.50/474.00	2.75/33.00	26.98/323.70
3. AJAX; 30; 21 oz Containers per case	150 Cases	25.80/3,870.00	27.00/4,050.00	33.60/5,040.00	41.28/6,192.00	26.98/4,047.00	25.37/3,805.50	38.78/5,817.00	26.00/3,900.00	no bid	26.30/3,945.00
4. E-Z Off Oven Cleaner; Spray Cans per case	60 Cases	35.68/2,140.80	58.00/3,480.00	27.52/1,651.20	36.84/2,210.40	25.98/1,558.80	33.11/1,986.60	121.90/7,314.00	39.81/2,388.60	no bid	33.12/1,987.50
5. S.O.S. Pads; 12/15 oz	15 Cases	38.59/578.85	58.00/870.00	28.41/426.15	no bid	24.79/371.85	39.22/588.30	6.78/101.70	no bid	no bid	39.75/596.50
6. Heavy Duty Scrubbing Pads - HD69; 10/BX; 12 dz/case	20 Cases	49.81/996.20	65.00/1,300.00	6.65/93.00	38.80/776.00	11.98/239.60	8.20/164.00	21.34/426.80	no bid	no bid	4.10/82.00
7. Spic N Span; 27 oz. Box	150 Cases	102.84/15,426.00	82.00/12,300.00	135.04/20,256.00	94.55/14,182.50	98.98/14,847.00	123.68/18,552.00	160.79/24,118.50	no bid	no bid	103.05/15,457.50
8. Toilet Bowl Cleaner; Non-Acid; 12 Qts per case	150 Cases	26.14/3,921.67	23.08/3,460.00	23.84/3,576.00	20.02/3,003.00	no bid	19.92/2,988.00	50.10/7,515.00	16.77/2,515.50	no bid	24.72/3,708.75
9. Wash and Wax Cleaner; for Automobiles, Trucks, Etc	200 Cases	32.00/6,400.00	46.60/9,320.00	37.69/7,538.00	no bid	no bid	27.68/5,536.00	7.83/1,566.00	32.23/6,446.00	15.50/62.00	33.76/6,752.50
10. Stainless Steel Sponges (400 Series)	10 Cases	13.14/131.40	98.00/980.00	7.41/74.10	no bid	25.99/259.90	5.40/54.00	3.69/36.90	no bid	no bid	5.36/53.62
11. Degreaser/Cleaner Twister Industrial Strength Caustic Cleaner	200 Cases	34.80/6,960.00	31.60/6,320.00	22.00/4,400.00	32.01/6,402.00	no bid	22.25/4,450.00	121.21/24,242.00	35.24/7,048.00	8.50/34.00	14.79/2,957.50
12. Carpet Spot Remover	10 Cases	28.84/288.40	37.90/379.00	28.40/284.00	no bid	no bid	43.90/439.00	4.67/46.70	30.28/302.80	9.00/48.00	25361/256.12
13. Carpet Shampoo	36 Cases	33.70/1,213.20	38.52/1,386.72	44.65/1,607.40	no bid	no bid	29.12/1,048.32	14.75/531.00	27.99/1,007.64	9.00/36.00	38.56/1,388.25
14. Gum Remover	4 Cases	36.03/144.12	42.00/168.00	23.52/94.08	no bid	23.99/95.96	51.90/207.60	3.70/14.80	40.00/160.00	no bid	36.01/144.05
15. Oil Dry	1,200 Bags	8.74/10,488.00	no bid	13.27/15,924.00	6.45/7,740.00	no bid	5.33/6,396.00	8.59/10,308.00	7.39/8,868.00	no bid	5.79/6,945.00
16. Emulsifying Degreaser	24 Cases	30.34/728.16	31.92/766.08	38.25/918.00	no bid	no bid	27.10/650.40	15.98/383.52	no bid	no bid	24.79/594.90
17. Armour All Trigger Sprayer - 6/CS, 28 Oz	10 Cases	48.77/487.70	39.00/390.00	59.73/597.30	no bid	no bid	59.36/593.60	11.45/687.00	no bid	7.25/87.00	no bid
18. Dust Mop Treatment Spray 12/Case, 18 Oz	10 Cases	44.72/447.20	58.00/580.00	47.41/474.10	42.85/428.50	26.99/269.90	49.16/491.60	91.95/919.50	no bid	no bid	44.68/446.75
19. Urinal Screens	300 Cases	10.12/3,036.00	12.20/3,660.00	10.53/3,159.00	no bid	29.50/8,850.00	10.20/375.00	22.11/6,633.00	no bid	2.24/26.91	8.75/2,625.00
20. Stainless Steel Cleaner; Water Based Aerosol Can 12 Per Case	20 Cases	45.62/912.40	49.30/986.00	41.96/839.20	no bid	37.98/759.60	26.45/529.00	7.00/1,680.00	15.55/311.00	no bid	34.05/681.00

