

BID TABULATION SHEET

RFB No. 19-0001
 RFB Name: Service Contract for Various Types of Transmission (Annual Contract)
 Date: May 15, 2019

<i>DESCRIPTION/VENDOR</i>	<i>Jasper Engines & Transmissions (Jasper, IN)</i>	<i>Rush Truck Center (Columbus, GA)</i>	<i>W.W. Williams (Atlanta, GA)</i>	<i>Reliable Transmission Service, Inc. (Riverview, FL)</i>
TRANSMISSION REPAIR				
I. FIELD SERVICE	INITIAL PERIOD 3 YEAR COST			
TRANSMISSION				
1. E40D Transmission				
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER)	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>
2. B400R Transmission				
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	\$105.00	\$125.00	\$130.00
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	\$0.38	\$1.00	\$1.50
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER)	<i>No Bid</i>	\$60.00	\$100.00	\$130.00
3. Allison 2100/2200 Transmission				
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	\$105.00	\$125.00	\$130.00
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	\$0.38	\$1.00	\$1.50
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER)	<i>No Bid</i>	\$60.00	\$100.00	\$130.00
4. Allison B300 Transmission				
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	\$105.00	\$125.00	\$130.00
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	\$0.38	\$1.00	\$1.50
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER)	<i>No Bid</i>	\$60.00	\$100.00	\$130.00
5. Chevrolet 6L90 Transmission				
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR)	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER)	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>No Bid</i>

BID TABULATION SHEET

RFB No. 19-0001
 RFB Name: Service Contract for Various Types of Transmission (Annual Contract)
 Date: May 15, 2019

<i>DESCRIPTION/VENDOR</i>	<i>Jasper Engines & Transmissions (Jasper, IN)</i>	<i>Rush Truck Center (Columbus, GA)</i>	<i>W.W. Williams (Atlanta, GA)</i>	<i>Reliable Transmission Service, Inc. (Riverview, FL)</i>
II. TRANSMISSION PRICING				
TYPES OF TRANSMISSION + CORE COST	<i>Jasper Engines & Transmissions (Jasper, IN)</i>	<i>Rush Truck Center (Columbus, GA)</i>	<i>W.W. Williams. (Atlanta, GA)</i>	<i>Reliable Transmission Service, Inc. (Riverview, FL)</i>
	COMPLY YES/NO	COMPLY YES/NO	COMPLY YES/NO	
1. E40D TRANSMISSION	Yes/\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2. B400R TRANSMISSION	Yes/\$0.00	Yes/\$4,801.44	Yes/\$7,202.16	Yes/\$1,500.00
3. ALLISION SERIES: 2100/2200 TRANSMISSION	Yes/\$0.00	Yes/\$1,796.82	Yes/\$2,695.23	Yes/\$1,500.00
4. ALLISON B300R TRANSMISSION	Yes/\$0.00	Yes/\$4,801.44	Yes/\$7,202.16	Yes/\$1,500.00
5. CHEVROLET 6L90 TRANSMISSION	Yes/\$1,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
B. EXCHANGE PRICES	Initial Period – 3 Year Contract Period Cost Per Unit			
1. E40D	\$1,993.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2. B400R	\$5,432.00	\$4,397.59	\$4,280.45	\$4,016.25
3. ALLISION SERIES: 2100/2200	\$2,870.00	\$2,426.14	\$2,532.13	\$2,495.00
4. ALLISON B300R	\$5,432.00	\$4,397.59	\$4,280.45	\$4,016.25
5. CHEVROLET 6L90	\$2,632.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
C. LABOR CHARGES	Initial Period – 3 Year Contract Period Cost Per Unit Flat Rate Hour			
1. E40D	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2. B400R	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$130.00
3. ALLISION SERIES: 2100/2200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$130.00
4. ALLISON B300R	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$130.00
5. CHEVROLET 6L90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
D. PARTS:				
% DEDUCTED FROM LIST PRICE	20%	N/A	N/A	10%
E. WARRANTY:				
1. E40D	See Attached Warranty Sheet	See Attached Warranty Sheet	No Bid	N/A
2. B400R	See Attached Warranty Sheet	See Attached Warranty Sheet	2 Years	2 Years
3. ALLISION SERIES: 2100/2200	See Attached Warranty Sheet	See Attached Warranty Sheet	2 Years	2 Years
4. ALLISON B300R	See Attached Warranty Sheet	See Attached Warranty Sheet	2 Years	2 Years
5. CHEVROLET 6L90	See Attached Warranty Sheet	See Attached Warranty Sheet	No Bid	N/A
Delivery will be made within _____ days after receipt of notice to proceed.	2 Days	5 Days	No Bid	5 Days