COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
RFB No. 18-0037; Trailers
March 28, 2018

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid
opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

16-FT UTILITY DUAL AXLE TRAILER

True North Chattahoochee Stephen L. Green Verde. Inc Interstate Trailers, | Holden Industries, Reynolds Warren Tractor &
Vendors Logistics, LLC Trailer, LLC Trailers (Lake Walles IFL) Inc. Inc. Equipment Equipment Co.
(Downer's Grove, FL) (Columbus, GA) | (Farmingdale, NJ) ‘ (Mansfield, TX) | (Southwest City, (Lake City, GA) Birmingham, AL
ADDENDUM NO. ONE v v v v v v v
Product Literature v v v v v v v
Warranty Information v v v v v v v
Detailed Specifications Response Pages v v v v v v v
2018 Bri-mar / 2018 Sure-Trac 2018 Kaufman 2018 PJ Trailers 2018 Interstate / .
Manufacturer/Model EH16-10ELE ST8216TAT-B100 |  FOU-71-16D | 16X83" 6" Channel Equip. 10BST 2018 Holden HDO10 f 2018 Feling FT-12 E
UNIT PRICE $4,110.71 $4,686.80 $5,876.54 $5,995.00 $7,327.00 $8,690.00 $11,580.00
TOTAL PRICE (4UNITS)|  $16,442.84 $18,747.20 $23,506.16 $23,980.00 $29,308.00 $34,760.00 $46,320.00
20-FT BACKHOE TRAILER
Chattahoochee Stephen L. Green True North . Holden Industries, | Reynolds Warren Tractor &
Vendors Trailer, LLC Trailers Logistics, LLC Inte[;t:rngTi;?(;le_lr_;,)lnc. Inc. Equipment (La\li:r\;\j/ZIler;C'FL) Equipment Co.
(Columbus, GA) (Farmingdale, NJ) | (Downer's Grove, FL) ‘ (Southwest City, | (Lake City, GA) ' (Birmingham, AL)
ADDENDUM NO. ONE v v v v v v
Product Literature v v v v v v
Warranty Information v v v v v v
Detailed Specifications Response Pages v v v v v v NO BID NO BID
2018 Sure-Trac 2018 Kaufman 2018 Bwise / 2018 Interstate / 2019 Holden TD020 2018 Felling
Manufacturer/Model ST10222SLP DO2A-B- | FHPP-10K-20D EDB25-23K 20DT FT-20-2 LP
UNIT PRICE $8,742.80 $10,567.89 $11,130.00 $11,102.00 $14,485.00 $17,800.00
TRI-AXLE 55-TON DETACHABLE LOWBOY TRAILER
. True North Stephen L. Green Reynolds Warren Tractor & Holden Industries, Chattahoochee
Vendors Intezfﬂt::aszigi;le;s),(,)lnc. Logistics, LLC Trailers Equipment Equipment Co. Inc. (La\li:r\;\j/ZIler;C'FL) Trailer, LLC
' (Downer's Grove, FL) | (Farmingdale, NJ) (Lake City, GA) (Birmingham, AL) | (Southwest City, ' (Columbus, GA)
ADDENDUM NO. ONE v v v v v v
Product Literature v v v v v v
Warranty Information v v v v v v
Detailed Specifications Response Pages (REV) v v v v v v NO BID NO BID
2018 Interstate / 2018 Kaufman / 2018 Kaufman . 2018 Etnyre
Manufacturer/Model 110SDGN FRDTS5 FRDTS5 2018 Felling XF-110-3HDG 55 ton Power 2019 Holden HPD55
(REV Pricing Page) UNIT PRICE $61,485.00 $72,231.39 $76,860.00 $77,950.00 $84,900.00 $98,589.00




