BID TABULATION

RFB NAME: Athletic Uniforms (Annual Contract)
RFB NO: 17-0003
DATE: July 20, 2016
Ad-Wear & Speciaty
of Texas Columbus Trophy &
BRG Sports _ (Houston, TX) Screenprinting
(Elyria, OH) American Soccer Inc. Brand: Teamwork (Columbus, GA)
Brand: Teamwork (Wilmington, CA) Athletic Apparel Brand: Teamwork
Athletic Apparel *Brand: Score Denver Boxing: Ringside Athletic Apparel
Submission
Requirements
Addenda (2) v v v v
Product Literature v v v v
Product Warranty v v v v
Basketball (Bio/No Bid Bid Bid Bid
Bid)
Boxing (Bid/ No Bid) No Bid No Bid Bid No Bid
Contract Signature v v v v
Page
Pricing Information
Basketball
Uniforms Jerseys Shorts Jerseys Shorts Jerseys Shorts Jerseys Shorts
Youth (S—L) | 27.03 11.48 8.20 6.20 11.95 9.17 15.00 11.30
Adult (S-XL) | 29.13 13.58 8.20 6.20 13.19 10.73 17.00 14.30
Adult (2X) | 32.63 17.08 9.20 7.20 14.73 13.97 18.70 16.30
Adult (3X) | 36.13 20.58 10.20 8.20 16.73 15.97 20.00 18.00
Adult (4X) | 38.13 22.58 11.20 8.20 18.73 17.97 22.00 19.00
Boxing
Uniforms Jerseys Shorts
Youth (S-L) 10.00 23.00
Adult (S—XL) 12.00 23.00
Adult (2X) 14.00 25.00
Adult (3X) 16.00 27.00
Adult (4X) 18.00 29.00

* Specifications required basketball uniforms to be of the brand “ Teamwork Athletic Apparel” (See page 11, section IV “Brand
Names’; and page 14, “Basketball Uniform Specifications’. No specific brand was required for boxing uniforms. “American
Soccer Inc.” deemed non-responsive.

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an
award or intent to award to a particular vendor.
Bid responses are being forwarded to the Project
Manager, who will provide an award
recommendation for approval by the appropriate
persons and/or by Columbus Council




