COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Cameras
RFB No. 15-0028

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or
intent to award to a particular vendor. Bid responses are
being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide
an award recommendation for approval by the
appropriate persons and/or by Columbus Council.

June 3, 2015
Al OPTION 1: BODY WORN CAMERAS OPTION 2: POINT AND SHOOT CAMERAS
SUBMISSION REQUIREMENTS Il) : P::d ‘IA::,:: :::l;.s:::: Manufacturer/Make/Model UNIT COST T((S);Al:-N(I?SS)T P:iot d ‘IA::,:: :::l;.spp::: Manufacturer/Make/Model UNIT COST .(I-2OST: ;;ﬂ_ss.;
MAXSUR ) Canon/PowerShot/ELPH170
Liverty i, ) AJA | v MAXSUR/Shield/IV $299.98 $14,999.00) v | v | ~ Including SD Card and Case $179.97 $44,992.50]
[E-Logic, Inc. (Washington, D.C) vivl v | v v Patrol Eyes - SC- DVI $310.00 $1 5,500_00| v | v v Canon/PowerShot/ELPH135 $115.00 $23,750_00|
McLaggan Communications Eye3WitnessView Bodycam
[Hahira, GA) vl | v | v 001-119-001 $349.00 $17,450.00] NO BID
B&H Photo Video Canon PowerShot ELPH160 Camera 0137001
pov o 1 e,
Police Body Worn Cameras + Pearstone USB-AMBO4FB USB cable

vivl v | v v $359.75 $17,987.500 v | v v + RUGGARD HES-220 Case $125.65 $31,412.50]
COBAN Technologies, Inc.
lHouston, TX) 1.1 % v COBAN Echo body worn camera $504‘00 $25,200_00I NO BID
17th Street Photo Supply, Inc. Canon PowerShot ELPH160
[(New York, NY) viv NO BID v | v v Black/White/Silver/Red $101.40 $25,350.00]
HUBB Systems, LLC
(Alameda, CA) vivl v | v v Data911 WolfCom Vision Camera $679.99 $33,999.50] NO BID
Millenium Products, Inc.
|(Clarkston, MI) vivl] v | v v | Black Mamba Protection BMPpro16 $776.24 $38,812.00] NO BID
Midwest Photo Exchange (MPEX) NO BID Nikon $3700 w/charger, mermory,
|(Columbus, OH) viv v | v v case, & extended warranty $163.38 $40,845.00]
Applied Concepts, Inc. )
{pions, ) Ao v | v | v | coagle/mppied Concepts, nc. §999.00  $49,950.00] ~ | v~ | . | Cocsle/Apelied Concepts, Inc §999.00  $249,750.00|
PCMG, Inc. Nikon $6200 / Kingston 4GBx
‘((humilly, VA) viv NO BID v | v v $SD Nikon Case $254.00 $63,500.00]
|Kies|er Poli.ce Supply, Inc. NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID
(Jeffersonville, IN)
Watch Guard Video (Allen, TX) NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID







