
AMMUNITION FOR PUBLIC SAFETY DEPARTMENTS
RFB NO. 15-0013

Est Qty National Police Master Smyrna Police Lawmen's & Precision Delta Ed's Public Clyde Gulf States GT Distributors

Ammunition Cartridge Corp Distributors Shooters Supply Corp Safety Armory, Inc. Distributors, Inc.  Inc.

I.  POLICE DEPARTMENT
45ACP -Reloaded - 230GR Ball 450,000 RDS no bid .39/$175,500.00 .26/$117,000.00 no bid .224/$100,800.00 .30/$135,000.00 no bid no bid no bid

12 GAUGE - Remington - 00 Buck Shot 25,000 RDS no bid no bid .43/$10,750.00 .45/$11,250.00 .3998/$9,998.00 .48/$12,000.00 no bid no bid .5868/$14,670.00

223 - Hornady - 55GR 15,000 RDS no bid no bid .54/$8,100.00 no bid .6958/$10,437.00 .55/$8,250.00 no bid .5485/$8,227.50 .5983/$8,974.50

223 - Reloaded - 55GR Ball 75,000 RDS no bid .35/$26,250.00 .28/$21,000.00 no bid .3256/$24,420.00 .32/$24,000.00 no bid no bid no bid

38SPL - Precision - 148GR 25,000 RDS no bid no bid .22/$5,500.00 no bid .299/$7,475.00 .25/$6,250.00 no bid no bid no bid

38SPL - Precision - 148GR 25,000 RDS no bid no bid .22/$5,500.00 no bid .299/$7,475.00 .25/$6,250.00 no bid no bid no bid

38SPL - Precision - 158GR 15,000 RDS no bid no bid .23/$3,450.00 no bid .309/$4,635.00 .26/$3,900.00 .2620/$6,550.00 no bid no bid

9MM - Winchester - 147GR 20,000 RDS no bid no bid .26/$5,200.00 no bid .255/$4,500.00 .29/$5,800.00 .3440/$6,880.00 no bid no bid

45ACP - Federal - 230GR 10,000 RDS no bid no bid .26/$2,600.00 no bid .2495/$2,495.00 .30/$3,000.00 .3220/$3,220.00 .312/$3,120.00 .3996/$3,996.00

308 - Federal - 168GR 2,000 RDS no bid no bid .63/$1,260.00 no bid .7965/$1,593.00 .70/$1,400.00 no bid .825/$1,650.00 .9434/$1,866.80

9MM - Reload - 147GR 20,000 RDS no bid .29/$5,800.00 .26/$5,200.00 no bid .199/$3,80.00 .29/$5,800.00 .3440/$6,880.00 no bid no bid

9MM - Federal - 147GR 5,000 RDS no bid no bid .26/$1,300.00 no bid .225/$1,125.00 .29/$1,450.00 no bid .218/$1,090.00 no bid

45ACP - Winchester - 230GR 22,000 RDS no bid no bid .34/$7,480.00 no bid .3593/$7,904.60 .38/$8,360.00 no bid no bid .4787/$10,531.40

40 S&W - Winchester - 165GR 1,000 RDS no bid no bid .28/$280.00 no bid .289/$289.00 .32/$320.00 no bid no bid .4576/$457.60

223 - Federal - 55GR 3,000 RDS no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid .745/$2,235.00 .5984/$1,795.20

9MM - Reload - 115GR 15,000 RDS no bid .24/$3,600.00 .21/$3,150.00 no bid .197/$2,955.00 .24/$3,600.00 .1926/$2,889.00 no bid .2972/$4,458.00

II.  MARSHAL'S OFFICE
45 Automatic - Remington - 230GR BJHP 5,200 RDS no bid no bid .34/$1,768.00 .35/$1,820.00 .3593/$1,868.36 .38/$1,976.00 no bid no bid .4787/$2,489.24

12 Gauge - Remington LE - 00 Buck, 8 Pellets 3,500 RDS no bid no bid .43/$1,505.00 .45/$1,575.00 .3998/$1,399.30 .48/$1,680.00 no bid no bid .5868/$2,053.80

223 - Remington - 55GR 2,000 RDS no bid no bid .50/$1,000.00 .52/$1,040.00 .6958/$1,391.60 .55/$1,100.00 no bid no bid .5984/$1,196.80

308 Caliber - Federal/Premium - 168GR 2,000 RDS no bid no bid .63/$1,260.00 no bid .7965/$1,593.00 .70/$1,400.00 no bid .825/$1,650.00 .9434/$1,886.80

9MM - Federal Tactical - 147GR 1,000 RDS no bid no bid .33/$330.00 no bid .3668/$366.80 .37/$370.00 no bid .268/$268.00 .4165/$416.50

.40 Caliber - Federal Tactical - 165GR 1,000 RDS no bid no bid .35/$350.00 no bid .2825/$282.50 .39/$390.00 no bid .405/$405.00 .4576/$457.60

111.  PRACTICE AMMUNITION
.45 Auto ACP - 230GR 10,000 RDS .35/$3,500.00 .38/$3,800.00 .26/$2,600.00 .28/$2,800.00 .2495/$2,495.00 .30/$3,000.00 .3220/$3,220.00 .312/$3,120.00 .4787/$4,787.00

9MM - 147GR 1,500 RDS .26/$390.00 .31/$465.00 .24/$360.00 .25/$375.00 .225/$337.50 .27/$405.00 .2570/$385.50 .229/$458.00 .4165/$624.75

.40 Caliber - 165GR 1,500 RDS .33/$495.00 .31/$465.00 .25/$375.00 .26/$390.00 .226/$339.00 .28/$420.00 no bid .308/$616.00 .4576/$686.40

.223 Caliber - 55GR 8,000 RDS .34/$2,720.00 .35/$2,800.00 .28/$2,240.00 .30/$2,400.00 .3256/$2,604.80 .32/$3,560.00 no bid .334/$2,672.00 .4264/$3,411.20

.308 Caliber - 168GR 4,000 RDS no bid .75/$3,000.00 .63/$2,520.00 .66/$2,640.00 no bid .70/$2,800.00 no bid .582/$2,328.00 no bid

IV.  MUSCOGEE COUNTY PRISON
.40 Automatic - Reload - 165GR 67,000 RDS .33/$22,110.00 .29/$19,430.00 .25/$16,750.00 .26/$17,420.00 .225/$15,075.00 .28/$18,760.00 .2960/$19,832.00 no bid no bid

38 Special Cal. - 158GR 30,000 RDS no bid .21/$6,300.00 .23/$6,900.00 .24/$7,200.00 .225/$6,750.00 .26/$7,800.00 .2620/$7,860.00 no bid no bid

12 Gauge - Remington - 00 Buckshot 2,000 RDS .99/$1,980.00 no bid .43/$860.00 .45/$900.00 .3998/$799.60 .48/$960.00 no bid no bid .5983/$1,196.60



AMMUNITION FOR PUBLIC SAFETY DEPARTMENTS
RFB NO. 15-0013

Est Qty National Police Master Smyrna Police Lawmen's & Precision Delta Ed's Public Clyde Gulf States GT Distributors

Ammunition Cartridge Corp Distributors Shooters Supply Corp Safety Armory, Inc. Distributors, Inc.  Inc.

V.  SHERIFF'S OFFICE
.45 - Winchester - 230GR 12,500 RDS no bid no bid .34/$4,250.00 no bid .3593/$4,491.25 .38/$4,750.00 no bid no bid .4787/$5,983.75

9MM - Winchester - 147GR 300 RDS no bid no bid .31/$93.00 no bid .295/$88.50 .35/$105.00 no bid no bid .4165/$124.95

.38 Special - 110GR 100 RDS no bid no bid .23/$23.00 .25/$25.00 no bid .27/$27.00 no bid no bid no bid

.380 Cal - 90GR 1,000 RDS no bid no bid .25/$250.00 .27/$270.00 .66/$660.00 .29/$290.00 no bid .339/$339.00 no bid

.308 Cal - Federal - 168GR 9,000 RDS no bid no bid .63/$5,670.00 no bid .7965/$7,168.50 .70/$6,300.00 no bid .825/$7,425.00 .9434/$8,490.60

.223 Cal - Federal - 55GR 4,000 RDS no bid no bid .34/$1,360.00 no bid no bid .38/$1,520.00 no bid .388/$1,552.00 .5983/$2,393.20

12 Gauge - Remington 1,000 RDS no bid no bid .43/$430.00 .45/$450.00 .3998/$399.80 .48/$480.00 no bid no bid .5983/$598.30

12 Gauge - Remington - 1 oz. 1,000 RDS no bid no bid .45/$450.00 .47/$470.00 .457/$457.00 .51/$510.00 no bid no bid .8813/$881.30

VI.  PRACTICE AMMUNITION
.45ACP - Reload - 230GR 100,000 RDS .35/$35,000.00 .39/$39,000.00 .32/$32,000.00 no bid .288/$28,800.00 .36/$36,000.00 .3730/$37,300.00 no bid .4787/$47,870.00

9MM - 147GR 1,000 RDS .26/$260.00 .31/$310.00 .26/$260.00 .27/$270.00 .225/$225.00 .29/$290.00 .2850/$258.00 .229/$229.00 .4165/$416.50

223 Cal - Federal or Remington - 55GR 32,000 RDS .34/$10,800.00 no bid .28/$8,960.00 .30/$9,600.00 .3256/$10,419.20 .32/$10,240.00 no bid .334/$10,688.00 .4264/$13,644.80

MUNITIONS LIST Est Qty National Police Master Smyrna Police Lawmen's & Precision Delta Ed's Public Clyde Gulf States GT Distributors

 Ammunition Cartridge Corp Distributors Shooters Supply Corp Safety Armory, Inc. Distributors, Inc.  Inc.

SHERIFF'S OFFICE
37mm 4.8” Safe Smoke; 75 – 150 yards 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 19.43/$971.50 no bid no bid 14.62/$731.00
37mm 4.8” Spede – Heat CS; 75 – 150 yards 70 EA. no bid 39.85/5977.50 no bid no bid no bid 23.45/$1,641.50 no bid no bid 16.60/$1,162.00
Stinger Rubber Ball Grenades 20 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 47.49/$949.80 38.02/$760.40 no bid 35.43/$708.60
Stinger Rubber Ball Grenades w/OC 20 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 49.79/$995.80 39.78/$795.60 no bid 39.90/$798.00
CS Grenades 30 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 29.99/$899.70 30.78/$615.60 no bid no bid
12 GA Diversionary Aerial Round 40 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.99/$239.60 4.95/$198.00 no bid no bid
12 GA Diversionary Rubber Pellet Round 120 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.49/$658.80 4.43/$531.60 no bid no bid
12 GA Super Sock Bean Bag Round 150 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.99/$898.50 4.96/$744.00 no bid 4.50/$675.00
MK – 1X 12oz. Spray Canister 12 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 46.99/$563.88 no bid no bid no bid
37MM Multiple Foam Baton, Smokeless 75-150 YD 20 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 18.99/$379.80 19.12/$382.40 no bid no bid

POLICE DEPARTMENT - 12 GAUGE
Bean Bag 2,600 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.10/$13,260.00 4.96/$12,896.00 no bid 4.50/$11,700.00
Rubber Pellet – High Velocity 1,100 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.10/$5,610.00 4.44/$4,884.00 no bid 3.75/$4,125.00
Rubber Pellet – Low Velocity 1,100 EA. no bid no bid no bid 5.10/$5,610.00 4.39/$4,829.00 no bid 4.23/$4,653.00
Launching Cartridge 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.59/$279.50 4.27/$213.50 no bid 5.57/$278.50
Diversionary Rounds 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 7.24/$362.00 4.95/$247.50 no bid no bid



MUNITIONS LIST Est Qty National Police Master Smyrna Police Lawmen's & Precision Delta Ed's Public Clyde Gulf States GT Distributors

 Ammunition Cartridge Corp Distributors Shooters Supply Corp Safety Armory, Inc. Distributors, Inc.  Inc.

POLICE DEPARTMENT - 40 MM
Bean Bags 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 21.99/$1,099.50 17.14/$857.00 no bid no bid
Rubber Baton 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 23.99/$1,199.50 17.81/$890.50 no bid 23.28/$1,164.00
Wood Baton 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 23.99/$1,199.50 17.81/$890.50 no bid 17.44/$872.00
Mono Baton 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 18.99/$949.50 no bid no bid no bid
Foam Baton 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 23.49/$1,174.50 18.68/$932.50 no bid 19.49/$974.50
Rubber Pellets (32) 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 21.99/$1,099.50 19.71/$985.50 no bid no bid
Rubber Pellets (60) 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 23.99/$1,199.50 17.81/$890.50 no bid 17.44/$872.00
Projectile, Smoke, White 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 23.79/$1,189.50 20.47/$1,023.50 no bid no bid
Projectile, CS 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 24.49/$1,224.50 16.93/$846.50 no bid no bid
Projectile, OC 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 22.99/$1,149.50 no bid no bid no bid

HAND DEPLOYABLE MUNITIONS
Rubber Ball, W/Rubber Pellets 100 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 47.49/$4,749.00 38.02/$3,802.00 no bid no bid
Rubber Ball, W/CS 100 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 48.99/$4,899.00 40.12/$4,012.00 no bid 28.97/$2,897.00
Rubber Ball, W/White Smoke 100 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 31.99/$3,199.00 no bid no bid 29.21/$2,921.00
Expulsion Grenade, Flameless 25 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 42.99/$1,074.75 no bid no bid no bid
Canister, Smoke 80 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 31.99/$2,559.20 26.67/$2,133.60 no bid 25.65/$105.65
Canister, Smoke, HC 50 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 31.99/$1,599.50 28.04/$1,402.00 no bid 27.66/$1,383.00
Canister, Smoke, Pocket 130 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 21.99/$2,858.70 no bid no bid 17.44/$2,267.20
Canister, CN 30 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 29.99/$899.70 26.55/$796.50 no bid no bid
Canister, OC 80 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 41.99/$3,359.20 32.98/$2,638.40 no bid no bid
Tactical Grenade, “Flash Bang” 25 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 44.99/$1,124.75 33.45/$836.25 no bid 38.25/$956.25
Tactical Grenade, “Flash Bang”, Small 25 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 38.99/$974.75 33.45/$836.25 no bid 46.01/$1,150.25
Tactical Grenade, “Flash Bang”, Training 25 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 37.99/$949.75 36.34/$908.50 no bid 39.38/$984.50
Tactical Grenade, “Flash Bang”, Training, Small 25 EA. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 28.99/$724.75 36.34/$908.50 no bid 49.87/$1,246.75


