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UNIT COST

K & K Manufacturing, Inc.
(Griffin, GA)    

K & K Manufacturing 
Inc. $0.00 $0.00

Don Jackson Chrysler Dodge Jeep
(Union City, GA)    

Chrysler/Dodge Ram 
3500 Crew 4x4 

DD8L93 $0.00 $0.00
Allan Vigil Ford of Fayetteville
(Fayetteville, GA)     Ford F350 XL $0.00 $0.00   $0.00 $0.00 $33,341.00
Transport Equipment Co., Inc.
(Albany, GA)    

Transport Equipment 
Co. / Custom Flat 

Dump $0.00 $0.00
Wade Ford
(Smyrna, GA)     Ford F350 $0.00 $0.00
Interstate Truck Equipment
(College Park, GA)    

ITE Model 1096FBD 
/ Rugby HR540 Hoist $0.00 $0.00

Griffin Inc.
(Byhalia, MS)     Ford F350  

Griffin Truck Body / 
10' Flatbed $0.00 $0.00 $44,917.98

Auto Nation Ford
(Marietta, GA)     Ford F350 (W3H) $0.00 $0.00  

10' Rugby Platform 
Dump $0.00 $0.00 $35,544.00

Family Ford (Hardy Family Ford)
(Dallas, GA)     Ford F350 (W3H) $0.00 $0.00   CTVE Dump Body $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $34,354.00
Sunny King Ford Inc.
(Anniston, AL)     2014 Ford F350  

Rugby 10' HD 
Platform Dump $0.00 $0.00 $35,932.00

Allan Vigil Ford
(Morrow, GA)    

Ford F350 SD 4x4 
Cab/Chassis $0.00 $250.00  

K & K Manufacturing 
Inc. SD-96-120-34-

EH $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $35,392.00
Nextran Truck Center/Macon
(Macon, GA)    

Ford F350
  Knapheide Body $0.00 $0.00 $34,575.00
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NO BID NO BID
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NO BID



$6,655.00

 $6,200.00
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NO BID

NO BID

 $28,154.00

NO BID



UNIT COST



 $6,655.00



NO BID

NO BID

$27,141.00
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



UNIT COST

NO BID

$28,640.00



 $27,324.00

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Flatbed Dump Truck

RFB No. 14-0019

November 13, 2013

SUBMISSION REQUIREMENTS
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Warr. 
Info.

OPTION 1:
CAB AND CHASSIS ONLY

OPTION 2:
BODY ONLY





OPTION 3:
COMPLETE UNIT

$27,467.00

 $10,839.00



NO BID

 $28,787.00

This is a draft tabulation.  The entries are as recorded during bid 
opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription 
errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is 
discovered during analysis of the bid responses.


