COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Trees for Planting on City Right-of-Ways (Annual Contract)
RFB No. 14-0017

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent
to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being

OCtOber 16 2013 forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award
L

recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Description/Vendor To-Mar Garden Cente Stovall & Co. John Deere Landscapef] Thoms Tree§ & Plants Arb_or Equity Moon's Tr_ee Farm
(Columbus, GA) (Cataula GA) (Cleveland OH) (Fayetteville GA) (Covington GA) (Loganville GA)

Annual Contract: 1 year w/option for 2 years IstYr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | st Yr | 2nd Yr| 3rd Yr § 1stYr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr
1. Acer rubrum Red Maple — Summer Red 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15f 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 j| 84.00 | 90.00 | 95.00 § 80.00 | "N/A" | "N/A" j 70.00 | 70.00 | 70.00 j 95.00 | 95.00 | 95.00
2. Acer buergerianum ‘Aeryn’ Trident Maple 74.75 | 82.80 | 89.70 § 60.00 | 63.00 | 66.15 § 60.00 | 65.00 | 70.00 § 80.00 | 95.00 | 95.00 § 95.00 | 95.00 | 95.00 § 110.00| 110.00 | 110.00
3. Betula nigra ‘Dura-Heat’ River Birch-Dura Heat 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15§ 60.00 | 63.00 | 66.15 § 90.00 | 100.00 | 110.00§ 50.00 | 60.00 | 65.00 § 120.00 [ 120.00 | 120.00 § 120.00 | 120.00 | 120.00
4. Cornus florida Flowering Dogwood-Cherokee Princess 74.75 | 82.80 | 89.70 § 60.00 | 63.00 | 66.15 § 65.00 | 70.00 | 75.00 § 75.00 | 85.00 | 95.00 § 95.00 | 95.00 | 95.00 No pricing provided
5. Cercis chinensis ‘Avondale’ Chinese Redbud — Avondale 80.50 | 88.55 | 97.75 J 55.00 | 57.50 | 60.00 J"No Bid"|"No Bid"|"No Bid'§ 85.00 | 90.00 | 95.00 j§ 115.00 | 115.00 | 115.00 No pricing provided
6. Chionanthus virginicus white Fringetree, Tree form 80.50 | 88.55 | 97.75 § 117.00 | 125.00 | 130.00 §"No Bid"|"No Bid"|"No Bid'§ 80.00 | 90.00 | 95.00 j 115.00| 115.00| 115.00 No pricing provided
7. Lagerstroemia indica ‘Biloxi’ Crape Myrtle, Tree Form 172.50 | 189.75 | 209.30 § 175.00 | 185.00 | 193.00 §"No Bid"|"No Bid"|“No Bid"§ 140.00 | "N/A" | "N/A" J 135.00 | 135.00 | 135.00 No pricing provided

8. Lagerstroemia indica ‘Biloxi’ Crape Myrtle, multi-stem (Pink) J§ 126.50 | 139.15 | 152.95§ 96.25 | 101.00 | 106.00 § 105.00 | 110.00 | 120.00 § 100.00 | 125.00 | 150.00 § 115.00 | 115.00 | 115.00 No pricing provided

9. Lagerstroemia indica Crape Myrtle, Tree form (White)
‘Sarah’s Favorite’

10. Lagerstroemia indica ‘Sarah’s Favorite’ Crape Myrtle, multi-
stem (White)

11. Lagerstroemia indica ‘Muskogee’ Crape Myrtle Tree Form

172.50 | 189.75 | 209.30 § 175.00 | 185.00 | 193.00 § 120.00 | 125.00 | 130.00 § 120.00 | 140.00 | 150.00 § 135.00 | 135.00 | 135.00 § 116.00 | 116.00 | 116.00

126.50 | 139.15 | 152.95f 96.25 | 101.00 | 106.00 § 105.00 | 110.00 | 120.00§ 90.00 | 120.00 | 125.00f 115.00 [ 115.00 | 115.00 § 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00

172.50 | 189.75 | 209.30 § 175.00 | 185.00 | 193.00 § 120.00 | 125.00 | 130.00 § 120.00 | 140.00 | 150.00 § 135.00 | 135.00 | 135.00 § 116.00 | 116.00 | 116.00

(Purple)
(lsgr;a;;’ers”oem'a'”d'ca Muskogee’ Crape Myrtle, multi-stem § 1,6 5| 139 15| 152.95 | 96.25 | 101.00 | 106.00 | 105.00 | 120.00 | 120.00 | 90.00 | 120.00 | 150.00 | 100.00 | 100.00 | 100.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00
13. Liriodendron tulipifera Yellow Poplar 2. 25" 110350 | 113.85 | 125.35] 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 | 75.00 | 80.00 | 85.00 | 60.00 | 65.00 | 75.00 | 100.00 | 100.00 | 100.00 | 72.00 | 72.00 | 72.00

3"-47 166.75| 184.00 | 201.25 135.00 | 145.00 | 155.00 § 125.00 | 135.00 | 140.00 § 110.00 | 150.00 | 170.00 § 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 § 175.00 | 175.00 | 175.00
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COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Trees for Planting on City Right-of-Ways (Annual Contract)
RFB No. 14-0017

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent
to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being

OCtOber 16 2013 forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award
L

recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Description/Vendor To-Mar Garden Cente Stovall & Co. John Deere Landscape] Thoms Trees & Plants Arbor Equity Moon's Tree Farm
P (Columbus, GA) (Cataula GA) (Cleveland OH) (Fayetteville GA) (Covington GA) (Loganville GA)
Annual Contract: 1 year w/option for 2 years IstYr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | st Yr | 2nd Yr| 3rd Yr § 1stYr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr

4" -5'] 258.75 | 285.20 | 313.95 205.00 | 212.00 | 225.00 § 190.00 | 200.00 | 210.00 j 150.00 | 200.00 | 225.00 § 175.00 | 175.00 | 175.00 § 256.00 | 256.00 | 256.00

5" -6 500.25 | 549.70 | 603.75§ 315.00 | 330.00 | 350.00 § 300.00 | 310.00 | 325.00 § 230.00 | 250.00 | 300.00 § 200.00 | 200.00 | 200.00 § 350.00 | 350.00 | 350.00

14. Pistacio chinensis Chinese Pistacio 69.00 | 75.90 | 83.95 § 75.00 | 82.00 | 90.00 § 70.00 | 80.00 [ 85.00 § 85.00 | 95.00 | 105.00§ 130.00| 130.00 | 130.00 § 96.00 | 96.00 | 96.00

15. Quercus phellos willow oak 15"-2" § 69.00 | 75.90 | 83.95 ) 65.00 | 69.00 | 72.00 § 75.00 | 80.00 | 85.00 § 60.00 | 70.00 | 80.00 § 105.00| 105.00| 105.004 88.00 | 88.00 | 88.00

3"-4'§ 172.50 | 189.75 | 209.30 § 150.00 | 155.00 | 165.00 j 145.00 | 150.00 | 155.00 § 195.00 | 230.00 | 300.00 § 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 No pricing provided

4" -5'§ 287.50 | 316.25 | 348.45 240.00 [ 255.00 | 275.00 § 220.00 | 225.00 | 230.00 § 200.00 | 250.00 | 325.00f 175.00 | 175.00 | 175.00 No pricing provided

5" - 6] 500.25 | 549.70 | 603.75 jj 500.00 | 525.00 | 550.00 § 315.00 | 320.00 | 325.00 § 250.00 | 300.00 | 380.00 § 215.00 | 215.00 | 215.00 No pricing provided

16. Quercus phellos ‘Wynstar’ Willow Oak 15"-2" f 7475 | 82.80 | 89.70 § 75.00 | 82.00 | 90.00 § 105.00 | 110.00 | 115.00 § 105.00 [ 105.00 | 115.00f 135.00 | 135.00 | 135.00f 96.00 | 96.00 | 96.00

3" -4 184.00 | 202.40 | 221.95§ 200.00 | 210.00 | 235.00 § 298.00 | 310.00 | 320.00 j 225.00 | 225.00 | 250.00 § 155.00 | 155.00 | 155.00 § 272.00 | 272.00 | 272.00

4" - 5'§ 316.25 | 347.30 | 381.80 j 400.00 | 425.00 | 450.00 §*No Bid"|"No Bid"|"No Bid'§ 300.00 | 350.00 | 400.00 § 225.00 | 225.00 | 225.00 No pricing provided

5"-6'| 575.00 | 632.50 | 695.75 | 600.00 | 625.00 | 635.00 §*No Bid"|"No Bid"|"No Bid‘j§ 400.00 | 500.00 | 600.00 j 250.00 | 250.00 | 250.00 No pricing provided

17. Quercus bicolor Swamp White Oak 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15f 98.00 | 105.00 | 110.00§ 80.00 | 85.00 | 90.00 § 95.00 | 105.00 | 125.00f 140.00 | 140.00 | 140.00 No pricing provided

18. Quercus laurifolia Laurel Oak 2"-25"§143.75| 158.70 | 174.80 ] 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 §"No Bid"|"No Bid"|"No Bid'j§ 105.00 | 125.00 | 130.00 § 140.00 | 140.00 | 140.00 No pricing provided

3" - 47 287.50 | 316.25 | 348.45] 135.00 | 145.00 | 155.00 § 240.00 | 250.00 | 260.00 § 190.00 | 200.00 | 250.00 § 150.00 | 150.00 | 150.00 § 220.00 | 220.00 | 220.00
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COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Trees for Planting on City Right-of-Ways (Annual Contract)
RFB No. 14-0017

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent
to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being

OCtOber 16 2013 forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award
L

recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Description/Vendor To-Mar Garden Cente Stovall & Co. John Deere Landscape] Thoms Trees & Plants Arbor Equity Moon's Tree Farm
P (Columbus, GA) (Cataula GA) (Cleveland OH) (Fayetteville GA) (Covington GA) (Loganville GA)
Annual Contract: 1 year w/option for 2 years IstYr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | st Yr | 2nd Yr| 3rd Yr § 1stYr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr

4" -5' No pricing provided 205.00 | 212.00 | 225.00 §“No Bid"|"No Bid"|"No Bid"§ 400.00 | 450.00 | 500.00 § 175.00 | 175.00 | 175.00 No pricing provided

5"-6' No pricing provided 315.00 | 330.00 | 350.00 §*No Bid"|"No Bid"|"No Bid"§ 500.00 | 600.00 | 650.00 § 225.00 | 225.00 | 225.00 No pricing provided

19. Quercus lyrata Overcup Oak 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15f 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 § 75.00 | 80.00 | 85.00 § 75.00 | 85.00 | 95.00 § 70.00 | 90.00 | 90.00 y 88.00 | 88.00 | 88.00

20. Quercus prinus Chestnut Oak 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15§ 98.00 | 105.00 [ 110.00 §*No Bid"| 95.00 | 105.00 § 110.00 | 120.00 | 125.00 § 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 § 96.00 | 96.00 | 96.00

21. Ulmus Parvifolia ‘Bosque’ Bosque Lace Bark EIm 2" -2.5'§ 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15§ 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 § 75.00 | 80.00 | 85.00 § 75.00 | 85.00 | 95.00 § 70.00 | 80.00 | 90.00 § 72.00 | 72.00 | 72.00

3"-47172.50 | 189.75 | 209.30 j 135.00 | 145.00 | 155.00 § 120.00 | 130.00 | 140.00 § 95.00 | 150.00 | 180.00 § 110.00 | 110.00 | 110.00 § 160.00 | 160.00 | 160.00

4" -5'] 287.50 | 316.25 | 348.45) 205.00 | 212.00 | 225.00 § 170.00 | 180.00 | 190.00 j 160.00 | 230.00 | 280.00 § 150.00 | 150.00 | 150.00 § 220.00 | 220.00 | 220.00

5" - 6] 500.25 | 549.70 | 603.75f 315.00 | 330.00 | 350.00 § 220.00 | 230.00 | 240.00 § 210.00 | 275.00 | 400.00 § 250.00 | 250.00 | 250.00 § 372.00 | 372.00 | 372.00

22. Magnolia grandifiora ‘D.D. Blanchard’ D.D. Blanchard 103.50 | 113.85 | 125.35 | 72.00 | 80.00 | 90.00 | 75.00 | 80.00 | 85.00 | 55.00 | 60.00 | 65.00 | 60.00 | 70.00 | 75.00 |  No pricing provided

Magnolia
23. Quercus Virginiana, Live Oak 143.75| 158.70 | 174.80 ] 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 j 100.00 | 110.00 [ 120.00 § 90.00 | 110.00 | 125.00 § 140.00 | 140.00 | 140.00 No pricing provided
24. Ulmus parvifolia “Allee” 2"-25"§103.50| 113.85| 125.35 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 J"“No Bid"|"No Bid"|"No Bid"§ 95.00 | 110.00 | 140.00 j 105.00 | 105.00 | 105.00 No pricing provided

3"-4'4161.00 | 177.10 | 194.35] 135.00 | 145.00 | 155.00 § 130.00 | 140.00 | 150.00 § "N/A" | "N/A" | "N/A" J 115.00 | 115.00 | 115.00 No pricing provided

4" - 5'§ 258.75 | 285.20 | 313.95 ] 205.00 | 212.00 | 225.00 § 200.00 | 210.00 | 220.00 § 180.00 | "N/A" | "N/A" § 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 No pricing provided

5" - 6} 460.00 | 506.00 | 556.60 § 315.00 | 330.00 | 350.00 § 300.00 | 310.00 | 320.00 § "N/A" | "N/A" | "N/A" J 200.00 | 200.00 | 215.00 No pricing provided
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COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Trees for Planting on City Right-of-Ways (Annual Contract)
RFB No. 14-0017

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent
to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being

OCtOber 16 2013 forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award
L

recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Description/Vendor To-Mar Garden Cente Stovall & Co. John Deere Landscapef] Thoms Tree§ & Plants Arb_or Equity Moon's Tr_ee Farm
(Columbus, GA) (Cataula GA) (Cleveland OH) (Fayetteville GA) (Covington GA) (Loganville GA)

Annual Contract: 1 year w/option for 2 years IstYr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | st Yr | 2nd Yr| 3rd Yr § 1stYr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr
25. Yoshino Cherry 103.50 | 113.85| 125.35 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 § 85.00 | 90.00 | 95.00 § 85.00 | 100.00| 110.00§ 105.00 | 105.00 | 105.00 No pricing provided
26. Black Gum 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15§ 105.00 | 110.00 | 115.004 90.00 | 95.00 | 105.004 80.00 | 100.00| 120.00f 115.00 [ 115.00 | 115.00f 96.00 | 96.00 | 96.00
27. Japanese Cedar 15# 80.50 | 88.55 | 97.75 | 60.00 | 63.00 | 66.15 § 65.00 | 75.00 | 85.00 § 55.00 | 60.00 | 65.00 § 130.00 | 130.00 | 130.00 No pricing provided
28. Lagerstroemia Indica Tuskegee 172.50 | 189.75 | 209.30 No pricing provided 160.00 | 175.00 | 190.00f 60.00 | 65.00 | 65.00 § 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 No pricing provided
29. Metasequoia Glyptostrobides “Dawn Redwood” 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15f 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 § 90.00 | 95.00 | 100.00§ 85.00 | 90.00 | 95.00 § 120.00 | 120.00 | 120.00 No pricing provided
30. Llex x nellie r. sgtevens “Nellie R. Stevens” 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15f 60.00 | 63.00 | 66.15 § 85.00 | 95.00 | 105.004 70.00 | 75.00 | 80.00 § 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 No pricing provided
31. Cryptomeria japonica “Cryptomeria tree form” 15" | 80.50 | 88.55 | 97.75 No pricing provided "No Bid"|"No Bid"|“No Bid"§ 60.00 | 65.00 | 70.00 § 100.00 | 100.00 | 100.00f§ 92.00 | 92.00 | 92.00

3"-47172.50| 189.75 | 209.30 No pricing provided 150.00 | 175.00 | 190.00 § 115.00 | 125.00 | 140.00 § 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 § 144.00 | 144.00 | 144.00

4" -5 460.00 | 506.00 | 556.60 § 210.00 [ 220.00 | 230.00 § 200.00 | 220.00 | 240.00 § 175.00 | 200.00 | 250.00 § 150.00 | 150.00 | 150.00 § 208.00 | 208.00 | 208.00

5" -6 632.50 | 695.75 | 764.75 275.00 | 295.00 | 310.00 § 285.00 | 315.00 | 335.00 § 225.00 | 250.00 | 310.00 § 200.00 | 225.00 | 250.00 § 480.00 | 480.00 | 480.00

32. Quercus acutissima “Sawtooth Oak” 69.00 | 75.90 | 83.95 j 60.00 | 63.00 | 66.15 § 85.00 | 90.00 [ 95.00 § 60.00 | 65.00 | 70.00 § 120.00 | 120.00 | 120.00 No pricing provided

33. Koelreuteria paniculata “Golden Rain Tree” 15" 69.00 | 75.90 | 83.95 f 75.00 | 82.00 | 90.00 § 75.00 | 80.00 | 85.00 § 85.00 | 95.00 | 125.00f 115.00 | 115.00 | 115.00 No pricing provided

2'§ 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15 95.00 | 105.00 | 112.00§ 88.00 | 95.00 | 105.00f 95.00 | 120.00 | 150.00 f 130.00 | 130.00 | 130.00 No pricing provided

34. Gymnocladus Diocus 74.75 | 82.80 | 89.70 No pricing provided No pricing provided No pricing provided No pricing provided No pricing provided
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COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Trees for Planting on City Right-of-Ways (Annual Contract)
RFB No. 14-0017

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent
to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses are being

OCtOber 16 2013 forwarded to the Project Manager, who will provide an award
L

recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Description/Vendor To-Mar Garden Cente Stovall & Co. John Deere Landscapel Thoms Trees & Plants Arbor Equity Moon's Tree Farm
P (Columbus, GA) (Cataula GA) (Cleveland OH) (Fayetteville GA) (Covington GA) (Loganville GA)
Annual Contract: 1 year w/option for 2 years IstYr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | st Yr | 2nd Yr| 3rd Yr § 1stYr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr [ 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr | 1st Yr | 2nd Yr | 3rd Yr
35. Kentucky Coffee Tree 115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15f 95.00 | 105.00 | 112.00 § 145.00 | 155.00 | 165.00 § “N/A" | "N/A"™ | "N/A" J 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 No pricing provided

36. Cercis Canadensis ‘Hearts of Gold’ Golden Eastern Redbud j 155.25 | 170.20 | 186.30 ] 90.00 | 97.50 | 105.00 j 115.00 | 120.00 | 125.00 § 120.00 | 125.00 | 135.00 § 130.00 | 130.00 | 130.00 No pricing provided

37. Halesia Carolina "Wedding Bells” Wedding Bells Carolina ¥, 3 55 | 144 90 | 158.70 | 95.00 | 105.00 | 112.00 |No Bid*{"No Bid*|"No Bid] 75.00 | 80.00 | 85.00 | 145.00| 145.00 | 145.00]  No pricing provided

Silverbell

38. Acer Palmatum ‘Glowing Embers’ Glowing Embers 180.00 | 180.00 | 180.00 A ;

Japancse Maple 230.00 | 253.00 | 278.30 | 175.00 | 195.00 | 210.00 | 155.00 [ 165.00 | 175.00 | 1700 | 125.00 | 15000 | 150-00 | 150.00 | 150.00 |  No pricing provided

de'nﬁg‘?::r;h'erarborea Autumn Briliance’ Autumn Briliance® § o, o | g5 55 | 97.75 | 75.00 | 82.00 | 90.00 | 88.00 | 95.00 | 105.00] 60.00 | 65.00 | 70.00 | 85.00 | 85.00 | 90.00 |  No pricing provided
— — —

i?égﬁteagusxacer'fo"a Morton Circle’ Exclamation!™ London ¥ o4 55 | 7590 | 83.95 | 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 | 88.00 | 95.00 | 105.00] 125.00 | 150.00 | "Nia* | 150.00 | 150.00 | 150.00]  No pricing provided

41. Sophora japonica Japanese pagoda; Chinese scholar tree 92.00 | 101.20 | 110.40f 75.00 | 82.00 | 90.00 § 95.00 | 105.00 [ 115.00§ "N/A"™ | "N/A" | "N/A" j 150.00 | 150.00 | 150.00 No pricing provided

42. Prunus x Okame Okame Cherry Tree 103.50 | 113.85 | 125.35 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 § 75.00 | 80.00 | 85.00 § 85.00 | 90.00 | 95.00 § 125.00 [ 125.00 | 125.00 No pricing provided

43. Zelkova serrata Myrimar® Zelkova 2"-3" §115.00 | 126.50 | 139.15] 80.00 | 84.00 | 88.20 § 110.00 | 120.00 | 130.00 § 95.00 | 110.00 | 120.00 § 105.00 | 105.00 | 105.00 § 100.00 | 100.00 | 100.00

3"-47 166.75| 184.00 | 201.25 135.00 | 145.00 | 155.00 § 125.00 | 130.00 | 135.00 § 130.00 | 160.00 | 190.00 § 125.00 | 125.00 | 125.00 § 160.00 | 160.00 | 160.00

4" -5 316.25 | 347.30 | 381.80 § 205.00 | 212.00 | 225.00 j 195.00 | 205.00 | 215.00 j 200.00 | 225.00 | 300.00 § 145.00 | 145.00 | 145.00 j 220.00 | 220.00 | 220.00

5" -6 517.50 | 569.25 | 626.75f 315.00 | 330.00 | 350.00 § 285.00 | 325.00 | 350.00 § 250.00 | 350.00 | 450.00 § 165.00 | 195.00 | 215.00 § 350.00 | 350.00 | 350.00

Della Lewis, CPPB
Page 5 of 5 Buyer Specialist



