COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Cargo Vans (Re-Bid)
RFB No. 13-0067

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded
during bid opening; they may include incorrect price

July 26, 2013 extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to
change if conflicting information is discovered during
analysis of the bid responses.

OPTION 1A
CARGO VAN [WITH VAN CELL] CAB & CHASSIS ONLY
—— e TOTAL PRICE
Product || Warranty || Specification
Vendors 1 | 2| 3 |[Literature]| Information Response NG Rl (1 UN|T)
Pages
Rountree Moore Chevrolet Nissan (Lake City, FL) vivivl v v v 2014 Ford E-350 S3E Van $24,984.00
2014 Econoline
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) Ford E-350 Extended $25,224.00
Benson Ford (Easley, SC) 2014 Ford E-350 Super Van $25,465.00
Allan Vigil Ford of Fayetteville (Fayetteville, GA) 2014 Ford E-350 $25,503.17
General Motors
Maxie Price Chevrolet (Loganville, GA) vIvi]* 2014 Chevrolet Express Van CG33705-3500 $26,414.00
Langdale Chevrolet (Sylvester, GA) 48404 2014 Chevrolet Express Van CG33705 $26,440.00
RBM of Atlanta (Atlanta, GA) 4404 2012 Mercedes Benz Chassis Cab 170" $32,747.95
Carl Black Chevrolet (Kennesaw, GA) vIviv NO BID
Palfleet Truck Equipment (Albany, GA) VvV NO BID

* Incomplete




COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Cargo Vans (Re-Bid)
RFB No. 13-0067

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded
during bid opening; they may include incorrect price

July 26, 2013 extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to
OPTION 1B
CARGO VAN [WITH VAN CELL] VAN CELL ONLY
— e TOTAL PRICE
Product || Warranty || Specification
Vendors 1| 2 | 3 [|[Literature]| Information Response NG Rl (1 UN|T)
Pages
Benson Ford (Easley, SC) VIivivl v v v American Aluminum IT-X2C-LR-116 $10,395.00
Rountree Moore Chevrolet Nissan (Lake City, FL) VIivivl v 4 4 American Aluminum IT-X2C-LR-116 $11,997.00
2014 American Aluminum
Maxie Price Chevrolet (Loganville, GA) VIiVI*l v v v Two Compartment Module IT-2C-LR-96 $12,058.00
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) VI vi|v Two Compartment Module IT-2C-LR-96 $12,200.60
Palfleet Truck Equipment (Albany, GA) vVIvI|vy American Aluminum IT-2C-LR-96 $12,334.62
Carl Black Chevrolet (Kennesaw, GA) vIviv NO BID
Langdale Chevrolet (Sylvester, GA) vIviv NO BID
Allan Vigil Ford of Fayetteville (Fayetteville, GA) 4404 NO BID
RBM of Atlanta (Atlanta, GA) 4404 NO BID

* Incomplete



COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Cargo Vans (Re-Bid)
RFB No. 13-0067

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded
during bid opening; they may include incorrect price

July 26, 2013 extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to
OPTION 2
CARGO VAN ONLY
ADDENDA
e TOTAL PRICE
Product || Warranty || Specification
Vendors 1| 2| 3 ||Literature]| Information Response NG T (1 UN|T)
Pages
Rountree Moore Chevrolet Nissan (Lake City, FL) VIiviv) v 4 v 2014 Ford E-350 S3E $24,984.00
2014 Econoline
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) Ford E-350 Extended $25,224.00
Allan Vigil Ford of Fayetteville (Fayetteville, GA) 2014 Ford E-350 $25,503.17
Benson Ford (Easley, SC) 2014 Ford E-350 Super Van $25,665.00
General Motors
Maxie Price Chevrolet (Loganville, GA) vIvi|* v 2014 Chevrolet Express Ext Van CG33705-3500 $26,414.00
Langdale Chevrolet (Sylvester, GA) v viv 4 2014 Chevrolet Express Van CG33705 $26,440.00
Carl Black Chevrolet (Kennesaw, GA) VIivivl * * v 2014 Chevrolet CG33705 $27,575.00
RBM of Atlanta (Atlanta, GA) ViViv| v v v 2013 Mercedes Benz Sprinter Cargo Van $41,104.00
Palfleet Truck Equipment (Albany, GA) vVIvI|vy NO BID

* Incomplete




