CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

RFB NO. 13-0043

Est Qty AMRO Jon-Don Battle & Battle Southeastern Ferguson Georgia Master mans Associated Unisource Key

Products Distributors, Inc. Paper Group Enterprises Correctional LLP Paper Worldwide Maintenance
A.CUSTODIAL CHEMICALS
1. Ammonia; Household strength 125 Cases no bid 7.80/975.00 22.22/2777.50 8.65/1081.80 no bid no bid 13.69/1711.25 11.41/1426.25 18.82/2352.50 no bid
2. Toilet Chemical; Used In Portable Toilet 6 Cases no bid no bid no bid no bid 40.00/240.00 no bid no bid 71.93/359.65 no bid 48.21/289.27
B. DETERGENTSBLEACH
1. Cascade; 6/85 o0z. 12 Cases no bid no bid 40.70/488.40 40.12/481.38 45.89/550.68 no bid 54.38/652.56 50.37/604.44 47.00/564.00 49.48/593.76
2. Bleach 6 or Whitner; 15% Chlorine 800 Cases no bid no bid 11.65/9320.00 31.52/25216.00 | 11.60/9280.00 no bid no bid 31.83/25464.00 8.74/6992.00 9.78/7824.00
3. Ivory Dishwashing Liquid; 25/12.6 oz Bottle PH:13 55 Cases no bid no bid no bid 28.86/1587.30 29.93/1646.15 no bid 35.54/1954.70 29.17/1604.35 8.74/480.00 no bid
4. Tide; 14/49 oz. 75 Cases no bid no bid 94.10/7057.50 no bid 81.38/6103.50 no bid 73.55/5516.25 85.98/6448.50 64.16/4812.00 no bid
C. DEODORIZERS
1. Carpet Deodorizer, 12 0z can 30 Cases no bid no bid 32.95/988.50 26.79/803.71 61.78/1841.40 no bid 32.07/962.10 85.65/2569.50 no bid 29.44/883.20
2. Deo Urind; Individually wrapped; 4 oz. 300 Dozen no bid 6.46/1940.00 7.45/2235.00 44.26/13278.72 9.11/2733.00 no bid 10.26/3078.00 6.90/2070.00 6.19/1857.00 9.93/2979.00
3. Deo Block Urinal Screen 100 Cases no bid 15.53/1553.00 7.60/760.00 9.26/926.02 21.78/2178.00 no bid 79.69/7969.00 12.41/1241.00 11.71/1171.00 17.08/1708.00
4. Deo Wall Blocks W/Hanger; 24 Oz. 36 Dozen no bid no bid 37.06/1334.16 99.45/3580.22 135.23/4868.28 no bid no bid 42.16/1517.76 no bid 21.49/773.64
5. Deo Toilet Bowel Hanging Urinal 100 Cases no bid no bid 7.46/746.00 113.63/11362.62 no bid no bid no bid 8.34/831.00 no bid 99.07/9907.00
6. Deo Air Freshner: Wall Plug-Ins; Glade Refills 1.34 FL. Oz 100 Cases no bid no bid no bid no bid 26.13/2613.00 no bid no bid 39.69/396.90 no bid 44.03/4403.00
7. Deo Air Freshner: Fefill for Metered Dispenser 5.3t0 7 Oz. 300 Cases no bid 34.20/10260.00 | 40.60/12180.00 33.17/9952.05 | 36.37/10911.00 no bid no bid 31.67/3167.00 18.23/5469.00 42.22/12666.00
8. Deo Air Freshener Misty Dispenser 50 Cases no bid 18.82/941.00 no bid 17.27/863.70 25.08/1254.00 no bid no bid 16.47/823.50 no bid 21.41/1070.50
9. Deo Cherry (Bid) Concentrated Liquid; 4/1 Gal 1,200 Cases no bid 21.75/26100.00 no bid 29.70/35642.88 no bid no bid no bid 50.15/60180.00 49.70/5964.00 52.80/63360.00
10. Deo Ecobreeze Liquid Air Freshener; 1 Gal 100 Cases no bid no bid no bid 48.06/4805.96 no bid no bid no bid 59.01/590.10 no bid no bid
D. DISINFECTANTS
1. Disinfectant Cleaner; w/Pure Pine Oil, Pinesol or Equal 24 Gdlon no bid 41.40/993.60 27.55/661.20 46.80/1123.20 32.80/787.20 no bid 30.66/735.84 47.27/1134.48 26.16/627.84 31.20/748.80
2. Lemon/Pine; gal, Active Ingredients 5%-Inert Ingredients 95% 1,200 Gallor} no bid no bid 15.15/18180.00 | 27.43/32917.25 | 16.67/20004.00 | 24.00/28800.00 | 24.44/29328.00 | 30.50/36600.00 18.60/2232.00 8.15/9774.00
3. Disinfectant Spray; Hospital Strength Aerosol Can 100 Cases no bid no bid 43.70/4370.00 39.77/3976.63 60.67/6067.00 no bid 95.56/9556.00 40.17/4017.00 30.00/3000.00 47.25/4725.00
4. Disinfectant Spray; Lysol or Equal 100 Cases no bid 41.43/4113.00 | 62.10/6210.00 39.77/3976.63 58.06/5806.00 no bid 84.38/8438.00 40.17/4017.00 65.83/6583.00 73.14/7314.00
5. Tub & Tile Mildew Cleaner - 4/1 Gal Per Cs 200 Cases no bid 29.36/5872.00 48.10/9620.00 25.84/5167.05 22.09/4418.00 | 21.00/4200.00 | 49.90/9980.00 26.10/5220.00 no bid 32.62/6524.00
6. Hand Sanitizer, Instant Concentrated; 4 oz 100 Cases no bid 42.41/4241.00 | 43.80/4380.00 36.62/3662.13 47.80/4780.00 no bid 50.48/5048.00 36.98/369.80 39.30/3930.00 66.00/6600.00
7. Disinfectant Cleaner; Crew, Non-Acid Concentrated 100 Cases no bid 29.36/2936.00 | 148.15/14815.00 25.84/2583.53 31.47/3147.00 | 24.00/2400.00 | 66.22/6622.00 26.10/261.00 21.34/2134.00 26.36/2636.00
E. FURNITURE POLISH
1. Pledge Lemon Scent; (Aerosol Can) 24 Cases no bid 33.39/801.30 27.89/669.36 36.13/867.17 33.10/794.40 no bid 44.47/1067.28 38.81/931.44 31.98/767.52 51.13/1227.12
2. Upholstery Cleaner Spray Can, 140z Can 10 Cases no bid no bid 134.10/1341.00 33.05/330.50 119.37/1193.70 no bid no bid 33.37/333.70 no bid 92.00/920.00
F. INSECT REPELLANT
1. Insect Repellant; Off or Equal 60 Cases no bid no bid 82.00/4920.00 46.41/2784.60 59.67/3580.20 no bid no bid 43.87/2632.20 55.79/3347.40 43.01/2580.72
2. Wasp Spray; Aerosol 12 cans per case 120 Cases no bid no bid 46.20/5544.00 35.74/4288.80 56.29/6754.80 no bid 57.35/6882.00 42.60/5112.00 45.21/5425.20 42.00/5040.00
3. Crawling & Flying Insect Spray; Aerosol 12 cans per case 120 Cases no bid no bid 64.25/7710.00 27.91/3349.20 64.39/7726.80 no bid no bid 34.33/4119.60 no bid 53.38/6405.60
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4. Fire Ant Killer; White Powdered Insecticide 200 Cases no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 6.00/1200.00
G. SOAP
1. lvory Bath Soap; 96 Bars Per Cs; 3.5 0z Size Bar 36 Cases no bid no bid no bid 31.31/1127.15 59.83/2153.88 | 46.00/1656.00 | 40.96/1474.56 65.45/2356.20 no bid 42.36/1524.96
2. Antibacterial Liquid Soap 4/1 Per Gallon 150 Cases no bid 39.85/5977.50 no bid 30.04/4506.00 30.18/4527.00 no bid 56.47/8470.50 30.34/4551.00 19.83/2974.50 54.38/8157.00
3. LavaHand Soap; Individual Pkg.; 48 Bars Per Cs 175 Cases no bid no bid 34.20/5985.00 no bid 39.08/6839.00 no bid 50.22/8788.50 41.33/7232.75 39.90/6982.50 48.62/8508.50
4. Dial Hand Soap Liquid Pump 7.5 Oz; 12 Bottles Per Case 200 Cases no bid no bid 36.05/7210.00 28.16/5632.00 25.54/5108.00 no bid 33.05/6610.00 28.35/5670.00 no bid 29.18/5836.00
5. Soap; Purell; Hand Sanitizer Refill; Size ML 24 FL Oz 200 Cases no bid no bid no bid 87.78/17556.00 no bid no bid 116.16/23232.00 | 98.67/19734.00 no bid no bid
6. Soap; Purell; 5392 Hand Sanitizer Refill for Size Dispenser 100 Cases no bid no bid no bid 55.53/5553.00 60.42/6042.00 no bid 67.75/6775.00 62.43/624.30 52.74/5274.00 56.08/5608.00
7. Soap Foam; GoJo; 5362 Antibacterial Soap Bottle Refill 100 Cases no bid no bid no bid 40.54/4054.00 46.32/4632.00 no bid 49.45/4945.00 45.56/455.60 38.50/3850.00 40.94/4094.00
8. Soap Foam; GoJo; 5361 Soap W/Skin Cond Rfill for Dispenser 100 Cases no bid no bid no bid 36.85/3685.00 41.61/4161.00 no bid 44.96/4496.00 41.43/414.30 35.00/3500.00 37.22/3722.00
9. Soap Foam; GoJo; 5161 Soap for Disp (Park Serv; Size 1250 300 Cases no bid no bid no bid 37.40/11220.00 | 42.22/12666.00 no bid 45.63/13689.00 42.07/12621.00 35.52/10656.00 37.78/11334.00
10. Soap Hand; GoJo Jar 4.5 LB 75 Cases no bid no bid no bid 74.97/5622.75 81.12/6084.00 no bid 84.80/6360.00 78.17/5862.75 no bid 70.20/5265.00
H. GLASS CLEANER
1. Glass Cleaner; Windex or Equal; 1 Qt Bottles w/Trigger 50 Cases no bid no bid 18.20/910.00 16.40/820.00 20.04/1002.00 | 16.00/800.00 | 68.02/3401.00 17.77/888.50 19.71/985.50 19.48/974.00
2. Windex; 1 Qt Bottlesw/Trigger 200 Cases no bid no bid 46.88/9376.00 16.40/3280.00 20.04/4008.00 no bid 64.48/12896.00 56.73/11346.00 46.78/9356.00 56.71/11342.00
I. MISCELLANEOUS CLEANERS
1. 409 Cleaner; 12/1 Qt Bottles W/Trigger 200 Cases no bid no bid 24.49/4898.00 24.45/4890.00 26.28/5256.00 no bid 46.34/9268.00 39.33/7866.00 33.14/6628.00 79.50/15900.00
2. All Purpose Liquid Cleaner; 409 or Equal; 12 Qts per case 12 Cases no bid no bid no bid 24.45/293.40 26.28/315.36 20.00/240.00 51.91/622.92 23.54/282.48 no bid 21.53/258.36
3. AJAX; 30; 21 oz Containers per case 150 Cases no bid no bid 19.68/2952.00 22.10/3315.00 28.78/4317.00 no bid 40.45/6067.50 23.63/3544.50 23.70/3555.00 35.24/5286.00
4. E-Z Off Oven Cleaner; Spray Cans per case 60 Cases no bid no bid 39.77/2386.20 36.00/2160.00 33.91/2034.60 no bid 40.33/2419.80 35.87/2152.20 30.91/1854.60 36.51/2190.60
5. S.O.S. Pads; 12/15 oz 15 Cases no bid no bid 32.10/481.50 33.41/501.15 37.10/556.50 no bid 42.61/639.15 38.81/582.15 no bid 34.82/522.30
6. Heavy Duty Scrubbing Pads - HD69; 10/BX; 12 dz/case 20 Cases no bid no bid 18.74/374.80 15.43/308.60 64.63/1292.60 no bid no bid 5.79/115.80 no bid 64.09/1281.80
7. Spic N Span; 27 oz. Box 150 Cases no bid no bid 80.60/12090.00 32.67/4900.50 90.85/13627.50 no bid 107.63/16144.50 | 96.63/14494.50 no bid 128.88/19332.00
8. Toilet Bowl Cleaner; Non-Acid; 12 Qts per case 150 Cases no bid 17.84/2676.00 | 21.40/3210.00 20.03/3004.50 30.09/4513.50 | 21.00/3150.00 | 28.96/4344.00 24.60/3690.00 18.26/2739.00 26.36/3954.00
9. Wash and Wax Cleaner; for Automobiles, Trucks, Etc 200 Cases no bid no bid no bid 31.32/6264.00 no bid 22.00/4400.00 no bid 35.59/7118.00 55.29/11058.00 31.69/6338.00
10. Stainless Steel Sponges (400 Series) 10 Cases no bid no bid 10.99/109.90 5.79/57.90 74.62/746.20 no bid 133.28/1332.80 89.60/890.60 no bid 12.99/129.90
11. Degreaser/Cleaner Twister Industrial Strength Caustic Cleaner 200 Cases no bid 22.26/4452.50 | 57.86/11572.00 23.49/4698.00 21.15/4230.00 | 16.00/3200.00 no bid 30.65/6130.00 29.03/5806.00 35.20/7040.00
12. Carpet Spot Remover 10 Cases no bid 33.00/3300.00 37.80/378.00 23.49/234.90 54.51/545.10 no bid no bid 31.95/319.50 34.23/342.30 39.70//397.00
13. Carpet Shampoo 36 Cases no bid 28.05/1009.80 56.68/1700.40 30.12/1084.32 53.56/1928.16 no bid no bid 44.76/1611.36 35.38/1273.68 31.00/1116.00
14. Gum Remover 4 Cases no bid 82.00/328.00 62.20/248.80 29.15/116.60 31.40/125.60 no bid 44.05/176.20 40.56/162.24 34.92/139.68 38.47/153.88
15. Oil Dry 1,200 Bags no bid no bid 20.40/24480.00 6.50/7800.00 8.52/10224.00 no bid 13.17/15804.00 4.53/5436.00 5.15/6180.00 7.90/9480.00
16. Emulsifying Degreaser 24 Cases no bid no bid no bid 29.60/710.40 86.89/2085.36 no bid no bid 28.33/679.92 26.86/644.64 42.18/1012.32
17. Armour All Trigger Sprayer - 6/CS, 28 Oz 10 Cases no bid no bid 56.40/564.00 52.42/524.20 43.75/437.50 no bid no bid 51.75/2587.50 no bid 49.29/492.90
18. Dust Mop Treatment Spray 12/Case, 18 Oz 10 Cases no bid 40.36/968.64 34.33/343.30 34.23/342.30 35.96/359.60 no bid 49.94/499.40 39.82/398.20 32.82/328.20 53.38/533.80
19. Urinal Screens 300 Cases no bid 12.94/3881.25 7.51/2253.00 9.26/2778.00 9.11/2733.00 no bid 79.69/23907.00 9.45/2835.00 48.38/14514.00 9.60/2880.00
20. Stainless Steel Cleaner; Water Based Aerosol Can 12 Per Case 20 Cases no bid 38.27/765.40 no bid 37.93/758.60 49.10/982.00 no bid 47.82/956.40 49.25/985.00 71.67/1433.40 42.99/859.80
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21. Stainless Steel Cleaner & Polish Aerosol Can 12 Per Case 20 Cases no bid 42.90/858.00 no bid 38.44/768.80 28.06/561.20 no bid 95.23/1904.60 49.25/985.00 33.65/673.00 39.10/782.00
22. Mixed Rags 400 Cases no bid no bid no bid 23.94/9576.00 14.88/5952.00 | 68.00/27200.00 | 15.53/6212.00 16.67/6668.00 no bid no bid
23. Portable Porta Potty; Style 268, 2 Level, 6.3 Gal 30 Each no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
J. FLOOR MAINTENANCE
1. 24K Floor Finish - 4/1 Gal Per Case 240 Cases | 14.50/13,920.00 | 50.66/12158.40 | 48.80/11712.00 51.23/12295.20 | 78.60/18864.00 | 44.00/10560.00 | 49.87/11968.80 42.67/10240.80 no bid 60.29/14469.60
2. Floor Finish Wax (High Gloss) - 4/1 Gal Per Case 20 Cases no bid no bid no bid 51.23/1024.60 54.85/1097.00 | 32.00/640.00 no bid 52.15/1043.00 no bid 53.96/1079.20
3. Floor Restoration - 4/1 Gal Per Case 20 Cases no bid 49.02/980.40 no bid 35.34/706.80 39.79/795.80 25.00/500.00 no bid no bid no bid 41.64/832.80
4. Floor Sedler - 4/1 Gal Per Case 20 Cases no bid no bid 66.30/1326.00 80.56/1611.20 no bid 34.00/680.00 | 57.00/1140.00 51.50/1030.00 no bid 36.72/734.40
5. Floor Stripper - (Non Ammoniated) 4/1 Gal Per Case 240 Cases no bid 49.46/11871.00 | 41.50/9960.00 39.06/9374.40 48.58/11659.20 | 32.00/7680.00 35.79/8589.60 35.73/8575.20 no bid 34.31/8234.40
6. Floor Two In One Spray Buff/Maintainer 240 cases no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
7. 24K Floor Finish - 55 Gal Drum 20 Cases no bid no bid no bid no bid 629.29/6292.90 | 499.00/4990.00 no bid 529.67/5296.70 no bid 761.61/7616.12
8. Floor Stripper - (Non Ammoniated) 55 Gal Drum 10 Drum no bid no bid no bid 620.29/6202.90 | 366.81/3668.10 | 395.00/3950.00 no bid 384.17/3841.70 no bid 360.35/3603.50

"Incomplete Bids'
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A.CUSTODIAL CHEMICALS
1. Ammonia; Household strength 125 Cases no bid 25.10/3137.50 no bid no bid 11.74/1467.50 no bid 8.13/1016.25 13.83/1728.75
2. Toilet Chemical; Used In Portable Toilet 6 Cases no bid 29.65/177.90 no bid no bid 21.87/131.22 no bid no bid 37.55/225.30
B. DETERGENTSBLEACH
1. Cascade; 6/85 o0z. 12 Cases 33.69/404.28 88.00/1056.00 no bid no bid 44.75/537.00 no bid 35.80/429.60 50.96/611.52
2. Bleach 6 or Whitner; 15% Chlorine 800 Cases no bid 13.80/11040.00 no bid 14.43/11544.00 8.50/6800.00 no bid 8.31/6648.00 no bid
3. Ivory Dishwashing Liquid; 25/12.6 oz Bottle PH:13 55 Cases 30.98/1703.90 48.00/2640.00 no bid no bid 29.93/1646.15 no bid no bid 33.30/1831.50
4. Tide; 14/49 oz. 75 Cases no bid 118.00/8850.00 no bid no bid 80.75/6056.25 no bid no bid 90.54/6790.50
C. DEODORIZERS
1. Carpet Deodorizer, 12 0z can 30 Cases | 109.98/3299.40 | 38.00/1140.00 no bid no bid 23.45/703.50 | 59.60/1788.00 no bid 37.04/1111.20
2. Deo Urind; Individually wrapped; 4 oz. 300 Dozen 4.89/1467.00 7.88/2364.00 20.32/60.96 no bid 3.14/942.00 28.10/8430.00 6.75/2025.00 8.37/2511.00
3. Deo Block Urinal Screen 100 Cases 9.98/998.00 17.98/1798.00 | 28.90/2890.00 no bid 8.26/826.00 29.76/2976.00 9.94/994.00 15.05/1505.00
4. Deo Wall Blocks W/Hanger; 24 Oz. 36 Dozen 40.98/1475.28 23.40/842.40 no bid no bid 37.85/1362.60 | 93.93/3381.48 | 41.60/1497.60 51.12/1840.00
5. Deo Toilet Bowel Hanging Urinal 100 Cases 5.98/598.00 8.48/848.00 no bid no bid 7.18/718.00 no bid 10.15/1015.00 | 118.73/11873.00
6. Deo Air Freshner: Wall Plug-Ins; Glade Refills 1.34 FL. Oz 100 Cases no bid 21.00/2100.00 no bid no bid 45.75/4575.00 no bid no bid no bid
7. Deo Air Freshner: Fefill for Metered Dispenser 5.3t0 7 Oz. 300 Cases | 29.98/8994.00 | 49.40/14820.00 no bid no bid 26.25/7875.00 | 84.25/25275.00 no bid 60.00/18000.00
8. Deo Air Freshener Misty Dispenser 50 Cases 77.94/3897.00 25.10/1255.00 no bid no bid 18.28/914.00 | 55.28/2764.00 no bid no bid
9. Deo Cherry (Bid) Concentrated Liquid; 4/1 Gal 1,200 Cases no bid 29.65/35580.00 no bid no bid 20.69/24828.00 | 80.60/96720.00 | 31.40/37680.00 no bid
10. Deo Ecobreeze Liquid Air Freshener; 1 Gal 100 Cases no bid 37.80/3780.00 no bid no bid 133.42/13342.00 no bid 39.26/3926.00 no bid
D. DISINFECTANTS
1. Disinfectant Cleaner; w/Pure Pine Oil, Pinesol or Equal 24 Gdlon no bid 31.80/763.20 no bid 33.93/814.32 25.12/602.88 70.48/1691.52 30.23/725.52 33.84/812.16
2. Lemon/Ping; gal, Active Ingredients 5%-Inert Ingredients 95% 1,200 Gallon no bid 27.88/33456.00 no bid no bid 21.44/25728.00 | 70.48/84576.00 | 18.21/21852.00 33.84/40608.00
3. Disinfectant Spray; Hospital Strength Aerosol Can 100 Cases 21.98/2198.00 38.76/3876.00 no bid no bid 19.10/1910.00 | 88.54/8854.00 | 26.79/2679.00 58.30/5830.00
4. Disinfectant Spray; Lysol or Equal 100 Cases | 70.98/7.98.00 58.70/5870.00 no bid no bid 64.56/6456.00 no bid 71.25/7125.00 81.45/8145.00
5. Tub & Tile Mildew Cleaner - 4/1 Gal Per Cs 200 Cases no bid 32.80/6560.00 no bid no bid 22.06/4412.00 | 58.34/11668.00 | 29.58/5916.00 47.09/9718.00
6. Hand Sanitizer, Instant Concentrated; 4 oz 100 Cases | 42.96/4296.00 44.38/4438.00 no bid 34.56/3456.00 37.30/3730.00 no bid 39.91/3991.00 50.39/5039.00
7. Disinfectant Cleaner; Crew, Non-Acid Concentrated 100 Cases no bid 47.80/4780.00 no bid no bid 16.35/1635.00 | 57.36/5736.00 | 33.40/3340.00 98.66/9866.00
E. FURNITURE POLISH
1. Pledge Lemon Scent; (Aerosol Can) 24 Cases 25.29/606.96 34.90/837.60 no bid 83.52/2004.48 22.15/531.60 74.72/1793.28 | 46.91/1125.84 36.17/868.08
2. Upholstery Cleaner Spray Can, 140z Can 10 Cases 30.89/308.90 47.60/476.00 no bid no bid 31.98/316.80 81.17/811.70 42.11/421.10 no bid
F. INSECT REPELLANT
1. Insect Repellant; Off or Equal 60 Cases 68.85/4131.00 98.00/5880.00 no bid 75.84/4550.40 41.25/247.50 | 34.46/2067.60 | 64.60/3876.00 70.10/4200.00
2. Wasp Spray; Aerosol 12 cans per case 120 Cases 35.98/4317.60 44.48/5337.60 no bid 58.92/7070.40 31.10/3732.00 | 89.40/10728.00 | 44.46/5335.20 62.50/7500.00
3. Crawling & Flying Insect Spray; Aerosol 12 cans per case 120 Cases | 33.98/4077.60 44.48/5337.60 no bid 91.44/10972.80 | 29.33/4719.60 | 96.35/11562.00 | 42.44/5092.80 59.95/7194.00
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4. Fire Ant Killer; White Powdered Insecticide 200 Cases no bid 44.00/8800.00 no bid no bid 242.11/48422.00| 68.19/13638.00 no bid no bid
G. SOAP
1. lvory Bath Soap; 96 Bars Per Cs; 3.5 0z Size Bar 36 Cases 34.15/1229.40 47.80/1720.80 no bid no bid 33.36/1200.96 no bid 47.86/1722.96 38.40/1382.40
2. Antibacterial Liquid Soap 4/1 Per Gallon 150 Cases | 24.98/3771.98 33.30/4995.00 no bid no bid 42.10/6315.00 | 72.00/10800.00 | 45.85/6877.50 50.17/7525.50
3. LavaHand Soap; Individual Pkg.; 48 Bars Per Cs 175 Cases 40.69/7120.75 53.10/9292.50 no bid 41.28/7224.00 37.70/6597.50 |110.74/19379.50| 43.81/7666.75 44.81/7840.00
4. Dial Hand Soap Liquid Pump 7.5 Oz; 12 Bottles Per Case 200 Cases | 15.48/3096.00 39.65/7930.00 no bid no bid 24.05/4810.00 | 77.39/15478.00 | 26.83/5366.00 29.36/5872.00
5. Soap; Purell; Hand Sanitizer Refill; Size ML 24 FL Oz 200 Cases 17.94/3588.00 |108.00/21600.00 no bid no bid 79.20/15840.00 no bid no bid 59.22/11844.00
6. Soap; Purell; 5392 Hand Sanitizer Refill for Size Dispenser 100 Cases | 79.98/7998.00 98.00/9800.00 | 84.32/4216.00 60.30/6030.00 50.07/5007.00 no hid 53.56//5356.00 67.63/6763.00
7. Soap Foam; GoJo; 5362 Antibacterial Soap Bottle Refill 100 Cases 60.98/6098.00 68.00/6800.00 59.88/5988.00 43.96/4396.00 36.53/3653.00 no bid 39.10/3910.00 49.36/4936.00
8. Soap Foam; GoJo; 5361 Soap W/Skin Cond Rfill for Dispenser 100 Cases | 56.98/5698.00 58.00/5800.00 | 75.48/5057.16 41.56/4156.00 33.23/3323.00 no bid 35.50/3555.00 44.88/4488.00
9. Soap Foam; GoJo; 5161 Soap for Disp (Park Serv; Size 1250 300 Cases | 55.95/16785.00 | 68.00/20400.00 | 61.50/18450.00 39.30/11790.00 | 33.70/10110.00 no bid 36.08/10824.00 45.84/13752.00
10. Soap Hand; GoJo Jar 4.5 LB 75 Cases | 138.95/10421.25 | 88.00/6600.00 no bid 66.78/5008.50 67.65/5073.75 no bid 80.45/6033.75 84.65/6348.75
H. GLASS CLEANER
1. Glass Cleaner; Windex or Equal; 1 Qt Bottles w/Trigger 50 Cases no bid 20.90/1045.00 no bid 44.28/2214.00 22.63/1131.50 | 32.91/1960.50 16.86/843.00 23.04/1152.00
2. Windex; 1 Qt Bottlesw/Trigger 200 Cases | 50.98/10196.00 38.80/7760.00 no bid 65.28/13056.00 46.18/9236.00 no bid 52.70/10540.00 58.75/11750.00
I. MISCELLANEOUS CLEANERS
1. 409 Cleaner; 12/1 Qt Bottles W/Trigger 200 Cases 43.98/8796.00 45.60/9120.00 no bid 68.64/13728.00 34.45/6890.00 no bid 36.45/7290.00 40.71/8142.00
2. All Purpose Liquid Cleaner; 409 or Equal; 12 Qts per case 12 Cases no bid 36.00/432.00 no bid 55.56/666.72 22.28/267.36 69.88/838.56 25.21/302.52 40.71/488.52
3. AJAX; 30; 21 oz Containers per case 150 Cases 28.98/4347.00 26.10/3915.00 no bid 39.04/5856.00 19.95/2992.50 | 72.88/10932.00 | 25.10/3765.00 36.55/5482.50
4. E-Z Off Oven Cleaner; Spray Cans per case 60 Cases 26.98/1618.80 21.30/1278.00 no bid 37.80/2268.00 21.05/1263.00 | 77.26/4635.60 | 29.11/1746.60 36.60/2196.00
5. S.O.S. Pads; 12/15 oz 15 Cases 23.95/359.25 42.00/630.00 no bid 45.87/688.05 42.79/641.85 no bid 35.85/537.75 40.19/602.85
6. Heavy Duty Scrubbing Pads - HD69; 10/BX; 12 dz/case 20 Cases 13.95/279.00 19.80/396.00 no bid 42.60/852.00 16.82/336.40 45.65/913.00 4.69/93.80 no bid
7. Spic N Span; 27 oz. Box 150 Cases | 81.98/12297.00 | 89.00/13350.00 no bid no bid 89.10/13365.00 no bid 75.67/11350.50 | 100.88/15132.00
8. Toilet Bowl Cleaner; Non-Acid; 12 Qts per case 150 Cases no bid 28.00/4200.00 no bid 32.40/4860.00 19.73/2959.50 | 65.92/988.00 16.05/2407.50 36.58/5487.00
9. Wash and Wax Cleaner; for Automobiles, Trucks, Etc 200 Cases no bid 39.88/7976.00 no bid no bid 21.71/4342.00 | 78.12/15624.00 | 27.33/5466.00 no bid
10. Stainless Steel Sponges (400 Series) 10 Cases 24.98/249.80 138.00/1380.00 no bid no bid 18.13/181.30 no bid 26.01/260.10 no bid
11. Degreaser/Cleaner Twister Industrial Strength Caustic Cleaner 200 Cases no bid 43.20/8640.00 no bid no bid 19.99/3998.00 | 58.80/11760.00 | 22.90/4580.00 no bid
12. Carpet Spot Remover 10 Cases 31.98/319.80 72.00/720.00 no bid 40.80/408.00 34.45/344.50 54.30/543.00 22.14/221.40 no bid
13. Carpet Shampoo 36 Cases no bid 52.60/1893.60 no bid 55.76/2007.36 24.99/899.64 65.52/2358.72 32.89/1184.04 no bid
14. Gum Remover 4 Cases 24.98/99.92 47.80/191.20 no bid 51.48/205.92 17.85/71.40 158.83/635.32 31.83/127.32 no bid
15. Oil Dry 1,200 Bags no bid no bid no bid 6.63/7956.00 3.79/4548.00 no bid no bid no bid
16. Emulsifying Degreaser 24 Cases no bid 37.80/907.20 no bid no bid 18.01/432.24 | 210.57/5053.68 | 20.38/489.12 no bid
17. Armour All Trigger Sprayer - 6/CS, 28 Oz 10 Cases no bid 89.00/890.00 no bid 56.94/569.40 no bid 23.94/239.40 66.93/669.30 54.20/542.00
18. Dust Mop Treatment Spray 12/Case, 18 Oz 10 Cases 27.98/279.80 38.70/387.00 no bid 45.24/452.40 21.50/215.00 77.51775.10 37.61/376.10 43.39/433.90
19. Urinal Screens 300 Cases 8.99/2697.00 69.54/20862.00 no bid 12.47/3741.00 7.90/2370.00 29.76/8928.00 9.94/2982.00 10.72/
20. Stainless Steel Cleaner; Water Based Aerosol Can 12 Per Case 20 Cases 37.98/759.80 38.60/772.00 no bid no bid 20.50/410.00 | 70.40/1408.00 | 41.30/826.00 54.41/1088.20
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21. Stainless Steel Cleaner & Polish Aerosol Can 12 Per Case 20 Cases 29.98/599.60 47.80/956.00 no bid 45.36/907.20 20.50/410.00 90.81/1816.20 36.67/733.40 66.56/1331.20
22. Mixed Rags 400 Cases no bid 15.80/6320.00 no bid 18.01/7204.00 21.55/8620.00 |111.50/44600.00| 29.06/11624.00 no bid

23. Portable Porta Potty; Style 268, 2 Level, 6.3 Gal 30 Each no bid no bid no bid no bid 95.00/2850.00 no bid no bid 110.08/3302.40
J. FLOOR MAINTENANCE

1. 24K Floor Finish - 4/1 Gal Per Case 240 Cases no bid 78.00/18720.00 no bid 72.80/17472.00 35.80/8592.00 | 84.72/20332.80 | 36.87/8848.80 no bid

2. Floor Finish Wax (High Gloss) - 4/1 Gal Per Case 20 Cases no bid 59.40/1188.00 no bid 72.80/1456.00 41.70/834.00 | 86.36/1727.20 | 48.33/966.60 no bid

3. Floor Restoration - 4/1 Gal Per Case 20 Cases no bid 45.80/916.00 no bid 60.24/1204.80 27.99/559.80 79.08/1581.60 36.71/734.20 no bid

4. Floor Sedler - 4/1 Gal Per Case 20 Cases no bid 68.90/1378.00 no bid 72.96/1459.20 21.83/436.60 | 84.40/1688.00 | 32.96/659.20 no bid

5. Floor Stripper - (Non Ammoniated) 4/1 Gal Per Case 240 Cases no bid 48.80/11712.00 no bid 53.92/12940.80 22.64/5433.60 | 68.72/16492.80 | 27.70/6648.00 no bid

6. Floor Two In One Spray Buff/Maintainer 240 cases no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

7. 24K Floor Finish - 55 Gal Drum 20 Cases no bid 907.50/9075.00 no bid 775.40/7754.00 | 389.31/3893.10 [1184.15/11841.50 474.70/4747.00 no bid

8. Floor Stripper - (Non Ammoniated) 55 Gal Drum 10 Drum no bid 660.00/6600.00 no bid 791.47/7914.70 | 229.47/2294.70 | 828.30/8283.00 | 329.35/3293.50 no bid

"Incomplete Bids'




