COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT Various Vehicles

RFB No. 13-0027

January 23, 2013

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

	OPTION 1: 1/2-TON CREW CAB, 4x4 PICKUP TRUCK											
	Addendum No. One	Product Literature	Warranty Information	Response Pages	Manufacturer/Make/Model	UNIT COST						
Hardy Family Ford (Dallas, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	2013 Ford F150 (W1E)	\$25,665.00						
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	2013 Ford F150	\$25,688.00						
Team Ford (Marietta, GA)	· 🗸	✓	✓	✓	2013 Ford F150	\$25,794.00						
Carl Black Buick Pontiac GMC (Kennesaw, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	GMC CK10543 4x4 Crew 2013 GMC Sierra 1500	\$28,149.00						
Jerry Kelley GMC Inc (Adel, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	2013 GMC/Sierra/TK10543	\$28,528.00						
Team Chevrolet (Alpharetta, GA)	✓			NO BID								
Knapheide Truck Equipment - Midsouth (Griffin, GA)	✓			NO BID								
Wade Ford Inc (Smyrna, GA)	✓			NO BID								
Fransport Equipment Co., Inc. Albany, GA)	✓			NO BID								
rans Power, Inc. (Albany, GA)	✓			NO BID								
Hardy Chevrolet (Dallas, GA)	✓			NO BID								

"NO BID" RESPONSES:	
Carolina Trailers & Equipment	
Yancey Truck Centers	
Brannen Motor Company	

* Incomplete Bid

O:\Sandra Chandler\Tabulations\FY13\RFBs\Various Vehicles.xls

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

Various Vehicles RFB No. 13-0027

January 23, 2013

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

	0	PTION 2: CHEVI	ROLET TAHOE, 2W	D, POLICE PURSUIT	VEHICLE (PPV)		
	Addendum No. One	Product Literature	Warranty Information	Response Pages	Manufacturer/Make/Model	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST (4 UNITS)
Hardy Chevrolet (Dallas, GA)	✓	✓	√	✓	2013 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV (CC10706)	\$26,811.00	\$107,244.00
Team Chevrolet (Alpharetta, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	2013 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV	\$27,420.00	\$109,680.00
Carl Black Buick Pontiac GMC (Kennesaw, GA)	✓	√	. ✓	√	Chevrolet CC10706 PPV 2013 Chevrolet Tahoe	\$27,459.00	\$109,836.00
Knapheide Truck Equipment - Midsouth (Griffin, GA)	√			NO BI	D		
Wade Ford Inc (Smyrna, GA)	✓			NO BI	D		
Transport Equipment Co., Inc. (Albany, GA)	√			NO BI	D		
Trans Power, Inc. (Albany, GA)	✓			NO BI	D		
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA)	✓			NO BI	D		
Team Ford (Marietta, GA)	✓			NO BI	D		
Hardy Family Ford (Dallas, GA)	✓		2 San Million	NO BI	D		
Jerry Kelley GMC Inc (Adel, GA)	./			NO BI			

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT Various Vehicles

RFB No. 13-0027

January 23, 2013

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

OPTION 3: FULL-SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE 2WD										
	Addendum No. One	Product Literature	Warranty Information	Response Pages	Manufacturer/Make/Model	UNIT COST				
Wade Ford Inc (Smyrna, GA)	√	✓	✓	✓	2013 Ford Expedition	\$26,158.00				
Hardy Family Ford (Dallas, GA)	√	✓	✓	✓	2013 Ford Expedition (U1F)	\$26,231.00				
Team Ford (Marietta, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	2013 Ford Expedition (U1F)	\$26,350.00				
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA)	✓	√	✓	✓	2013 Ford Expedition	\$26,797.00				
Carl Black Buick Pontiac GMC (Kennesaw, GA)	√	√	✓	✓	Chevrolet Tahoe CC10706 2013 Chevrolet Tahoe	\$30,966.00				
Team Chevrolet (Alpharetta, GA)	✓	✓	√	✓	2013 Chevrolet Tahoe (1FL)	\$31,216.00				
Hardy Chevrolet (Dallas, GA)	√	✓	√	√	2013 Chevrolet Tahoe, CC10706	\$31,254.00				
Jerry Kelley GMC Inc (Adel, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	2013 GMC/Yukon/TC10706	\$32,866.00				
Knapheide Truck Equipment - Midsouth (Griffin, GA)	√			NO BID						
Transport Equipment Co., Inc. (Albany, GA)	√			NO BID						
Trans Power, Inc. (Albany, GA)	✓			NO BID		10 mg				

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT Various Vehicles RFB No. 13-0027

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

					January 23	, 2013						
OPTION 4: FLATBED DUMP TRUCK												
SUBMISSION Add. REQUIREMENTS 1	Add			CAB	OPTION A: AND CHASSIS ONI	X	OPTION B: BODY ONLY					OPTION C: Complete Unit
	1	Product Literature	Warranty Information	REVISED Response Pages	Manufacturer/ Make/Model	UNIT COST	Product Literature	Warranty Information	REVISED Response Pages	Manufacturer/ Make/Model	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
Fransport Equipment Co., nc. (Albany, GA)	. 🗸			NO BID		NO BID	√	√	✓	Transport Equipment Co. 10/96 FBD	\$7,799.00	NO BID
Feam Ford (Marietta, GA)	√	✓	√	✓	2013 Ford F350 Crew Cab (W3G)	\$24,120.00	✓	*	✓	Knapheide PVMXS-103C	\$9,200.00	NO BID
llan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA)	√	✓	· 🗸	√	2013 Ford F350	\$24,489.00	*	✓	✓	Smyrna Truck / STC-10PV	\$7,980.00	\$32,469.00
Vade Ford Inc (Smyrna, GA)	✓	√	✓	√	2013 Ford F350	\$24,684.00			,	NO BID		NO BID
Frans Power, Inc. Albany, GA)	√	√	√	√	2013 Ford F350 XL	\$25,260,00				NO BID		NO BID

SUBMISSION REQUIREMENTS	Add. 1	CAB AND CHASSIS ONLY					BODY ONLY					Complete Unit	
		Product Literature	Warranty Information	REVISED Response Pages	Manufacturer/ Make/Model	UNIT COST	Product Literature	Warranty Information	REVISED Response Pages	Manufacturer/ Make/Model	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	
Transport Equipment Co., Inc. (Albany, GA)	· 🗸			NO BID		NO BID	√	√	✓	Transport Equipment Co. 10/96 FBD	\$7,799.00	NO BID	
Feam Ford (Marietta, GA)	√	✓	✓	✓	2013 Ford F350 Crew Cab (W3G)	\$24,120.00		*	/	Knapheide PVMXS-103C	\$9,200.00	NO BID	
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA)	√	✓	. 1	√	2013 Ford F350	\$24,489.00	*	1	/	Smyrna Truck / STC-10PV	\$7,980.00	\$32,469.00	
Wade Ford Inc (Smyrna, GA)	√	√	✓	1	2013 Ford F350	\$24,684.00				NO BID		NO BID	
Trans Power, Inc. (Albany, GA)	✓	✓.	√	√	2013 Ford F350 XL	\$25,260.00	NO BID				NO BID		
Jerry Kelley GMC Inc. Adel, GA)	√	√	✓	✓	2013 GMC / Sierra / TC31043	\$28,349.00		*	√	Knapheide PVMXS-103C	NO BID	\$36,454.49	
Carl Black Buick Pontiac GMC (Kennesaw, GA)	√	· ·	✓	✓	CC31403 Crew Cab Chassis 2013 Chevrolet Silverado 3500HD	NO BID	✓	✓	· ·	ITE 1096 FBD	\$8,570.00	\$33,969.00	
(napheide Truck Equip. Midsouth (Griffin, GA)	✓				NO BID		~	*		PVMX-103C	\$8,105.49	NO BID	
eam Chevrolet Alpharetta, GA)	√						N O	BID					
Hardy Family Ford Dallas, GA)	√						N O	BID					
Hardy Chevrolet (Dallas, GA)	✓						N O	BID					