
BID TABULATION SHEET 
RFB No.          13-0015 
RFB Name:     Service Contract for Various Types of Transmission (Annual Contract) 
Date:               September 26, 2012 

 
DESCRIPTION/VENDOR 

 
Jasper Engines & 

Transmission 

(Jasper, IN) 

 
W.W. Williams 

(Atlanta, GA) 

 
Reliable 

Transmission 
Service, Inc. 

(Conley, GA) 

 
*Yancey Truck 

Centers 

(Austell, GA) 

 
A. FIELD SERVICE 

 
 

 
 

  

 
TRANSMISSION 

 
 

 
 

  

 
E40D Transmission 

 
 

 
 

  

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
2. MT643 Transmission 

 
 

 
 

  

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
No Bid 

 
$112.00 

 
$85.00 

 
No Bid 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
No Bid 

 
$2.00 

 
$1.50 

 
No Bid 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
No Bid 

 
$112.00 

 
$85.00 

 
No Bid 

 
3. ZF 6 HP Transmission 

 
 

 
 

  

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
4. B400R Transmission 

 
 

 
 

  

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
No Bid 

 
$112.00 

 
$85.00 

 
No Bid 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
No Bid 

 
$2.00 

 
$1.500 

 
No Bid 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
No Bid 

 
$112.00 

 
$85.00 

 
No Bid 

 
5. Allison Series 2100/2200 
Transmission 

 
 

 
 

  

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

No Bid  
$112.00 

 
$85.00 

 
No Bid 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

No Bid  
$2.00 

 
$1.50 

 
No Bid 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

No Bid  
$112.00 

 
$85.00 

 
No Bid 

 
6. ALLISON B300R 
TRANSMISSION 

 
 

 
 

  

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

No Bid  
$112.00 

 
$85.00 

 
No Bid 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

No Bid  
$2.00 

 
$1.50 

 
No Bid 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

No Bid  
$112.00 

 
$85.00 

 
No Bid 

 
B. EXCHANGE PRICES 

 
 

 
 

  

 
1. E40D 

 
$1,806.00 

 
$2,345.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$2,420.00 

 
2. MT643 

 
$2,777.00 

 
$2,137.00 

 
$1,995.00 

 
$3,300.00 

 
3. ZF 6 HP 592 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
4. B400R 

 
$5,135.00 

 
$4,230.00 

 
$3,574.00 

 
$9,200.00 

 
5. ALLISON SERIES 
2100/2200 

 
$2,309.00 

 
$2,305.00 

 
$2,195.00 

 
$3,550.00 

 
6. ALLISON B300R 

 
$5,135.00 

 
$4,230.00 

 
$3,574.00 

 
$8,200.00 



BID TABULATION SHEET 
RFB No.          13-0015 
RFB Name:     Service Contract for Various Types of Transmission (Annual Contract) 
Date:               September 26, 2012 

 
DESCRIPTION/VENDOR 

 
Jasper Engines & 

Transmission 

(Jasper, IN) 

 
W.W. Williams 

(Atlanta, GA) 

 
Reliable 

Transmission 
Service, Inc. 

(Conley, GA) 

 
*Yancey Truck 

Centers 

(Austell, GA) 

 
C. LABOR CHARGES: 

 
 

 
 

  

 
1. E40D 

 
 

 
 

  

 
FLAT RATE HOURLY 

 
Included In Cost 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
NA 

 
REBUILD TIME 

 
Included In Cost 

No Bid  
No Bid 

 
NA 

 
VALVE BODY & GOVERNOR 
TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

No Bid  
No Bid 

 
NA 

 
DYNO TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

No Bid  
No Bid 

 
NA 

 
2. MT643 

 
 

 
 

  

 
FLAT RATE HOURLY 

 
Included In Cost 

$109.00  
$85.00 

 
NA 

 
REBUILD TIME 

 
Included In Cost 

14  
10.4 

 
NA 

 
VALVE BODY & GOVERNOR 
TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

3  
$85.00 

 
NA 

 
DYNO TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

1.5  
$127.50 

 
NA 

 
3. ZF 6 HP595 

 
 

 
 

  

 
FLAT RATE HOURLY 

 
Included In Cost 

No Bid No Bid  
NA 

 
REBUILD TIME 

Included In Cost No Bid No Bid  
NA 

 
VALVE BODY & GOVERNOR 
TEST 

Included In Cost No Bid No Bid  
NA 

 
DYNO TEST 

Included In Cost No Bid No Bid  
NA 

 
4. B400R 

 
 

 
 

  

 
FLAT RATE HOURLY 

 
Included In Cost 

$109.00  
$85.00 

 
NA 

 
REBUILD TIME 

 
Included In Cost 

16  
10.4 

 
NA 

 
VALVE BODY & GOVERNOR 
TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

NA  
NA 

 
NA 

 
DYNO TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

1.5  
$127.00 

 
NA 

 
5. ALLISON SERIES: 
2100/2200 

 
 

 
 

  

 
FLAT RATE HOURLY 

 
Included In Cost 

$109.00  
$85.00 

 
NA 

 
REBUILD TIME 

 
Included In Cost 

10  
10.4 

 
NA 

 
VALVE BODY & GOVERNOR 
TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

NA  
NA 

 
NA 

 
DYNO TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

1.5  
$127.00 

 
NA 

 
6. ALLISON B300R 

 
 

 
 

  

 
FLAT RATE HOURLY 

 
Included In Cost 

$109.00  
$85.00 

 
NA 

 
REBUILD TIME 

 
Included In Cost 

16  
10.4 

 
NA 

 
VALVE BODY & GOVERNOR 
TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

NA  
NA 

 
NA 

 
DYNO TEST 

 
Included In Cost 

1.5  
$127.50 

 
NA 



BID TABULATION SHEET 
RFB No.          13-0015 
RFB Name:     Service Contract for Various Types of Transmission (Annual Contract) 
Date:               September 26, 2012 

 
DESCRIPTION/VENDOR 

 
Jasper Engines & 

Transmission 

(Jasper, IN) 

 
W.W. Williams 

(Atlanta, GA) 

 
Reliable 

Transmission 
Service, Inc. 

(Conley, GA) 

 
*Yancey Truck 

Centers 

(Austell, GA) 

 
D. PARTS: 

 
 

 
 

  

 
% DEDUCTED FROM LIST 
PRICE 

 
13-20% 

 
0% 

 
 

10% 
 
 

Enclosed 

 
E. WARRANTY: 

 
 

 
 

  

 
1. STATE WARRANTY 

 
 

 
 

  

 
E40D 

 
Yes 

 
Yes 

 
 

No 
 
 

Yes 
 
MT643 

 
Yes 

 
Yes 

 
 

Yes 
 
 

Yes 
 
ZF 6 HP 592 

 
Yes 

 
No Bid 

 
 

No 
 
 

No Bid 
 
B400R 

 
Yes 

Yes Yes Yes 

 
ALLISON SERIES: 2100/2200 

 
Yes 

Yes Yes Yes 

 
ALLISON B300R 

 
Yes 

Yes Yes Yes 

 
Delivery will be made 
within_____ days after receipt of 
notice to proceed. 

 
3-7 Days 

 
7 Days 

 
 

5 Days 
 
 

72 Days 

*Denote – Vendor bid is incomplete. 
 
 


