COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
COMMERCIAL KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR MUSCOGEE COUNTY PRISON
RFB NO. 13-0010

August 22, 2012

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to
award to a particular vendor. Copies of bid submittals are being
forwarded to the using department, who will provide an award
recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Description Douglas Equipment Eqsutirpa/tSeS;I)(;Iy Nogg&lig:;(;rte & Wasserstrom Co. | Bakery Equipment Cooks Direct S;f;téjgsli AtlantaSZ:;(;ures &
(Bluefield WV) (Albany GA) (Grovetown GA) (Columbus OH) (Richmond, CA) (Warrenville IL) (Detroit M) (Atlanta GA)
LBC Baker LBC Bake LBC Baker LBC Baker
Proposed Product Revent 724 U-G Equipment LRO-2G Equipment LRO-2G-N | Equipment LRO-2G | Equipment LRO-2G Baxter OV500G2
Option 1 )
Double Rack Gas Oven |Bid Amount 28,619.00 24,868.20 32,800.00 25,662.06 26,488.00 24,228.61
LBC BakerSeries LRO-2G No Bid No Bid
( axer e”es 25 [optional Installation 3,000.00 3,024.00 12,500.00 3,326.40 3,000.00 3,070.00
or equa
Option LED Display No Bid "Included” 1,200.00 Left blank 0.00 "N/A"
Optinoal Double Rack No Bid 495.33 675.00 606.90 410.00 707.86
Proposed Product MagiKitch'n MagiKitch'n MagiKitch'n MagiKitch'n MagiKitch'n MagiKitch'n MagiKitch'n
P FM-RMB-660 FM-RMB-660 FM-RMB-660 FM-RMB-660 FM-RMB-660 FM-RMB-660CR FM-RMB-660
Bid Amount 5,775.00 6,305.62 6,800.00 5,093.50 5,716.00 7,238.00 4,685.59
Optional Installation No Bid 350.00 600.00 Left blank 200.00 2,000.00 359.00
Option 2
Floor ?:harbroiler Optional Lower Rack 490.00 486.45 590.00 437.33 495.00 550.00 402.30
MagiKitch'n FM-RMB-660 No Bid
(MagiKi %rgqua]) “65Y | optional Conversion Kit 262.00 583.11 598.00 Left blank 654.00 600.00 458.13
Optional Top Grid 202.00 200.54 660.00 540.87 615.00 844.00 497.55
Optional Scround Rod 202.00 200.54 660.00 540.87 615.00 220.00 497.55
Optional 6" Cast Iron Grids 844.00 837.88 944.00 2,259.81 860.00 220.00 692.95
Optional Serivce Shelf 495.00 491.41 615.00 441.79 0.00 "Priced Above" 406.41
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COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
COMMERCIAL KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR MUSCOGEE COUNTY PRISON

August 22, 2012

RFB NO. 13-0010

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to
award to a particular vendor. Copies of bid submittals are being
forwarded to the using department, who will provide an award
recommendation for approval by Columbus Council.

Description Douglas Equipment EqSLJtiI;)ZEl/tS‘ES;I)(;Iy Nogﬂi;)](;rte & Wasserstrom Co. | Bakery Equipment Cooks Direct S;f;tsl'jgs; AtlantaSZ:;(;ures &
(Bluefield WV) (Albany GA) (Grovetown GA) (Columbus OH) (Richmond, CA) (Warrenville IL) (Detroit M) (Atlanta GA)
- Hobart Hobart HL662-1 Hobart
option 3 Proposed Product VariMixer W60A Hobart HL662 Hobart HL662 HL662 + Buildup Hobart HL662 (STD, STDDEL) HL662+Buildup Hobart HL662
Pizza Mixer Bid Amount 10,799.00 14,449.70 13,850.00 12,249.22 13,397.58 12,799.00 15,760.00 10,613.89
(Hobart HL662 Legacy or 'd Amoun e I g 1£49. woI1. 199, ,760. ,613.
equal) Optional Stand. Accessory 1,306.00 14,449.70 1,180.00 956.26 1,703.00 996.00 1,200.00 800.57
Optional Deluxe Accessory 1,665.00 14,878.14 1,680.00 1,225.73 1,891.00 1,280.00 1,700.00 1,026.16

NOTES:

Norvell Fixture: "Installation - Provided all required utilities are within 4'."

Atlanta Fixtures & Sales: Floor Charbroiler Service Shelf without towel bar - 8"

Bakery Equipment: Double Rack Gas Oven - Provided additional $200 price for USB Port and PC Programming Software
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