COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
RFB No. 12-0056 / 8-Yard Refuse Collection Trucks
Option 1. Cab & Chassis Only

June 13, 2012

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as
recorded during bid opening; they may include
incorrect price extensions or transcription
errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the
bid responses.

Submission Requirements

Add

OPTION 1: Cab & Chassis Only

REVISED

G | viamatn | Repore Manufacturer / Make / Model Unit Price To(tfjnf’tgce
pesch State FrdATL L (Noteros, G ™
Peterbilt of Atlanta, LLC (Jackson, GA) V| * v v v 2012 Peterbilt 337 $66,250.00 $265,000.00
FourStar Freightliner (Montgomery, AL) Vv v v v 2013 Freightliner M2 106 $72,007.00 $288,028.00|
TransPower, Incorporated (Albany, GA) Vv v v v 2013 Kenworth T270 $72,110.00 $288,440.00|
Beck Motor Co./Tri-State Peterbilt (Albany, GA) vI|v v v v 2013 Peterbilt 337 $72,587.00 $290,348_00|
Kenworth of Montgomery (Montgomery, AL) Vv v v v 2013 Kenworth T270 $72,922.00 $291,688.00|
Yancey Truck Centers (Blackshear, GA) vI|v v v 4 2013 International 4400 $74,112.52 $296,450.08|
Municipal Equipment Sales, Inc. (Woodstock, GA) v|v NOBID
Envirowaste Equipment (Mableton, GA) v|v NOBID
IConsolidated Disposal Systems, Inc. (Smyrna, GA) v|v NO BID
ICherokee Truck Equipment (Mableton, GA) v|v NOBID
Park Built Body Co., Inc. (Sylvester, GA) Vv NO BID

* Incomplete Bid

** Wwithdrawn

"NO BID" RESPONSES:

Allan Vigil Ford Lincoln, Inc.

Texas Motors Ford

\Wade Ford
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RFB No. 12-0056 / 8-Yard Refuse Collection Trucks

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

Option 2: Body Only

June 13, 2012

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as
recorded during bid opening; they may include
incorrect price extensions or transcription
errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the

bid responses.

Add

OPTION 2: Body Only

Submission Requirements ol >
P el e Manufacturer / Make / Model Unit Price T e

IConsolidated Disposal Systems, Inc. (Smyrna, GA) vI|v v v v 2012 New Way 8 Y ard Diamondback $31,383.00 $125,532.001
Municipal Equipment Sales, Inc. (Woodstock, GA) v|v v v v 2012 LOADMASTER Elite 8 Yard $34,910.00 $139,640.004
Envirowaste Equipment (Mableton, GA) v|v v v v 2012 Wayne 8 Y ard Quantum $37,261.00 $149,044.004
ICherokee Truck Equipment (Mableton, GA) vIv v v 4 2012 Heil Formula 4000-11N $41,895.00 $167,580.004
Yancey Truck Centers (Blackshear, GA) v|v NO BID

Kenworth of Montgomery (Montgomery, AL) viv NOBID

TransPower, Incorporated (Albany, GA) viv NOBID

Peterbilt of Atlanta, LLC (Jackson, GA) v|* 4 2012 Heil Formula 4000-11N NOBID

Beck Motor Co./Tri-State Peterbilt (Albany, GA) viv NOBID

Park Built Body Co., Inc. (Sylvester, GA) viv NOBID

FourStar Freightliner (Montgomery, AL) vI|v NO BID

* Incomplete Bid

** Wwithdrawn
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COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
RFB No. 12-0056 / 8-Yard Refuse Collection Trucks Thisisadraft tabulation. The entries are as

] . recorded during bid opening; they may include
Optl on 3: Com P lete Unit incorrect price extensions or transcription
errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the

June 13, 2012 bid responses.
OPTION 3: Complete Unit
Submission Requirements s o ;
ey Manufacturer | ake / Model Unit Price Total Price
Peach State Ford/ATL FL (Norcross, GA) **
Peterbilt of Atlanta, LLC (Jackson, GA) v|* 4 4 v 2012 Peterbilt 337/Heil F4000 $108,395.00 $433,580.00,
Yancey Truck Centers (Blackshear, GA) v|v NO BID
Kenworth of Montgomery (Montgomery, AL) viv NOBID
Municipal Equipment Sales, Inc. (Woodstock, GA) v|v NO BID
Envirowaste Equipment (Mableton, GA) v|v NO BID
TransPower, Incorporated (Albany, GA) viv NOBID
IConsolidated Disposal Systems, Inc. (Smyrna, GA) v|v NO BID
ICherokee Truck Equipment (Mableton, GA) v|v NO BID
Beck Motor Co./Tri-State Peterbilt (Albany, GA) viv NOBID
Park Built Body Co., Inc. (Sylvester, GA) viv NOBID
FourStar Freightliner (Montgomery, AL) vI|v NO BID

* Incomplete Bid ** Withdrawn O:\Sandra Chandlen\Tabulations\FY12\RFBs\7-Yard Dump Trucks.xIs
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