COL UMB US CONSOL IDATED GOVERN MENT This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded

Firearms during bid opening; they may include incorrect price

extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to
RFB No. 12-0053 change if conflicting information is discovered during

analysis of the bid responses.

June 13, 2012

OPTION 1: Smith & Wesson M&P45 Pistols OPTION 2: Remington 870P 12 Gauge Shotguns OPTION 3: Big Sky ELS-270-B Shotgun Racks
Submission Requirements Addendum 1.4 REVISED PRICING PAGE

Clyde Armory, Inc. (Bogart, GA) 4 4 4 $396.81 $5,952.15 NO BID NO BID

Tactical Gear Supply Co., Inc. (Forest Park, GA) v v v $412.00 $6,180.00] NO BID NO BID

Gulf States Distributors (Montgomery, AL) ©® v v v v $436.00 $6,540_00I NO BID v & v $273.95 $15,067.25
Smyrna Police Distributors (Smyrna, GA) v NO BID v v v $536.88 $29,528.40] NO BID

G. T. Distributors (Austin, TX) v NO BID v v | v $615.22|  $33837.10) v v | v $211.64)  $11,640.20
Craig's Firearm Supply, Inc. (Knoxville, TN) v NO BID v v v $561.66 $30,891.30] NO BID

Law Enforcement Supply (Marietta, GA) v NO BID NO BID v v v $224.95 $12,372.25
Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. (Vero Beach, FL) v NO BID v v v $564.34 $31,038.701 NO BID

Ray O'Herron (Danville, IL) v NO BID NO BID v v | v $27395|  $15067.25
Eds Public Safety (Stockbridge, GA) v NO BID v v v $569.25 $31,308.75 NO BID

"NO BID" RESPONSES: *Incomplete Bid O:\Sandra Chandlen\Tabulations\FY 12\RFBs\Firearms.xls

Law Enforcement Targets, Inc.

DGG Taser & Tactical Supply

Black Hills Ammunition Co.

Sharp Communication, Inc.

Municipal and Commercial Uniforms
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