COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Inmate Vans (Commercial Cutaway)

RFB No. 12-0051

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded
during bid opening; they may include incorrect price
extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to
change if conflicting information is discovered during
analysis of the bid responses.

May 23, 2012
OPTION 1: OPTION 2: OPTION 1. OPTION 2: OPTION 3:
SUBMISSION Add. CAB AND CHASSISONLY BODY ONLY Cab & Chassis Body Complete Unit
REQUIREMENTS el
: s wrcosr | TR e | T
1. Speedway Ford 2012 Complete Truck
(Griffin, GA) v v v v 2012 Ford E-350 v v Body ADFC 14' $19,546.86 $117,281.16] $14,745.00] $88,470.00] $34,291.86| $205,751.16]
2. Trans Power, Inc.
: NO BID NO BID NO BID
(Albany, GA) v 4 v v 2012 Ford E-350 $19,901.58 $119,409.48]
3. Rivertown Ford 2012 Complete 14' NO BID
(Columbus, GA) v v v v 2012 Ford E-350 v v Van Body $19,995.00 $119,970.00] $34,740.00| $208,440.004
2012 Complete Truck
4. Wade Ford (S , GA '
ade Ford (Smyma, GA) | | v v | mrodesso | v v Body ADFC 14 $20,169.00]  $121,014.00] e $35,096.00] $210,576.00{
I5. Rountree Moore Chevrolet 2012 Lyncoach
Nissan (Lake City, FL) v v v 4 2012 Ford E-350 * v Cutaway Body $20,135.00 $120,810.00] $14,983.00[ $89,898.00] $35,118.00[ $210,708.00{
16. Jay Buick GMC Inc. 2013 GMC Savana NO BID
(Columbus, GA) 4 4 v 4 1633803 * v" | Complete Truck Body |  $22,808.96 $136,853.76] $37,793.96| $226,763.76]
7. Allan Vigil Ford 2012 Smyrna Cargo -
(Morrow, GA) v v v v 2012 Ford E-350 * 4 STC147896 $20,332.00 $121,992.000 $18,871.00[ $113,226.00] $39,302.00[ $235,812.00f
I8. RBM of Atlanta 2011 Mercedes Benz 2012 Supreme
(Atlanta, GA) a4 v v Sprinter (&( * v Truck Body $27,127.00]  $162,762.00§ $25,709.00] $154,254.00] $52,836.00| $317,016.00]
"NO BID" RESPONSES: * Incomplete Bid
Municipal Equipment Sales
DATTCO, Inc.
\Work Trux
Team Ford O:\Sandra Chandler\Tabulations\FY12\RFBs\Inmate Vans.xls



