COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

16/18 Yard Dump Truck
RFB No. 11-0047

March 16, 2011

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as
recorded during bid opening; they may include
incorrect price extensions or transcription errors,
and are subject to change if conflicting information
is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

Submission Requirements

FourStar Freightliner, Inc.

Yancey Truck Centers, LLC

Peach State
Ford Truck Sales

Beck Motor Co.

Kenworth of Montgomery

Trans Power, Inc.

(Montgomery, AL) (Albany, GA) (Norcross. GA) (Albany, GA) (Montgomery, AL) (Albany, GA)
Addendum No. 1 v v v v v v
Business License v v v v v v
W-9 v v v v v v
OPTION 1: Cab and Chassis Only
Product Literature v v v v v v
Warranty Information v v v v v v
Response Pages (Revised) v v v v v v
Cab and Chassis Year/Make/Model 2012 Freightliner M2 106 2012 Interng:lcérsl 7500 SBA 2012 Freightliner M2 106V 2012 Peterbilt 348 2012 Kenworth T440 2012 Kenworth T441
OPTION 2: Body Only
Product Literature v v
Warranty Information v v
Response Pages v v
Body Year/Make/Model Godwin 500T 16' 2011; ﬁ;vzcr)igikes
OPTION 1: Cab and Chassis Only (Unit Price) $85,720.00 $88,072.00 $88,233.00 $91,981.00 $94,910.00 $96,944.00
OPTION 2: Body Only (Unit Price) NO BID NO BID $15,587.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
OPTION 3: Complete Unit (Unit Price) $105,100.00 NO BID $103,820.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

*Incomplete Bid
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COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

16/18 Yard Dump Truck

RFB No. 11-0047

March 16, 2011

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as
recorded during bid opening; they may include
incorrect price extensions or transcription errors,
and are subject to change if conflicting information
is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

Advantage Truck Center

Transport Equipment Co.,

Warren Truck

Cherokee Truck Equipment

Submission Requirements (Charlotte, NC) (Alballr:];.’ o) (Bfr‘r;—irr?gsgnl:f&u (Mableton, GA)
Addendum No. 1 v v v *
Business License v v v *
W-9 v v v v
OPTION 1: Cab and Chassis Only
Product Literature v
Warranty Information v
Response Pages (Revised) v
Cab and Chassis Year/Make/Model 2012 Volvo VHD64B
OPTION 2: Body Only
Product Literature v v v v
Warranty Information v v v *
Response Pages v v v v
Body Year/Make/Model Class 4 é%lnztrggor Body 2011 Godwin MFG 500TB 2011 Warren FL-16 2011 Godwin 500T
OPTION 1: Cab and Chassis Only (Unit Price) $114,932.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID
OPTION 2: Body Only (Unit Price) $13,800.00 $13,172.00 $14,833.00 $17,110.00
OPTION 3: Complete Unit (Unit Price) $128,752.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ $

*Incomplete Bid
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