COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

Inmate Vans (Commercial Cutaway)
RFB No. 11-0045

March 16, 2011

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as

recorded during bid opening; they may include
incorrect price extensions or transcription errors,
and are subject to change if conflicting information
is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

Submission Requirements Rivertown Ford Wade Ford CarIOCF;)reerg(t)iLynzleet Allan Vigil Ford RBM of Atlanta Henna Chlevrolet LP
(Columbus, GA) (Smyrna, GA) (Auburn, AL) (Morrow, GA) (Atlanta, GA) (Austin, TX)
Addendum No. 1 v v v v * v
Addendum No. 2 v v v v v v
Business License v * v * * *
\W-9 v v v v v v
OPTION 1: Cab and Chassis Only
Product Literature v v v v v v
Warranty Information v v v v * v
Did not use "Revised"
Response Pages (Revised) Response Pages (Addendum
v v v v No. 1) v
Cab and Chassis Year/Make/Model 2011 Ford E350 DRW XL 2011 Ford E350 2011 Ford E350 2011 Ford E350 2010 Mercedes Benz
M3CC170 Chevrolet CG33803
Cab and Chassis Only (Unit Price) $21,097.00 $21,198.50 $21,708.22 21,860.00 $33,528.00 NO BID
Total Price (2 Units) $42,194.00 $42,397.00 $43,416.44 $43,720.00 $67,056.00 $43,814.00
OPTION 2: Body Only
Product Literature v v v v v v
Warranty Information v v * v * v
Response Pages v v v v * v
Body Year/Make/Model 59?;3 _Fff\;aiogup;te;ren Suprselile 4((:)%%32 tion Lyncoach 14X78X96 SupéT;nleAf(()Z%g(g)rztion Supreme Corporation 2011 Sglp')ar\iToigggéoration
Body Only (Unit Price) NO BID NO BID NO BID $19,302.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Price (2 Units) $38,604.00 $38,604.00
OPTION 3: Complete Unit (Unit Price) $34,530.00 $40,499.00 $36,534.22 $41,162.00 $53,804.00 $41,209.00"
TOTAL PRICE (2 Units) $69,060.00 $80,998.00 $73,068.44 $82,324.00 $107,608.00 $82,418.00||

*Incomplete Bid
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