
1. Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $23,242.00

2. Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $23,330.37

3. Legacy Ford, Inc. (McDonough, GA) * * * 2010 Ford Expedition $23,393.00

4. Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $23,493.00

5. Prater Ford-Mercury, Inc. (Calhoun, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $23,537.00

6. Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $23,995.00

7. Carl Gregory Fleet Oper. (Columbus, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $27,913.12

8. Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) 2010 Chevrolet Tahoe 4x4 $28,700.00

9. Jay Pontiac Buick GMC (Columbus, GA) 2010 GMC Yukon $32,271.30

10. Bellamy Strickland (McDonough, GA) 2010 Chevrolet Tahoe $33,262.61

11. Whiteside Chevrolet (Saint Clairsville, OH) 2010 Chevrolet Tahoe $33,800.00

12. Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

*Incomplete Bid
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1. Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $20,884.37

2. Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $22,792.00

3. Prater Ford-Mercury, Inc. (Calhoun, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $22,879.00

4. Legacy Ford, Inc. (McDonough, GA) * * * 2010 Ford Expedition $22,953.00

5. Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $22,967.00

6. Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $23,217.00

7. Carl Gregory Fleet Oper. (Columbus, GA) 2010 Ford Expedition $28,216.12

8. Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) 2010 Chevrolet Tahoe $29,100.00

9. Jay Pontiac Buick GMC (Columbus, GA) 2010 GMC Yukon $29,291.65

10. Whiteside Chevrolet (Saint Clairsville, OH) 2010 GMC Yukon $30,500.00

11. Bellamy Strickland (McDonough, GA) 2010 Chevrolet Tahoe $31,690.71

12. Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

*Incomplete Bid
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1. Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA) 2010 Ford E-350 $21,624.00 $43,248.00

2. Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) 2010 Ford E-350 $21,996.00 $43,992.00

3. Legacy Ford, Inc. (McDonough, GA) * * * 2010 Ford E-350 $22,094.00 $44,188.00

4. Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) 2010 Ford E-350 $22,185.00 $44,370.00

5. Prater Ford-Mercury, Inc. (Calhoun, GA) 2010 Ford E-350 $22,199.00 $44,398.00

6. Carl Gregory Fleet Oper. (Columbus, GA) 2010 Ford E-350 $22,237.84 $44,475.68

7. Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) 2010 Ford 15 Pass Van XL $23,453.84 $46,907.68

8. Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) 2010 Chevrolet CG33706 $27,000.00 $54,000.00

9. Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) 2010 Chevrolet Express $27,400.00 $54,800.00

10. Jay Pontiac Buick GMC (Columbus, GA) 2010 GMC Savana $27,710.78 $55,421.56

11. Whiteside Chevrolet (Saint Clairsville, OH) 2010 GMC Savana $27,913.00 $55,826.00

12. Bellamy Strickland (McDonough, GA) 2010 Chevrolet Express $28,573.67 $57,147.34

*Incomplete Bid
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1. Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) 2010 Ford F-250 XL $19,811.00

2. Prater Ford-Mercury, Inc. (Calhoun, GA) 2010 Ford F-250 $20,513.00

3. Carl Gregory Fleet Oper. (Columbus, GA) * 2010 Ford F-250 $21,606.32

4. Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) 2011 Ford F-250 $23,820.00

5. Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA) 2011 Ford F-250 $24,694.00

6. Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) 2010 Chevrolet 2500 HD $24,900.00

7. Jay Pontiac Buick GMC (Columbus, GA) 2010 GMC Sierra $24,952.50

8. Bellamy Strickland (McDonough, GA) 2010 Chevrolet Silverado $25,696.66

9. Whiteside Chevrolet (Saint Clairsville, OH) 2010 GMC Sierra $25,749.00

10. Legacy Ford, Inc. (McDonough, GA) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

11. Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

12. Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

*Incomplete Bid
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