AMMUNITION FOR PUBLIC SAFETY

Thisisadraft tabulation. Entriesare as
recorded during bid opening, may
include incorrect price extensions, or
transcription errors, and are subject to
change if conflicting information is
discovered during analysis of the bid

responses.

RFB NO. 09-0048

Est Qty Gulf State Craig's Fiream Lawmen's Precision Tactical Gear Zero GT

Rounds Distributors Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Delta Corp Supply Ammunition | Distributors
A.POLICE DEPARTMENT
45AC, Reloaded, 230GR Ball 325,000 no bid 67418.00 no bid 70850.00 no bid 55315.00 no bid
12 Gauge, Remington, 00 Buck Shot 25,000 no bid 11968.00 12500.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
223, Hornady, 55GR 15,000 7,650.00 6781.50 8,850.00 9,375.00 no bid no bid 9900.00
223, Reloaded, 55GR Ball 25,000 no bid 7313.75 no bid 9,125.00 no bid no bid 13750.00
38SPL, Precision, 148GR (Loaded Ammo) 25,000 no bid 5053.00 no bid 6350.00 no bid 5740.50 no bid
38SPL, Precision, 148GR (Bullet) 25,000 no bid no bid no bid 1500.00 no bid 1469.75 no bid
38SPL, Precision, 158GR 15,000 no bid no bid no bid 960.00 no bid 913.50 no bid
9MM, Winchester, 147GR 20,000 no bid 4680.80 no bid 4300.00 no bid 6290.00 no bid
45AC, Federal, 230GR 10,000 2,450.00 2074.40 no bid 2180.00 no bid no bid no bid
308, Federal, 168GR. 2,000 1,240.00 1276.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid 2080.00
9MM, Reload, 147GR 20,000 3,100.00 3723.60 no bid 3160.00 no bid 3598.00 no bid
9MM, Federal, 147GR 5,000 975.00 1170.20 no bid 1075.00 no bid no bid no bid
45AC, Winchester, 230GR 22,000 no bid 6436.32 no bid 7260.00 no bid no bid no bid
40 S& W, Winchester, 165GR 1,000 no bid 281.92 no bid 287.00 no bid no bid no bid
223, Federal, 55GR 3,000 no bid 989.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
B. MARSHAL'SDEPARTMENT
45 Automatic, Winchester, 230GR 5,200 no bid 1609.08 no bid 1716.00 no bid no bid no bid
12 Gauge, Remington LE 3,500 no bid 1675.52 1750.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
223, Hornady, 55GR 2,000 1020.00 904.20 1180.00 1250.00 no bid no bid 1320.00
308 Cal, Federal Premium, 168GR 2000 1,240.00 1,276.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid 2080.00
9MM, Federa Tactical, 147GR 1,000 254.00 292.56 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
.40 Cal, Federal Tactical, 165GR 1,000 366.00 281.92 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
45 Automatic, 230GR 30,000 7350.00 6223.20 no bid 6540.00 no bid 5106.00 no bid
9MM, 147GR 1,500 292.50 351.06 no bid 322.50 no bid 299.96 no bid
40 Cal, 165GR 1,500 432.00 422.88 no bid 430.50 no bid 338.69 no bid
.223 Cal, 55GR 8,000 2,381.60 2,340.40 3,360.00 2,920.00 no bid no bid 2,400.00
.308 Cal, 168GR 4,000 1960.00 2042.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
C. MUSCOGEE COUNTY PRISON
.40 Automatic, 180GR 2,000 420.00 372.36 no bid 422.00 no bid 402.38 no bid
38 Specia Cal, 158GR 30,000 5400.00 5904.00 no bid 8190.00 no bid no bid no bid
12 Gauge, Remington, 00 Buck Shot 2,000 no bid 957.44 1000.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
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D. SHERIFF'S DEPARTMENT
.45 Winchester, 230GR 12,500 no bid 3,657.00 no bid 4,125.00 no bid no bid no bid
9MM, Winchester, 147GR 300 no bid 146.28 no bid 85.50 no bid no bid no bid
.38 Specia, 110GR 100 no bid 106.38 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
.380 Cal, 90GR 1,000 460.00 250.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
308 Cal, Federal, 168GR 7,000 4340.00 4468.10 no bid no bid no bid no bid 2080.00
.223 Cal, Federal, 55GR (Duty) 3,000 1470.00 989.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
12 Gauge, Remington 2,000 no bid 957.44 1000.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
12 Gauge, Remington, 1 Oz. 500 no bid 202.14 210.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
45ACP, Reload, 230GR 114,000 27,360.00 28,500.00 no bid 36,864.00 no bid 19402.80 no bid
9MM, 147GR 2,200 429.00 585.10 no bid 473.00 no bid 395.93 no bid
223 Cal, Federal or Remington, 55GR (Prac) 30,000 8,931.00 8,776.50 9,300.00 10,950.00 no bid no bid 9000.00
MUNITIONSLIST
E. SHERIFF'S DEPARTMENT
37mm 4.8" Sefe Smoke, 75— 150 yards %0 963.00 no bid no bid no bid 860.00 no bid 925.00
37mm 4.8" Spede—Heat CS; 75— 150 yards 0 1,318.80 no bid no bid no bid 1183.00 no bid 1350.30
Stinger Rubber Ball Grenades 2 735.60 no bid no bid no bid 695.00 no bid 617.40
Stinger Rubber Ball Grenades w/OC 20 778.80 no bid no bid no bid 755,00 no bid 71880
CS Grenades e 716.40 no bid no bid no bid 669.00 no bid 951.30
12 GA Diversionary Aerial Round 40 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 198.80
12 GA Diversionary Rubber Pellet Round 120 no bid no bid no bid no bid 552.00 no bid 444,00
12 GA Super Sock Bean Bag Round 150 72000 no bid no bid no bid 660.00 no bid 634.50
JVK —1X 120z, Spray Canister 2 no bid no bid no bid no bid 387.00 no bid 355.20
37MM Multiple Foam Baton, Smokeless 75-150 YD 20
no bid no bid no bid no bid 310.00 no bid 280.20
F. POLICE DEPARTMENT
Bean Bag 2,600 12480.00 no bid no bid no bid 11,440.00 no bid 11,050.00
IR”bber Pellet—High Velocity 1,100 5544.00 no bid no bid no bid 5060.00 no bid 4092.00
[Fupber Pellet —Low Velocity 1,100 5544.00 no bid o bid o bid 5060.00 o bid 4002.00
I"a“”Chi ng Cartridge 50 219.00 no bid no bid no bid 19250 no bid 220.00
[iversionary Rounds 50 no bid no bid o bid o bid no bid o bid 248,00
|Bean Bags S0 no bid no bid no bid no bid 875.00 no bid 740,50
| Rubber Baton %0 no bid no bid no bid no bid 885.00 no bid 74350
Wood Baton 0 909.00 no bid no bid no bid 825.00 no bid 685.00
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Mono Baton %0 no bid no bid no bid no bid 845.00 no bid 992.00
[Foam Baton %0 961,00 no bid o bid o bid 875.00 o bid 740,50
IR”bber Pellets (32) %0 906.00 no bid no bid no bid 820.00 no bid 669.50
[Fupber Pelles (60 % 101100 no bid o bid o bid 897.50 o bid 74050
IProj ectile, Smoke, White %0 1041.00 no bid no bid no bid 925.00 no bid 873.00
[Projectle. cs % 957.00 no bid o bid o bid 875,00 o bid 899.50
IP“’j ectile, OC %0 no bid no bid no bid no bid 937.50 no bid 926.00
[Fupber Ball, WiRbber Pellets 100 3678.00 no bid o bid o bid 3475.00 o bid 3000.00
IR”bber Ball, WiCS 100 3894.00 no bid no bid no bid 3775.00 no bid 3598.00
[Fupber Ball, wiwhite Smoke 100 3804.00 no bid o bid o bid 2250.00 o bid 392,00
|Expuision Grenade, Flameless % 77250 no bid no bid no bid 675.00 no bid 793.75
(Canister, Smoke 8 2126.40 no bid no bid no bid 1884.00 no bid 2082.00
Canister, Smoke, HC %0 1350.00 no bid no bid no bid 1210.00 no bid 1270.00
(Canister, Smoke, Pocket 130 2457.00 no bid no bid no bid 221000 no bid 220090
Canister, CN & 756.00 no bid no bid no bid 667.50 no bid 984.00
Canister, OC 8 1910.40 no bid no bid no bid 2388.00 no bid 3049.00
Tactical Grenade, *Flash Bang® & 750.00 no bid no bid no bid 718.75 no bid 430.00
Tactical Grenade, *Flash Bang”, Small % 750,00 no bid no bid no bid 71875 no bid 43000
Tactical Grenade, *Flash Bang”, Training & 924.00 no bid no bid no bid 848.75 no bid 430,00
Tactical Grenade, “Flash Bang”, Training, Small 25
924.00 no bid no bid no bid 848.75 no bid 430.00

* Denote - Low vendor does not
meet specifications.
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