COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

Various Vehicles - RFB 09-0033

M arch 18, 2009

OPTION 1: 3/4 TON REGULAR CAB, 4x4 PICK UP TRUCK

This is a draft tabulation. Entries are as recorded during bid
opening, may include incorrect price extensions, or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid
responses.

Addendum Product Response
Vendors Two Literature Warranty Pages M anufactur er/M ake/M odel Unit Cost
Carl Gregory Dodge (Columbus, Georgia) YES YES YES YES DODGE RAM $ 18,932.00
Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F2504X4 $ 19,785.00
Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F250 $ 20,029.00
Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F250 $ 20,096.00
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F250 $ 20,313.00
Allan Vigil Ford (Fayettville, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F250 $ 20,473.35
Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET SILVERADO $ 21,995.00
Carl Black (Kenneaw, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET SILVERADO $ 22,899.00
Rick Henderson Chevrolet (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET 2500 $ 22,975.00
Gordon Chevrolet (Augusta, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET SILVERADO $ 23,287.00
Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET SILVERADO $ 23,380.00
Bellamy Strickland Chevrolet (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET 2500 $ 23,402.00
Jay Auto Group (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES YES GMS SIERRA $ 23,538.00
L ou Sobh Pontiach Buick (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES GMS SIERRA $ 26,001.78




COL U M BUS CONSOL | DAT ED GOVERN |\/| ENT bid opening, may include incorrect price extensions, or

Various Vehicles - RFB 09-0033

M arch 18, 2009

OPTION 2: MID-SIZE EXTENDED CAB PICKUP TRUCK

This is a draft tabulation. Entries are as recorded during

transcription errors, and are subject to change if
conflicting information is discovered during analysis of
the bid responses.

Addendum Product Response (2 units)
Vendors Two Literature Warranty Pages M anufactur er/M ake/M odel Unit Cost Total Cost

Carl Gregory Dodge (Columbus, Georgia) YES YES YES YES DODGE DAKOTA $ 14,831.00 | $ 29,662.00
Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD RANGER 4X2 XLT $ 14,947.00 | $ 29,894.00
Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD RANGER XLT $ 15,340.00 | $ 30,680.00
Allan Vigil Ford (Fayettville, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD RANGER $ 15,356.75 | $ 30,713.50
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD RANGER $ 15,386.00 | $ 30,772.00
Carl Black (Kenneaw, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET COLORADO $ 17,129.00 | $ 34,258.00
Jay Auto Group (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES YES GMC CANYON $ 17,350.18 | $ 34,700.36
Rick Henderson Chevrolet (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET COLORADO $ 17,423.00 | $ 34,846.00
Gordon Chevrolet (Augusta, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET COLORADO $ 17,922.00 | $ 35,844.00
Lou Sobh Pontiach Buick (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES GMC CANYON $ 18,188.84 | $ 36,377.68
Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) NO BID

Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) NO BID

Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) NO BID

Bellamy Strickland Chevrolet (McDonough, GA) NO BID




COLUMBUS CONSOL IDATED GOVERNMENT

Various Vehicles - RFB 09-0033
M arch 18, 2009

OPTION 3: MID-SIZE 4WD SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE

This is a draft tabulation. Entries are as recorded during
bid opening, may include incorrect price extensions, or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if
conflicting information is discovered during analysis of
the bid responses.

Addendum Product Response
Vendors Two Literature Warranty Pages M anufactur er/M ake/M odel Unit Cost

Carl Gregory Dodge (Columbus, Georgia) YES YES YES YES CHRYSLER JEEP LIBERTY $ 20,229.00
Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD EXPLORER 4X4 XLT $ 21,104.00
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD EXPLORER $ 21,775.00
Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD EXPLORER $ 22,014.50
Gordon Chevrolet (Augusta, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET EQUINOX $ 22,122.40
Allan Vigil Ford (Fayettville, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD EXPLORER $ 22,435.75
Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD EXPLORER XLT $ 22,535.00
Rick Henderson Chevrolet (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET TRAILBLAZER $ 23,890.00
Carl Black (Kenneaw, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET TRAVERSE $ 26,799.00
Lou Sobh Pontiach Buick (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES GMC ENVOY $ 27,095.60
Jay Auto Group (Columbus, GA) * YES NO YES YES GMC ACADIA $ 30,569.23
Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) NO BID

Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) NO BID

Bellamy Strickland Chevrolet (McDonough, GA) NO BID




COLUMBUS CONSOL IDATED GOVERNMENT

OPTION 4: MID-SIZE SEDAN

Various Vehicles - RFB 09-0033

M arch 18, 2009

bid responses.

This is a draft tabulation. Entries are as recorded during
bid opening, may include incorrect price extensions, or

transcription errors, and are subject to change if
conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the

Addendum Product Response
Vendors One Literature Warranty Pages M anufactur er/M ake/M odel Unit Cost
Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD FUSION $ 16,778.00
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD FUSION $ 16,877.00
Allan Vigil Ford (Fayettville, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD FUSION $ 16,987.85
Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD FUSION SE $ 17,031.00
Carl Gregory Dodge (Columbus, Georgia) YES YES YES YES DODGE AVENGER $ 17,231.00
Jay Auto Group (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES YES PONTIAC S-6 22569 $ 17,838.00
Rick Henderson Chevrolet (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET IMPALA $ 18,437.00
Bellamy Strickland Chevrolet (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET IMPALA $ 18,713.00
Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET MALIBU $ 19,700.00
Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET MALIBU $ 19,800.00
Gordon Chevrolet (Augusta, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET MALIBU $ 19,844.53
Carl Black (Kenneaw, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET MALIBU $ 19,899.00
L ou Sobh Pontiach Buick (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES PONTIAC 2ZG69 $ 20,753.73
Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD TAURUS $ 21,070.00







COLUMBUS CONSOL IDATED GOVERNMENT

Various Vehicles - RFB 09-0033

March 18, 2009
OPTION 5: 1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB PICKUP TRUCK

responses.

This is a draft tabulation. Entries are as recorded during bid
opening, may include incorrect price extensions, or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid

Addendum Product Response (2 units)

Vendors One Literature Warranty Pages M anufactur er/M ake/M odel Unit Cost Total Cost
Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F150 $ 16,691.00 | $ 33,382.00
Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F150 SC 4X2 XL $ 16,802.00 | $  33,604.00
Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F150 $ 17,082.00 | $ 34,164.00
Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F150 XL $ 17,002.00 | $ 34,184.00
Allan Vigil Ford (Fayettville, GA) YES YES YES YES FORD F150 1735175 |$  34,703.50
Rick Henderson Chevrolet (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET SILVERADO $ 17,358.00 | $ 34,716.00
Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET SILVERADO $ 15,885.00 | $ 37,770.00
Gordon Chevrolet (Augusta, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET SILVERADO $ 19,982.00 | $ 39,964.00
Carl Black (Kenneaw, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET CC10553 $ 19,999.00 | $ 39,998.00
Bellamy Strickland Chevrolet (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET 1500 $ 20,767.00 | $ 41,534.00
Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) YES YES YES YES CHEVROLET CC10753 $ 20,928.00 | $ 41,856.00
Jay Auto Group (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES YES GMC SIERRA $ 27,957.37 | $ 43,914.74
Lou Sobh Pontiac Buick (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES YES GMC SIERRA $ 22,404.25 | $ 44,809.50
Carl Gregory Dodge (Columbus, Georgia) NO BID




This is a draft tabulation. Entries are as recorded during bid

COL U M BUS CONSOL IDATED GOVERN MENT opening, may include incorrect price extensions, or

Various Vehicles - RFB 09-0033
M arch 18, 2009

OPTION 6: 15-PASSENGER VAN

transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid
responses.

Product Response
Vendors Literature Warranty Pages M anufactur er/M ake/M odel Unit Cost

Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES FORD CLUB WAGON $ 23,892.00
Peach County Ford (Byron, GA) YES YES YES FORD E350 $ 24,010.00
Allen Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA) YES YES YES FORD ECONOLINE $ 24,645.00
Allan Vigil Ford (Fayettville, GA) YES YES YES FORD E350 $ 24,733.70
Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES FORD E350 XL $ 25,971.00
Terry Cullen Chevrolet (Jonesboro, GA) YES YES YES CHEVROLET EXPRESS $ 26,940.00
Rick Henderson Chevrolet (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES CHEVROLET EXPRESS $ 27,378.00
Carl Black (Kenneaw, GA) YES YES YES CHEVROLET EXPRESS $ 27,499.00
Bellamy Strickland Chevrolet (McDonough, GA) YES YES YES CHEVROLET EXPRESS $ 27,520.00
Gordon Chevrolet (Augusta, GA) YES YES YES CHEVROLET EXPRESS $ 27,677.00
Jay Auto Group (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES GMC SAVANNA $ 27,994.58
L ou Sobh Pontiach Buick (Duluth, GA) YES YES YES GMC SAVANNA $ 29,847.09
Carl Gregory Dodge (Columbus, Georgia) NO BID

Sledge Chevrolet (Manchester, GA) NO BID
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