COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

TRUCK WITH 12' FLAT BED DUMP BODY

RFB No. 08-0079
August 13, 2008

This is a draft tabulation. Entries are as
recorded during bid opening, may include
incorrect price extensions, or transcription
errors, and are subject to change if conflicting

bid responses.

information is discovered during analysis of the

Option 1 Option 2 Option 3
Addendum| Addendum| Addendum Product R Cab & Chassis BOdy Complete Unit
VENDORS eponse
One Two Three Literature Warranty Pages Option 1 Option 2 (3 units) (3 units) (3 units)
Manufactur er/M ake/M odel Manufactur er/M ake/M odel UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
. Consolidated Disposal System (Smyrna, GA) YES | YES | YES YES YES YES | 09 Freightliner m2-106 Oxbody Longhorn NO BID NO BID $59,634.00 | HHHHHHHT
. Parkbuilt Body Company (Sylvester, GA) YES | YES | YES YES YES YES NO BID 08 ParkBuilt PBFD-12' NO BID $ 6,984.00 | $20,952.00 NO BID
. Commercial Truck & Van Equip (Norcross, GA) YES | YES | YES YES YES YES NO BID 08 Omaha Patriot Body NO BID $ 7,250.00 | $21,750.00 NO BID
. Duval Ford (Jacksonville, FL) YES | YES | YES YES YES YES 09 Ford F350 09 Blueridge FTCFB812 NO BID NO BID $35,119.00 | HHHHHHHHT
. Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA) YES | YES | YES YES YES YES 09 Ford XL F450 08 RTO Rughy $30,315.00] $90,945.00 [ $ 9,175.00 | $27,525.00 | $39,490.00 | #HHHHHHHH
. Transport Equipment Company (Albany, GA) YES | YES | YES YES YES YES NO BID 08 Trans1296 $ 8,492.00 | $25,476.00 NO BID
. Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA) YES | YES | YES YES YES YES 09 Ford F350 NO BID $22,296.00 | $66,888.00 NO BID NO BID
. Jay Auto Group (Columbus, GA) YES | YES | YES YES YES YES |09 GMC Sierra TC31403 NO BID $28,327.66 | $84,982.98 NO BID NO BID
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