RFB NO.

08-0013
RFB NAME: Custodial Supplies (Annual Contract)

BID TABULATION

This is a draft tabulation. Entries are as recorded
during bid opening, may include incorrect price
extensions, or transcription errors, and are subject
to change if conflicting information is discovered

DATE: September 19, 2007 during analysis of the bid responses.
NCH Corp GA Sam Tell Unisour ce Zep Geneva Ruthledge
VENDORS (Incomplete) Correctional and Son, Inc. Worldwide Manufacturing Brown Enterprises
Industries (Incomplete) (Incomplete)
Section A No bid No bid No bid *325.00 *386.52 *2,187.50 * 455,28
Section B No bid *4,088.50 No bid 13.908.81 *3,021.00 *12,665.00 *10,370.73
Section C 5427.36 No bid No bid *3,412.92 10,768.74 *120.00 *21,153.00
Section D 31,654.00 *6,720.00 No bid 22.333.28 30,358.00 *37,750.00 54,615.60
Section E 1,472.16 No bid No bid 955.20 1,921.90 288.00 740,64
Section F 20,475.60 No bid No bid *9,088.80 40,809.40 No bid %9,759.00
Section G No bid *1,267.20 No bid 10,220.04 *23,429.25 *2,850.00 13,187.70
Section H No bid *560.00 No bid 11,922.50 7,240.00 1,887.50 14,275.00
Section | 22,099.98 *5,275.20 8,225.25 *43.319.22 *60,373.94 *15,510.80 *32.434.85
Section J 60,792.00 *10,640.00 No bid 21,113.20 20,306.40 40,320.00 No bid
Estimated $141,921.10 $ 28,550.90 $8,225.25 $137,498.97 $214,299.63 $113,578.80 $156,991.80
Contract Value




