
COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

LARGE BUCKET TRUCKS

RFB No. 07-0056

April 4, 2007

OPTION 1 OPTION 2 Option 1 Option 2 Option 3
CAB & CHASSIS ONLY BODY ONLY Cab/Chassis Body Complete Unit

Addendum Product Response Addendum Product Response (2 units) (2 units) (2 units)

One Literature Warranty Pages Manufacturer/Make/Model One Literature Warranty Pages Manufacturer/Make/Model Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1. Freightliner of Montgomery (Montgomery, AL) YES YES YES YES Frightliner M2106 NO BID 56,997.00$  113,994.00$  NO BID NO BID

2. Peter Bilt (Montgomery, AL) YES YES YES YES 2008 Peterbilt 340 NO BID 67,636.00$  135,272.00$  NO BID NO BID

3. Terex Utilities (White House, TN) * YES NO NO YES 2008 International 4300 YES YES YES YES 2007 Terex Utilities HRX-55 NO BID NO BID 131,988.00$  263,976.00$   

4. Bill Heard Chevrolet (Columbus, GA) YES YES YES YES 2008 Chevrolet C8500 NO BID 55,754.00$  111,508.00$  NO BID NO BID

5.  Altec Industries (Birmingham, AL) YES YES YES YES 2008 GMC 8500 YES YES YES YES 2008 Altec AA755MH 57,114.00$  114,228.00$  78,101.00$  156,202.00$  135,215.00$  270,430.00$   

6.  Carl Black Automotive Group (Kennesaw, GA) YES YES YES YES 2008 GMC TC7C042 NO BID 57,691.00$  115,382.00$  NO BID NO BID

7.  OG Hughes (Knoxville, TN) YES YES YES YES 2008 Sterling C7501 YES YES YES YES 2007 Versalift VO-355 MHI 60,920.00$  121,840.00$  82,197.00$  164,394.00$  NO BID

8.  Beck Motor (Albany, GA) YES YES YES YES 2008 Peterbilt 340 NO BID 55,386.00$  110,772.00$  NO BID NO BID

* INCOMPLETE

This is a draft tabulation.  Entries are as recorded 
during bid opening, may include incorrect price 
extensions, or transcription errors, and are subject 
to change if conflicting information is discovered 
during analysis of the bid responses.
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