
BID TABULATION 
 
BID NO:  07-0025
DATE:  October 25, 2006 
BID:  Stone (Annual Contract) (Re-Bid)

 
Vendor/Description 

Flat Rock Sand & 
Gravel 

 

LaFarge Aggregates Florida Rock 
Industries 

Vulcan Materials 

 Job Site 
Per Ton 

Plant  
Per Ton 

Job Site 
Per Ton 

Plant 
Per Ton 

Job Site 
Per Ton 

Plant 
Per Ton 

Job Site 
Per Ton 

Plant 
Per Ton 

 
3         1" TO 2"  

14.00 9.50 No Bid No Bid 14.80 8.80 12.50 8.50

 
4         3/4" TO 1 2" 

14.00 9.50 12.30 8.30 No Bid No Bid 12.75 8.75

 
5         2" TO 3/4" 

14.00 9.50 10.55 6.55 15.55 9.55 13.00 9.00

 
57       1/4" TO 1" 

14.00 10.00 11.75 7.75 15.55 9.55 13.45 9.45

 
6         1/4" TO 3/4" 

14.00 9.50 12.00 8.00 15.55 9.55 13.75 9.75

 
67       1/8" TO 3/4" 

15.00 10.50 13.50 9.50 17.05 11.05 13.75 9.75

 
7         1/8" TO 2" 

15.00 10.50 15.00 11.00 20.15 14.15 16.50 12.50

 
89       1/8" TO 3/8" 

15.00 10.50 13.00 9.00 No Bid No Bid 17.50 13.50

 
810     SCREENING 1/4" 

11.50 7.50 10.50 6.50 No Bid No Bid 12.50 8.50

 
M-10  SCREENING 1/8" 

8.50 4.50 7.00 3.00 11.05 5.05 8.50 4.50

 
CRUSHED STONE BASE 1 2" 

10.00 6.00 8.75 4.75 11.55 5.55 10.25 6.25

SURGE STONE GRADED MIX (4" TO 
6") 

16.00 10.00 12.00 8.00 17.85 10.85 No Bid No Bid

 
RIP-RAP: TYPE I    24" 

17.00 12.00 17.50 12.50 22.05 14.05 16.00 11.00

 
RIP-RAP: TYPE III    12" 

16.00 12.00 17.50 12.50 20.55 13.55 16.25 11.25

 
GRADED AGGREGATE BASE (G.A.B.) 

10.00 6.00 9.00 5.00 12.05 6.05 10.25 6.25

Business License YES YES YES YES 
Proof of Insurance YES YES YES YES 
Tax ID Number YES YES YES YES 

 


	YES
	YES
	YES
	YES

