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CLOTHING Textile Sales O.D. Bob GA Robinson Charm-Tex Tabb Americare Boxer
Inc. Taragan Barker Correctional Textile, Inc.  Textile Products Rebellion

1. Socks 1,415.00 1,467.00 1,440.00 2,040.00 No Bid 1,554.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2. Briefs See Attached 1,088.00 1,325.00 No Bid No Bid 890.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3. Undershirts No Bid No Bid 2,340.00 3,480.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Attached
4. Work Shirts No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,720.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5. Work Pants No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6. Belts No Bid 317.00 300.00 324.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 555.00 No Bid
7. Jackets No Bid 6,840.00 4,590.00 6,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8. Thermal Tops See Attached 825.00 8,460.00 768.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,185.00 No Bid
9. Thermal Bottoms See Attached 825.00 7,230.00 768.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,185.00 No Bid
10. Toboggans No Bid 416.40 554.40 No Bid No Bid 474.00 No Bid 525.00 No Bid
11. Work Caps No Bid No Bid No Bid 668.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12. Jumpsuits No Bid No Bid 1,380.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13. Shower Shoes (MCJ) 1,025.00 No Bid 685.00 No Bid 685.00 770.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
14. Canvas Shoes 1,168.50 2,060.00 1,245.00 6,750.00 1,090.00 1,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15. Men's Shower Shoes No Bid 4,136.00 1,126.08 No Bid No Bid 1,474.00 No Bid 1,716.00 No Bid
16. Pillows No Bid No Bid 238.00 224.00 No Bid 188.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
17. Pillowcases No Bid No Bid 3,240.00 276.00 No Bid 192.00 300.00 No Bid No Bid
18. Sheets 1,092.00 No Bid 16,560.00 2,280.00 1,550.00 1,032.00 1,134.00 No Bid No Bid
19. Blankets - 100% Cotton 1,064.00 No Bid 1,224.00 No Bid No Bid 1,218.00 3,200.00 1,428.00 No Bid
20. Blankets - 80% Wool 9,480.00 No Bid 10,740.00 No Bid No Bid 10,248.00 7,920.00 10,500.00 No Bid
21. Bath Towels 4,950.00 No Bid 5,625.00 11,400.00 No Bid 4,860.00 6,250.00 No Bid No Bid
22. Wash Cloths 551.25 No Bid 761.25 2,520.00 No Bid 808.50 971.25 971.25 No Bid
23. Deodorant No Bid No Bid 1,250.00 No Bid No Bid 1,445.00 No Bid 1,272.00 No Bid
24. Sanitary Napkins No Bid No Bid 2,900.00 No Bid No Bid 2,990.00 No Bid 1,584.00 No Bid
25. Feminine Hygiene No Bid No Bid 8,832.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26. Toothpaste No Bid No Bid 6,365.00 No Bid No Bid 9,367.00 No Bid 6,412.50 No Bid
27. Toothbrushes No Bid No Bid 660.00 No Bid No Bid 927.00 No Bid 1,620.00 No Bid
28. Shampoo No Bid No Bid 4,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,880.00 No Bid
29. Soap (MCJ) No Bid No Bid 11,120.00 24,320.00 No Bid 11,960.00 No Bid 11,400.00 No Bid
30. Soap (MCP) No Bid No Bid 1,656.00 2,736.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,240.00 No Bid
31. Razor No Bid No Bid 7,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7,950.00 No Bid
32. Food Trays (MCP) No Bid No Bid 1,032.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33. Tumblers No Bid No Bid 22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34. Plates No Bid No Bid 210.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
35. Food Trays (MCJ) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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36. Mugs No Bid No Bid 945.00 No Bid No Bid 885.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
37. Flatware No Bid No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid No Bid 4,172.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
38. Laundry Bags 1,880.00 No Bid 1,587.50 28.56 No Bid 1,668.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
39. Handcuffs No Bid No Bid 272.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
40. Pants No Bid 2,560.00 1,520.00 1,728.00 1,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
41. Pants No Bid 3,572.80 2,128.00 2,880.00 2,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42. Pants No Bid 12,326.40 7,296.00 2,560.00 8,544.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43. Pants No Bid 2,322.00 363.80 2,016.00 1,602.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
44. Pants No Bid 2,340.00 363.80 2,016.00 1,602.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
45. Pants No Bid 316.00 152.00 160.00 240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
46. Shirts No Bid 3,267.00 2,089.80 3,888.00 1,566.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47. Shirts No Bid 9,849.00 6,269.40 11,664.00 6,301.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48. Shirts No Bid 1,101.60 696.60 1,296.00 700.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
49. Shirts No Bid 2,214.00 1,393.20 2,592.00 1,400.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50. Shirts No Bid 316.00 160.40 288.00 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51. Mattresses (MCP) No Bid No Bid 952.50 975.00 1,020.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
52. Mattresses (MCJ) No Bid No Bid 28,950.00 35,000.00 32,000.00 32,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
53. Mattress Covers No Bid No Bid 21,000.00 56,000.00 22,520.00 20,720.00 No Bid No Bid
54. Work Boots 3,667.00 No Bid 2,267.65 4,557.00 No Bid 3,294.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid
  

Incomplete Bids
Lovelines Industries, Inc.
Acme Supply
Pro Corr Outfitters
Design Specialist, Inc.
ATD American Company
ICS
Suprem Sales
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