
Proposed Brand/Model Unit Price Total Price Proposed Brand/Model Unit Price Total Price

911 Rapid Response (Palmyra PA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 65.00 9,750.00 Bianchi 7926 12.00 1,800.00 11,550.00

Fireline, Inc. (Winder, GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 76.95 11,542.50 Bianchi 7926 14.75 2,212.50 13,755.00
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Safewest (La Mesa CA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 69.72 10,458.00 Bianchi 7926 12.97 1,945.50 12,403.50

VITCO Firefighting Equipment (Macon GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 70.00 10,500.00 Bianchi 7926 11.10 1,665.00 12,165.00

Lawmens & Shooters Supply (Vero Beach FL) Uncle Mike's 74192 11.96 1,794.00

Matronics, Inc. (Margate FL) Streamlight Stinger 75710 67.18 10,077.00

West Chatham Warning Devices (Preston GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 65.30 9,795.00 Bianchi 7926 9.98 1,497.00 11,292.00

NAFECO (Decatur AL) Streamlight Stinger 75710 74.95 11,242.50 Bianchi 7926 11.75 1,762.50 13,005.00

Smyrna Police Distributors (Smyrna GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 66.95 10,042.50 Bianchi 7926 11.00 1,650.00 11,692.50

Law Enforcement Supply (Marietta GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 71.87 10,780.50 Bianchi 7926 9.25 1,387.50 12,168.00

GT Distributors (Rossville GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 60.29 9,043.50 Bianchi 7926 9.39 1,408.50 10,452.00

The Attic (Minot ND) Streamlight Stinger 75710 78 89 11 833 50 Bianchi 7926 8 29 1 243 50 13 077 00

No Bid

No Bid

The Attic (Minot ND) Streamlight Stinger 75710 78.89 11,833.50 Bianchi 7926 8.29 1,243.50 13,077.00

CMC Government Supply (Dallas TX) Streamlight Stinger 75710 67.10 10,065.00 No Bid
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Quantico Tactical (Aberdeen NC) Streamlight Stinger 75710 69.77 10,465.50 Bianchi 7926 9.31 1,396.50 11,862.00

Ray O'Herron Co. (Danville IL) Streamlight Stinger 75710 69.50 10,425.00 No Bid

Dana Safety Supply (Sugar Hill GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 65.42 9,813.00 G&G K676-1W 15.93 2,389.50 12,202.50

Adorama Camera (New York NY) *Vendor did not provide information* 72.00 10,800.00

Ten-8 Fire & Safety Equipment (Forsyth GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 72.00 10,800.00

Aker International, Inc. (Chula Vista CA) Aker Leather A554XT-BW 14.04 2,106.00

SRT Supply Streamlight Stinger 75710 70.99 10,648.50 Bianchi 7926 9.99 1,498.50 12,147.00

Engineering & Equipment Co. (Waycross GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 71.00 10,650.00

Gulf State Distributors (Montgomery AL) Streamlight Stinger 66.00 9,900.00

DGG Tactical Supply (Jacksonville FL) Streamlight Stinger 75710 75.10 11,265.00 Bianchi 7926 10.00 1,500.00 12,765.00

CPR Savers & First Aid Supply (Scottsdale AZ) Streamlight Stinger 75710 72.71 10,906.50 Bianchi 7926 10.15 1,522.50 12,429.00

Columbus Communications (Columbus GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 79 32 11 898 00 Bianchi 7926 14 00 2 100 00 13 998 00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Columbus Communications (Columbus GA) Streamlight Stinger 75710 79.32 11,898.00 Bianchi 7926 14.00 2,100.00 13,998.00
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