COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Modular Spotting & Observation Package
PQ No. 11-0026

May 25, 2011
vendors Gulf States Distributors Ray O'Herron Co., Inc. Center Mass, Inc.
(Montgomery, AL) (Danville, IL) (Canton, MI)
Addendum No. 1 v v v
Leupold MARK 4 Spotter 12-40 x 60mm with TMR Reticle, or equivalent
Product Literature v v v
Warranty information v v v
Manufacturer/Make/Model v v v
Unit Price $1,305.00 $1,350.00 $1,370.00
Total Price (4 Units) $5,220.00 $5,400.00 $5,480.00
055XV Manfrotto Tripod, or equivalent
Product Literature v
Warranty information NO BID NO BID v
Manufacturer/Make/Model v
Unit Price $210.00
Total Price (4 Units) $840.00
322RC Manfrotto Grip Action Head w/Rapid
Connect Mounting Plate -- 1/4" Mounting Screw, or equivalent
Product Literature v
Warranty information NO BID NO BID v
Manufacturer/Make/Model v
Unit Price $159.99
Total Price (4 Units) $639.96
Rapid Connect Mounting Plate -- 3/8" Mounting Screw, or equivalent
Product Ll'terature. NO BID NO BID v
Warranty information v
Manufacturer/Make/Model v
Unit Price $11.99
Total Price (4 Units) $47.96




Gulf States Distributors

Ray O'Herron Co., Inc.

Center Mass, Inc.

Vendors (Montgomery, AL) (Danville, IL) (Canton, MI)
CENTER MASS TSSR-Gen 2, or equivalent
Product Li'terature. NO BID NO BID v
Warranty information v
Manufacturer/Make/Model v
Unit Price $249.99
Total Price (4 Units) $999.96
GRAND TOTAL (4 units/Each) $8,007.88
DISCOUNTED PRICE FOR ORDERING AS KIT N/A N/A $7,700.00

*Incomplete Bid
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