## COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT Flat Screen LCD Televisions PQ No. 11-0022

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

May	4,	2011	
-----	----	------	--

Submission Requirements	Mounts Pro (Duluth, GA)	Media Now, Inc. (Netcong, NJ)	TB&A Hospital Television (Amherst, NY)	Gloria Irusota (Stockbridge, GA)	OM Office Supply, Inc. (Mechanicsburg, PA)	Business Services (San Diego, CA)	Best Buy Gov LLC (Richfield, MN)
Addendum No. 1	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	✓	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$
Response Pages	✓	$\checkmark$	✓	✓	✓	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$
Option 1 26" Flat Screen LCD Television							
Product Literature		$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	*	$\checkmark$
Warranty Information	NO BID	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	*	$\checkmark$
Manufacturer/Make/Model	NO BID	LG 26LD350C	LG 26LD350C	LG 26LV2500	Toshiba 26SL400U	Vizio M260VA	LG 26LD350
Unit Cost		\$399.99	\$475.00	\$625.00	\$275.00	\$312.98	\$343.75
7 Units - Total Cost		\$2,799.93	\$3,325.00	\$4,375.00	\$1,925.00	\$2,190.86	\$2,406.25
Option 2 Articulating Arms for 26" Television							
Product Literature	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	*	*	*	$\checkmark$
Warranty Information	*	*	$\checkmark$	*	*	*	$\checkmark$
Manufacturer/Make/Model	MP-LCD-2303	Mustang MV-ARM-M	Peerless PA740(-S)	*	DC30DJ	DC30DJ	SmartMount® SA740P(-S)
Unit Cost	\$42.95	\$85.00	\$60.00	\$110.00	\$40.00	\$49.98	\$195.96
7 Units - Total Cost	\$300.65	\$595.00	\$420.00	\$770.00	\$280.00	\$349.86	\$1,371.72
Option 3 42" Flat Screen LCD Television							
Product Literature	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	*	$\checkmark$
Warranty Information	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	*	$\checkmark$
Manufacturer/Make/Model	Vizio E421VA	LG 42LD452C	LG 42LD452C	LG 42LK450	LG 42LD452C	Vizio M420NV	Insignia NS-42L780A12
Unit Cost	\$499.95	\$669.00	\$820.00	\$800.00	\$738.00	\$744.98	\$633.57
5 Units - Total Cost	\$2,499.75	\$3,345.00	\$4,100.00	\$4,000.00	\$3,690.00	\$3,724.90	\$3,167.85
Option 4 Wall Bracket with Tilt for 42" Television							
Product Literature	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	*	*	*	$\checkmark$
Warranty Information	*	*	$\checkmark$	*	*	*	$\checkmark$
Manufacturer/Make/Model	MP-109-B	Mustang MV-TILT3	Peerless PT640	*	DC50T	DC50T	SmartMount® ST640
Unit Cost	\$119.95	\$70.00	\$54.00	\$95.00	\$65.00	\$79.98	\$127.11
5 Units - Total Cost	\$599.75	\$350.00	\$270.00	\$475.00	\$325.00	\$399.90	\$635.55

Submission Requirements	Visions of Video (Northridge, CA)	CCS Presentation Systems, Inc. (Scottsdale, AZ)	Perlmutter Purchasing Power (San Diego, CA)	Aves Audio Visual Systems (Sugar Land, TX)	Y &S Technologies (Brooklyn, NY)	Fitness Resource (Norcross, GA)	Columbus Security (Columbus, GA)
Addendum No. 1	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$
Response Pages	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$
Option 1 26" Flat Screen LCD Television							
Product Literature	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$
Warranty Information	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$
Manufacturer/Make/Model	LG 26LD350	LG 26LD350C	LG 26LD350C	LG 26LD350C	Vizio M260VA	LG 26LD350	LG 26LV2500
Unit Cost	\$333.84	\$411.00	\$365.00	\$422.00	\$294.00	\$440.00	\$531.25
7 Units - Total Cost	\$2,336.88	\$2,877.00	\$2,555.00	\$2,954.00	\$2,058.00	\$3,080.00	\$3,718.75
Option 2 Articulating Arms for 26" Television							
Product Literature	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$		$\checkmark$	*	$\checkmark$
Warranty Information	*	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	NO BID	✓	*	*
Manufacturer/Make/Model	Mustang MV-ARML	Chief FWDVB	Level Mount DC30DJ	NU DID	Level Mount DC30DJ	*	VisionMount SF213
Unit Cost	\$29.49	\$86.50	\$37.00		\$38.00	\$69.00	\$67.20
7 Units - Total Cost	\$206.43	\$605.50	\$259.00		\$266.00	\$483.00	\$470.40
Option 3 42" Flat Screen LCD Television							
Product Literature	✓	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	✓	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$
Warranty Information	✓	✓	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	✓	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$
Manufacturer/Make/Model	LG 42LE5400	LG 42LE530C	LG 42LE530C	LG 42LD451C	Vizio E420VL	LG 42LV5500	LG 42LV5500
Unit Cost	\$886.75	\$1,040.00	\$840.00	\$681.00	\$608.00	\$971.00	\$1,281.25
5 Units - Total Cost	\$4,433.75	\$5,200.00	\$4,200.00	\$3,405.00	\$3,040.00	\$4,855.00	\$6,406.25
Option 4 Wall Bracket with Tilt for 42" Television							
Product Literature	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$		$\checkmark$	*	$\checkmark$
Warranty Information	*	$\checkmark$	$\checkmark$	NO BID	$\checkmark$	*	*
Manufacturer/Make/Model	Mustang MV-TILT3	Chief Fusion MTA	Level MountDC50T		Level Mount DC50T	*	Level Mount
Unit Cost	\$56.57	\$86.50	\$62.00		\$65.00	\$79.00	\$112.47
5 Units - Total Cost	\$282.85	\$432.50	\$310.00		\$325.00	\$395.00	\$562.35

\*Incomplete Bid