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Recronics, Inc. (Louisville KY) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Grosfillex 92.15 13,822.50$       

Contract Furnishings Int'l. (Bradenton FL) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Grosfillex 75.45 11,317.50$       

Commercial Concepts & Furn. (Independence MO) National Public 
Seating BT-3072 67.88 678.80 National Public 

Seating #602 24.73 1,483.80 $2,162.60 Grosfillex 72.79 10,918.50$       

Clint Enterprises, Inc. (Covington GA) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Grosfillex 77.50 11,625.00$       

Airfax Airline Marketing (Cumming GA) Tropitone 64710A 214.00 2,140.00 Tropitone 8024 or 
8027 99.00 5,940.00 $8,080.00 Tropitone 8032N 166.00 24,900.00$       

ATD-American Co. (Wyncote PA) Lifetime 22901 78.38 783.80 Lietime 42802 & 
2802 (Uncartoned) 30.29 1,817.40 $2,601.20 Grosfillex 80.42 12,063.00$       

Metrospace Design Group (Las Vegas NV) Lifetime 22901 101.72 1,017.20 Lietime 42802 54.72 3,283.20 $4,300.40 Grosfillex 105.01 15,751.50$       

Atlanta Fixture & Sales (Atlanta GA) Lifetime 22901 78.75 787.50 Lietime 42802 36.68 2,200.80 $2,988.30 Grosfillex 80.43 12,064.50$       

Vendors Lifetime Plastic Tables (10) Lifetime Plastic Chairs (60) Grosfillex Chaise Lounges (150)
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