COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
MCP Correctional Equipment
PQ No. 10-0009

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include
incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

February 10, 2010
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' (Danville, IL) (Montgomery, AL) (Smyrna, GA) (Vero Beach, FL) (Sugar Hill, GA) ' ' '
Addendum No. 1 * v v v v v v v v
Addendum No. 2 * v v v v v v v v
W-9 v v v v v v v v v
Date of Delivery 60-120 30 21 30 30-45 30 30 20 30
Option 1 -- Peerless #70 - #703 Leg Irons,
or equivalent
Product Literature * v * v v v v v *
\Warranty Information v v * v v v v v *
Unit Cost $42.00 $42.00 $36.95 $37.44 $34.03 $33.94 $37.58 $63.00 $31.69
10 Units - Total Cost $420.00 $420.00 $369.50 $374.40 $340.30 $339.40 $375.80 $630.00 $316.90
Option 2 -- Peerless #702 - Waist Chains,
or equivalent
Product Literature * v * v v v v v *
\Warranty Information v v * v v v v v *
Unit Cost $60.00 $58.00 $57.95 $56.00 $50.08 $49.94 $55.75 $83.00 $47.89
20 Units - Total Cost $1,200.00 $1,160.00 $1,159.00 $1,120.00 $1,001.60 $998.80 $1,115.00 $1,660.00 $957.80
Option 3 -- XPEED Full Face Correctional
Helmet, or equivalent
Product Literature No Bid v No Bid v v v No Bid No Bid v
Warranty Information No Bid * No Bid * v v No Bid No Bid *
Unit Cost $0.00 $89.00 $0.00 $246.25 $129.67 $202.97 $0.00 $0.00 $80.32
13 Units - Total Cost $0.00 $1,157.00 $0.00 $3,201.25 $1,685.71 $2,638.61 $0.00 $0.00 $1,044.16




Option 4 -- HATCH-ECB-100 -- Upper Body/
Shoulder Protection (Sizes: 5-L, 6-XXL, 2-XXXL)

Product Literature * No Bid No Bid v No Bid No Bid v v *
\Warranty Information v No Bid No Bid v No Bid No Bid v v *
Unit Cost $161.00 $0.00 $0.00 $162.00 $0.00 $0.00 $132.35 $205.00 $121.49
13 Units - Total Cost $2,093.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,106.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,720.55 $2,665.00 $1,579.37
Option 5 -- HATCH-ETP-200 -- Thigh/Groin
Protection (Sizes: 1-M, 4-L, 6-XL, 1-XXL, 1-XXXL)
Product Literature * No Bid No Bid v No Bid No Bid v v *
\Warranty Information v No Bid No Bid v No Bid No Bid v v *
Unit Cost $57.00 $0.00 $0.00 $56.88 $0.00 $0.00 $46.47 $72.00 $42.65
13 Units - Total Cost $741.00 $0.00 $0.00 $739.44 $0.00 $0.00 $604.11 $936.00 $554.45
Option 6 -- HATCH-EFP-150 -- Elbow/Forearm
Protection (Sizes: 6-M, 1-XL, 6-XXL)
Product Literature * No Bid No Bid v No Bid No Bid v v *
\Warranty Information v No Bid No Bid v No Bid No Bid v v *
Unit Cost $36.00 $0.00 $0.00 $35.28 $0.00 $0.00 $28.82 $42.00 $26.45
13 Units - Total Cost $468.00 $0.00 $0.00 $458.64 $0.00 $0.00 $374.66 $546.00 $343.85
Option 7 -- HATCH-TS-70 -- Shin Guard
Protection (Sizes: 3-M, 8-L, 1-XL, 1-XXXL)
Product Literature * No Bid No Bid v No Bid No Bid v v *
\Warranty Information v No Bid No Bid v No Bid No Bid v v *
Unit Cost $43.00 $0.00 $0.00 $33.19 $0.00 $0.00 $34.70 $52.00 $31.85
13 Units - Total Cost $559.00 $0.00 $0.00 $431.47 $0.00 $0.00 $451.10 $676.00 $414.05
Option 8 -- DAM-CRT-100L -- Damascus
Disturbance Gloves, Control, or equivalent
(Sizes: 1-M, 4-L, 8-XL)
Product Literature * v No Bid v No Bid No Bid v No Bid *
Warranty Information v * No Bid v No Bid No Bid v No Bid *
Unit Cost $52.00 $36.90 $0.00 $47.82 $0.00 $0.00 $55.00 $0.00 $31.31
13 Units - Total Cost $676.00 $479.70 $0.00 $621.66 $0.00 $0.00 $715.00 $0.00 $407.03




Option 9 -- PAULSON-510-TN -- Goggles

or equivalent
Product Literature No Bid v * v v v v v *
\Warranty Information No Bid * * v v v v v *
Unit Cost $0.00 $42.50 $37.95 $31.76 $26.93 $33.51 $42.02 $70.00 $25.42
13 Units - Total Cost $0.00 $552.50 $493.35 $412.88 $350.09 $435.63 $546.26 $910.00 $330.46
Option 10 -- Equipment Carry Bags
Product Literature * No Bid v v No Bid No Bid No Bid v v
\Warranty Information v No Bid v v No Bid No Bid No Bid v *
Ssample * No Bid * v No Bid No Bid No Bid * *
Unit Cost $84.00 $0.00 $57.95 $62.64 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00 $35.09
13 Units - Total Cost $1,092.00 $0.00 $753.35 $814.32 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $845.00 $456.17

*Incomplete Bid
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