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FINANCE DEPARTMENT 
PURCHASING DIVISION  100 TENTH STREET, P. O. BOX 1340 

  COLUMBUS, GEORGIA 31902-1340 
 706-225-4087, Fax 706-225-3033 
                              www.columbusga.org 

October 18, 2021 
 

 

ADDENDUM No. 1 
Basketball Uniforms for Parks & Recreation Leagues 

(Annual Contract) 
RFB No. 22-0013 

 
 

Use the form provided in the solicitation to acknowledge receipt of this addendum.   

Failure to do so may result in your submittal being deemed non-responsive and not 

receiving further consideration for award. 

 

Vendors are informed that the above subject solicitation is hereby modified, corrected, or 
supplemented as specified, described and set forth in this Addendum: 

 
I. QUESTIONS / RESPONSES 

 
Question 1: Can I have your last awarded unit price? 

 
Response: A bid tabulation with pricing for the previous contract, RFB No. 17-0003 - 

Athletic Uniforms, is attached.  The contract was awarded to Ad-Wear & 
Specialty of Texas, Inc.   

 
Bid tabulations are posted on the City’s Finance Department web page: 
https://www.columbusga.gov/finance/purchasing/docs/tabulations/bid_ta
bulations.htm.        

 
II.    ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 

 
         Indicate that your company has received this Addendum in the appropriate areas and   

include with sealed Bid.  Failure to acknowledge receipt of this addendum may 
render your Bid “Incomplete”.   
 
 

 

Andrea J. McCorvey 
Purchasing Manager 

 

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT 
Georgia’s First Consolidated Government 

 

http://www.columbusga.org/
https://www.columbusga.gov/finance/purchasing/docs/tabulations/bid_tabulations.htm
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BID TABULATION 

 

 

 

RFB NAME:  Athletic Uniforms (Annual Contract)  

 

RFB NO:   17-0003 

 

DATE:   July 20, 2016 
 

 

 

BRG Sports 

(Elyria, OH) 
Brand: Teamwork 

Athletic Apparel 

American Soccer 

Inc. 

(Wilmington, CA) 
*Brand: Score Denver 

Ad-Wear & 

Specialty of Texas 

(Houston, TX) 
Brand: Teamwork 

Athletic Apparel 

Boxing: Ringside 

Columbus Trophy & 

Screenprinting 

(Columbus, GA) 
Brand: Teamwork 

Athletic Apparel 

Submission 

Requirements 

 

Addenda (2) ✓ ✓ ✓ ✓ 

Product Literature ✓ ✓ ✓ ✓ 

Product Warranty ✓ ✓ ✓ ✓ 

Basketball (Bid/No 

Bid) 
Bid Bid Bid Bid 

Boxing (Bid/ No Bid) No Bid No Bid Bid No Bid 

Contract Signature 

Page 
✓ ✓ ✓ ✓ 

Pricing Information  

Basketball 

Uniforms Jerseys Shorts Jerseys Shorts Jerseys Shorts Jerseys Shorts 

Youth (S – L) 27.03 11.48 8.20 6.20 11.95 9.17 15.00 11.30 

Adult (S – XL) 29.13 13.58 8.20 6.20 13.19 10.73 17.00 14.30 

Adult (2X) 32.63 17.08 9.20 7.20 14.73 13.97 18.70 16.30 

Adult (3X) 36.13 20.58 10.20 8.20 16.73 15.97 20.00 18.00 

Adult (4X) 38.13 22.58 11.20 8.20 18.73 17.97 22.00 19.00 

 

Boxing 

 Uniforms Jerseys Shorts Jerseys Shorts Jerseys Shorts Jerseys Shorts 

Youth (S – L)     10.00 23.00   

Adult (S – XL)     12.00 23.00   

Adult (2X)     14.00 25.00   

Adult (3X)     16.00 27.00   

Adult (4X)     18.00 29.00   

         

       * As specified, “Teamwork Athletic Apparel” is the standardized brand of basketball uniforms for the combined Columbus/ 

      Phenix City Basketball League.  American Soccer Inc. proposed the brand “Score Denver”.  Therefore, the vendor was deemed 

non-responsive.  The Purchasing Division notified the vendor of the findings on August 8, 2016; however, the vendor did not 

reply.  

 

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award or intent to 

award to a particular vendor.  Bid responses are being forwarded to 

the Project Manager, who will provide an award recommendation for 

approval by the appropriate persons and/or by Columbus Council.  

 


