## **COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT**

Georgia's First Consolidated Government



**FINANCE DEPARTMENT** 

**PURCHASING DIVISION** 

100 TENTH STREET, P. O. Box 1340 COLUMBUS, GEORGIA 31902-1340 706-225-4087, Fax 706-225-3033 BidLine 706-653-4536 www.columbusga.org

**Purchasing Manager** 

December 14, 2018

## Addendum No. 1

Work Uniforms (Annual Contract) RFB No. 19-0006

Prop	posals should include acknowledgement of receipt for all Addenda:
Authorize	d Initials: Firm:
	informed that the above subject RFB is hereby modified, corrected, or supplemented described and set forth in this Addendum:
	QUESTIONS / RESPONSES
Question 1:	"Can you please furnish a bid tab, or is this the first time you are putting this bid out?"
Response:	See attached Bid Tabulation for RFB No. 13-0059. Additionally, all bid tabulations are posted on the City of Columbus' web page: <a href="https://www.columbusga.gov/finance/purchasing/docs/tabulations/bid_tabulations.htm">https://www.columbusga.gov/finance/purchasing/docs/tabulations/bid_tabulations.htm</a> . All American Uniforms was the awarded vendor.
Question 2:	"Are we able to 'NO BID' certain items?"
Response:	Vendors can "No Bid" certain items. However, per the General Specifications page 14, section XII. AWARD/ORDERING/DELIVERY/INVOICE, Item A. Award "The City may award the contract to one vendor or make an award by sections to multiple vendors, whichever is in the best interest of the City."
	Andrea J. McCorvey

Addendum No. 1 Page 1 of 2 RFB No. 19-0006

## BID TABULATION (CORRECTED COPY)

RFB NAME: RFB NO: DATE:

Work Uniforms (Annual Contract) 13-0059 May 29, 2013

	Bidder's	Written	Descriptive	Alteration Cost	Sew on	Oversize Cost	Insurance	Full Service
	Responses	Warranty & Replacement	Literature/Complete Specifications	Sheet	Emblem Cost Sheet	Sheet		Rental Program
								Offered
Aramark	7	7	7	>	~	~	7	No
Jnifirst	Y	7	7	7	7	7	7	Yes
All American	7	7	7	7	7	7	7	No
"No Bids"								

\*Denote - Not all items were bidden on.

DEPARTMENT	ALL AMERICAN UNIFORMS (Columbus, GA)	UNIFIRST (Milbrook, AL)	ARAMARK UNIFORM SERVICES (Burbank, CA)
SECTION 1: Inspection & Codes Enforcement Department	\$14,986.00	\$7,325.12*	\$ 7,647.66
SECTION II: Metra Transit	12,038.00	4,234.15*	No Bid
SECTION III: Public Works	29,056.00	9,001.98*	No Bid
SECTION IV: Civic Center	3,255.00	\$75.85*	00.069
SECTION V: Work Uniforms for Various Departments	98,184.00	117,282.92	62,250.06*
TOTAL AWARD	\$ 157,519.00	\$ 138,420.02*	*69,897.72*
*Denote - Not all items were bidden on.	e bidden on.		