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DESCRIPTION/VENDOR 

 
AAMCO of 
Columbus 

(Columbus, GA) 

 
Jasper Engines & 

Transmissions 

(Jasper, IN) 

 
McCarley 

Transmission 
Services, Inc. 

(Phenix City, AL) 

I.  TRANSMISSION REPAIR 
 
A. FIELD SERVICE 

 
Initial Period – 3 Year Cost 

 
 

TRANSMISSION 
 
 

 
 

 

 
1. A0DE Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
2. 4R70W Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
3. 4R75EW Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
4. 4R100 Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
5. E40D Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
6. 5R110W Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
7. 5R55W Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
8. 5R55S Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 
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DESCRIPTION/VENDOR 

 
AAMCO of 
Columbus 

(Columbus, GA) 

 
Jasper Engines & 

Transmissions 

(Jasper, IN) 

 
McCarley 

Transmission 
Services, Inc. 

(Phenix City, AL) 
 
 FIELD SERVICE 
(Continuation) 

 
Initial Period – 3 Year Cost 

 
 

TRANSMISSION 
 
 

 
 

 

 
9. Torque Shift Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
10. 904 Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
11. A518 Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
12. A618 Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
13. 42RE Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
14. 42LE Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
15. 48RE Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
16. 5-45FE Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 
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DESCRIPTION/VENDOR 

 
AAMCO of 
Columbus 

(Columbus, GA) 

 
Jasper Engines & 

Transmissions 

(Jasper, IN) 

 
McCarley 

Transmission 
Services, Inc. 

(Phenix City, AL) 
 
 FIELD SERVICE 
(Continuation) 

 
Initial Period – 3 Year Cost 

 
 

TRANSMISSION 
 
 

 
 

 

 
17. A606 Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
18. 4L60E Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
19. 4L80E Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
20. 4T60E Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
21. 4T65E Transmission 

 
 

 
 

 

 
LABOR CHARGE (PER HR) 

 
$89.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$85.00 

 
MILEAGE RATE (PER HR) 

 
$2.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

 
LABOR CHARGE (DRIVER) 

 
$10.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$0.00 

II.  TRANSMISSION PRICING 
 

 
 
TYPES OF TRANSMISSION 

+ 

CORE COST 

 
AAMCO of 
Columbus 

(Columbus, GA) 

 
Jasper Engines & 

Transmissions 

(Jasper, IN) 

 
McCarley 

Transmission 
Services, Inc. 

(Phenix City, AL) 

 COMPLY 
YES/NO 

COMPLY 
YES/NO 

COMPLY 
YES/NO 

 
1. A0DE 

 
Yes/$400.00 

 
Yes/$720.00 

 
Yes/$100.00 

2. 4R70W Yes/$400.00 Yes/$720.00 Yes/$150.00 

3. 4R75E Yes/$400.00 Yes/$720.00 Yes/$150.00 

4. 4R100 Yes/$600.00 Yes/$1,200.00 Yes/$150.00 

5. E40D Yes/$600.00 Yes/$840.00 Yes/$150.00 

6. 5R110W Yes/$600.00 Yes/$1,500.00 Yes/$200.00 

7. 5R55W Yes/$500.00 Yes/$600.00 Yes/$150.00 

8. 5R55S Yes/$500.00 Yes/$600.00 Yes/$150.00 

9. Torque Shift Yes/$600.00 Yes/$1,500.00 Yes/$400.00 

10. 904 Yes/$600.00 Yes/$720.00 Yes/$100.00 

11. A518 Yes/$500.00 Yes/$600.00 Yes/$150.00 

12. A618 Yes/$600.00 Yes/$175.00 Yes/$150.00 
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II.  TRANSMISSION PRICING (Continuation) 
 
TYPES OF TRANSMISSION 

 
AAMCO of 
Columbus 

(Columbus, GA) 

 
Jasper Engines & 

Transmissions 

(Jasper, IN) 

 
McCarley 

Transmission 
Services, Inc. 

(Phenix City, AL) 

 COMPLY 
YES/NO 

COMPLY 
YES/NO 

COMPLY 
YES/NO 

13. 42RE Yes/$400.00 Yes/$480.00 Yes/$150.00 

14. 42LE Yes/$400.00 Yes/$840.00 Yes/$150.00 

15. 48RE Yes/$400.00 Yes/$3,000.00 Yes/$150.00 

16. 5-45RFE Yes/$400.00 Yes/$720.00 Yes/$200.00 

17. A606 Yes/$500.00 Yes/$840.00 Yes/$100.00 

18. 4L60E Yes/$500.00 Yes/$600.00 Yes/$100.00 

19. 4L80E Yes/$600.00 Yes/$800.00 Yes/$150.00 

20. 4T60E Yes/$550.00 Yes/$480.00 Yes/$150.00 

21. 4T65E Yes/$550.00 Yes/$480.00 Yes/$150.00 

B. EXCHANGE PRICES Initial Period – 3 Year Contract Period Cost Per Unit 

1. A0DE $1,200.00 $1,599.00 $1,800.00 
2. 4R70W $1,200.00 $1,757.00 $1,950.00 

3. 4R75E $1,200.00 $1,757.00 $1,950.00 

4. 4R100 $1,600.00 $2,151.00 $2,025.00 

5. E40D $1,600.00 $1,931.00 $2,025.00 

6. 5R110W $1,600.00 $2,483.00 $2,600.00 

7. 5R55W $1,300.00 $2,144.00 $2,100.00 

8. 5R55S $1,300.00 $2,144.00 $2,100.00 

9. Torque Shift $1,600.00 $2,483.00 $4,100.00 

10. 904 $1,600.00 $1,217.00 $1,800.00 

11. A518 $1,300.00 $1,834.00 $2,200.00 

12. A618 $1,600.00 $2,419.00 $2,200.00 

13. 42RE $1,200.00 $1,950.00 $2,200.00 

14. 42LE $1,200.00 $1,950.00 $2,200.00 

15. 48RE $1,200.00 $2,549.00 $2,800.00 

16. 5-45RFE $1,200.00 $1,484.00 $2,650.00 

17. A606 $1,300.00 $1,950.00 $2,200.00 

18. 4L60E $1,300.00 $1,474.00 $1,675.00 

19. 4L80E $1,600.00 $2,076.00 $2.300.00 

20. 4T60E $1,350.00 $1,723.00 $1,800.00 

21. 4T65E $1,350.00 $1,723.00 $1,800.00 

C. LABOR CHARGES Initial Period – 3 Year Contract Period Cost Per Unit 
Flat Rate Hour 

1. A0DE $69.00 No Bid $85.00 

2. 4R70W $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
3. 4R75E $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
4. 4R100 $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
5. E40D $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
6. 5R110W $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
7. 5R55W $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
8. 5R55S $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
9. Torque Shift $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
10. 904 $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
11. A518 $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
12. A618 $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
13. 42RE $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
14. 42LE $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
15. 48RE $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
16. 5-45RFE $69.00 No Bid $85.00 



BID TABULATION SHEET 
RFB No.          14-0032 
RFB Name:     Service Contract for Various Types of Transmission for Public Works Department – Fleet 
                          Maintenance (Annual Contract) 
Date:               July 23, 2014 

Page 5 of 5 

17. A606 $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
C.  LABOR CHARGES (Continuation) 
 
TYPES OF TRANSMISSION 

 
TYPES OF 

TRANSMISSION 

 
TYPES OF 

TRANSMISSION 

 
TYPES OF 

TRANSMISSION 

18. 4L60E $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
19. 4L80E $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
20. 4T60E $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
21. 4T65E $69.00 No Bid $85.00 
D. PARTS:  

 
 

 

 

% DEDUCTED FROM LIST 
PRICE 

20% N/A 20% 

E. WARRANTY:  
 

 

 

 

1. A0DE Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

2. 4R70W Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

3. 4R75E Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

4. 4R100 Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

5. E40D Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

6. 5R110W Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

7. 5R55W Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

8. 5R55S Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

9. Torque Shift Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

10. 904 Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

11. A518 Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

12. A618 Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

13. 42RE Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

14. 42LE Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

15. 48RE Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

16. 5-45RFE Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

17. A606 Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

18. 4L60E Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

19. 4L80E Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

20. 4T60E Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

21. 4T65E Yes/One Year See Attached 
Warranty Sheet 

12 Months 

Delivery will be made 
within_____ days after receipt 
of notice to proceed. 

 
3 Days 

 
2* Days 

 
3 Days 

 


