BID TABULATION Thisisadraft tabulation. Entries are as recorded during

PARK SERVICES bid opening, may include incorrect price extensions, or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting

information is discovered during analysis of the bid

RFB NO: 13-0053

DATE: April 24, 2013 rEshonses.

BID: Agricultural Chemicals (Annual Contract)
Description/Vendor Qty John Deere Kelly Seed Howard Fertilizer

L andscapes & Chemical

Addendum No. 1 v v v
Bidder’s Response Page \ v \
Material Safety Data Sheet (MSDS) \ \ \
Three Way, Selective Herbicide or Equivalent | 500 Gals 28.69/ga 65.88/2.5 gal 22.00/gd
Three-Way, Ester |1 or Equivalent 30 Cs 332.46/cs No Bid 54.42 gal
Chelated Iron Plus, 12-0-0 or Equivalent 5 Gals 9.09/ga 18.33/gal 8.32/gd
Pellitized Lime or Equivalent 120 Bags 4.85/50 b 4.60/40 Ib 7.37/50 Ib
Revolver or Equivalent 30Cs 2160.00/87 oz/ca 629.54/87 oz 540.00/87 oz
Pre-m 0.86% 0-0-7 or Equivalent 700 Bags 16.14/50 Ib No Bid 12.27/50 Ib
Pre-m 3.3 EC 0.86% 0-0-7 or Equivalent 100 Gal 35.53/gdl No Bid 28.26/gd
Pre-m 0.86% 25-2-5 or Equivalent 700 Bags 19.69/50 Ib 25.00/50 1b 17.85/50 Ib
24-2-11 or Equivalent 1200 Bags 18.65/50 Ib 21.77/501b 16.69/50 Ib
18-24-12 or Equivalent 20 Bags 18.51/50 Ib 24.55/501b 16.42/50 Ib
20-1-5 or Equivalent 20 Bags 11.38/50 Ib No Bid 11.47/50 Ib
25-5-11 or Equivalent 1200 Bags 16.78/50 Ib No Bid 14.22/50 Ib
5-10-15 or Equivalent 120 Bags 18.91/50 Ib 14.25/50 Ib 11.56/50 Ib
Dolimitic Lime or Equivalent 360 Bags 4.85/50 b No Bid 7.37/50 Ib
Garlon *3A or Equivalent 100 Gals 94.30/gal No Bid 78.82/gal
Manicure 6FL or Equivalent 25 Gals 32.60/gal No Bid 34.20/gal
Top Choice Insecticide or Equivalent 100 Bags 137.00/50 Ib No Bid 125.00/50 Ib
Simazine 4L or Equivalent 5 Gals 22.97/gd 40.55/2.5 gal 15.98/gal
Reward L andscape/Aquatic herbicide or 20 Gals 58.55/gdl 169.44/2.5 gal 79.00/gd




Description/Vendor Qty John Deere Kelly Seed Howard Fertilizer
L andscapes & Chemical

Equivalent

Spectacle 200.00/18 oz No Bid 1400.00/gal

1400.00/gal

Foam Marker 15 Gals 25.90/gal 18.05/gal 35.24/gal
Primo Maxx or Equivalent 20 Gals 154.20/gal 177.77/ga 152.50/gal
Rodeo or Equivalent 200 Gals 25.47/gal 62.50/2.5 gal 19.56/gal
Roundup Quick Pro or Equivalent 200 Gals 12.02/Ib No Bid 63.59/1b
L esco-Fate or Equivalent 5Lbs 8.55/lb No Bid 6.70/lb
UP-Star Gold or Equivalent 50 Gals 34.30/gal 29.72/gal 28.50/gal
Headline or Equivalent 2 Gals 1484.80/gal No Bid No Bid
Dimension Ultra or Equivalent 200 Oz 3.29/0z No Bid 2.57/0z
Trimec 992 or Equivalent 500 Gals 28.09/gal No Bid 22.00/gal
Manor 60DF or Equivalent 50 Oz 10.95/0z No Bid 8.75/0z
Sedge Hammer or Equivalent 80 Oz 59.77/oz No Bid 51.96/0z
Monument 75WG or Equivalent 20 Oz 240.00/bx No Bid 215.00
Drive 75DF or Equivalent 100 Ibs 40.68/1b No Bid 47.00/1b
Celsus WG 100 Ibs 136.00/Ib No Bid 87.55/10 oz
Crosscheck Plus 300 bags 16.81/25Ib No Bid 11.68/25Ib
Liquid Iron 50 Gals 9.09/gal 15.62/2.5 gal 8.32/gal
Spreader Sticker/Surfactant 20 Gals 21.61/2.5 gal 9.37/gd 9.86/gd
Spray Tank Cleaner 50 Gals 3.00/1b 30.57/gd 3.23/lb
Sevin 4F or Equivalent 300 Gals 45.00/gal 114.02/2.5 gal 36.41/gd
G-Pro 2.32% or Equivalent 80 Bags 58.20/gal No Bid No Bid




RFB NO:
DATE:
BID:

13-0053

April 24, 2013
Agricultural Chemicals (Annual Contract)

BID TABULATION
PUBLIC WORKS

Thisisadraft tabulation. Entries are as recorded during
bid opening, may include incorrect price extensions, or

transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid

resnonses.

Description/Vendors Qty John Deere Kelly Seed Howard Fertilizer &
L andscape Chemicals

Addendum No. 1 N \

Bidder’ s Response Page \ \

Material Safety Data Sheet (MSDS) N \

Three Way, Selective Herbicide 500 Gals 28.69/gal 65.88/2.5 gal 22.00/gal
Chelated Iron Plus,12-0-0 5 Gals 9.09/gal 18.33/2.5 g 8.32/gal
Induce 50 Gals 21.61/gal No Bid No Bid
Herbicide, Three-Way,Ester || 30Cs 332.46/cs No Bid 54.42/gal
Herbicide, Revolver 30Cs 2160.00/cs 629.54/87 oz 540.00/87 oz
Fertilizer, Lime Pdllitized 120 Bags 4.85/50 Ib 4.60/40 Ib 7.37/50 b
Fertilizer, Mulch 70/30 80 Bags 13.50/50 Ib No Bid No Bid
Target 6.6 (MSMA) 10 Gals 27.39/gal 58.88/2.5 gal 22.05/gal
24-2-11 1200 Bags 18.65/50 Ib 21.77/50 1b 16.69/50 Ib
Pre-m 0.86% 0-0-7 700 Bags 16.14/50 1b No Bid 12.27/501b
Pre-m 0.86% 25-2-5 700 Bags 19.69/50 Ib 25.00/50 Ib 17.85/501b
Roundup Quick Pro 200 Gals 12.02/Ib No Bid 63.59/6.8 Ib
Rodeo 200 Gals 25.48/gal 62.50/2.5 gal 19.56/gal
Fertilizer, 13-13-13 120 Bags 20.58/50 Ib 15.00/50 Ib 13.42/50 1b
Trimec 992 500 Gals 28.09/gal No Bid 22.00/gal
Spreader Sticker/Surfactant 20 Gals 21.61/25¢gd 9.37/gal 9.86/gal




