

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Miscellaneous Equipment for Public Works - RFB No. 13-0028
February 6, 2013

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

Option 1: Heavy-Duty Dual-Axle Trailers

Submission Requirements	Add No. 1	Add No. 2	Add No. 3	Product Literature	Warranty Information	REVISED Response Pages	Manufacturer/Make/Model	Unit Cost	Total Cost (12 Units)
Melson Tractor Company (Salem, AL)	✓	✓	✓	*	✓	✓	280 Trailers 27816 TUB	\$3,275.00	\$39,300.00
Mason Tractor Company (McDonough, GA)	✓	✓	✓	*	*	✓	Hooper 16' HD Landscape	\$3,474.50	\$41,694.00
Verde, Inc. (Lake Wales, FL)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Horton Hustler BP716TA	\$3,495.00	\$41,940.00
JCB of Atlanta (Kennesaw, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Hardeebuilt 5 Ton	\$3,645.00	\$43,740.00
K & K Manufacturing, Inc. (Griffin, GA)	*	*	*	✓	✓	*	K & K Mfg. 78x16 E25K	\$3,740.00	\$44,880.00
Carolina Trailer Sales (Campobello, SC)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	BH1622FB	\$3,885.00	\$46,620.00
Terex Utilities (Glen Allen, VA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Hudson Brothers/HTLG16	\$4,937.00	\$59,244.00
Border Equipment (Augusta, GA)	✓	✓	✓	INCOMPLETE					
Holden Industries, Inc. (Southwest City, MO)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID					
Crafco, Inc. (Chandler, AZ)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID					
Reynolds-Warren Equipment Co., Inc. (Lake City, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID					
Road Products, Inc. (Fayetteville, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID					
Bobcat of Opelika (Opelika, AL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID					

* Incomplete Bid

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Miscellaneous Equipment for Public Works - RFB No. 13-0028
February 6, 2013

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

Option 2: 18-ft Flatbed Trailer

Submission Requirements	Add No. 1	Add No. 2	Add No. 3	Product Literature	Warranty Information	REVISED Response Pages	Manufacturer/Make/Model	Unit Cost
Mason Tractor Company (McDonough, GA)	✓	✓	✓	*	*	✓	Hooper 23' Equipment	\$4,487.50
K & K Manufacturing, Inc. (Griffin, GA)	*	*	*	✓	✓	*	K & K Mfg. 102x18 E27K	\$4,865.00
JCB of Atlanta (Kennesaw, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Hardeebuilt 7 Ton Flat Deck	\$5,172.00
Carolina Trailer Sales (Campobello, SC)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Carolina/Model BH2322DT	\$6,110.00
Terex Utilities (Glen Allen, VA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Hudson Brothers/HTM BG-21	\$6,437.00
Holden Industries, Inc. (Southwest City, MO)	✓	✓	✓	*	✓	✓	Holden T014	\$9,631.00
Verde, Inc. (Lake Wales, FL)	✓	✓	✓	WITHDRAWN				
Border Equipment (Augusta, GA)	✓	✓	✓	INCOMPLETE				
Melson Tractor Company (Salem, AL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Crafco, Inc. (Chandler, AZ)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Reynolds-Warren Equipment Co., Inc. (Lake City, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Road Products, Inc. (Fayetteville, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Bobcat of Opelika (Opelika, AL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				

* Incomplete Bid

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Miscellaneous Equipment for Public Works - RFB No. 13-0028
February 6, 2013

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

Option 3: Asphalt Curb Machine

Submission Requirements	Add No. 1	Add No. 2	Add No. 3	Product Literature	Warranty Information	Response Pages	Manufacturer/Make/Model	Unit Cost
Reynolds-Warren Equipment Co., Inc. (Lake City, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Miller MC-650	\$8,035.00
Verde, Inc. (Lake Wales, FL)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
Holden Industries, Inc. (Southwest City, MO)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
Melson Tractor Company (Salem, AL)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
Carolina Trailer Sales (Campobello, SC)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
Mason Tractor Company (McDonough, GA)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
Terex Utilities (Glen Allen, VA)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
Crafco, Inc. (Chandler, AZ)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
Border Equipment (Augusta, GA)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
Road Products, Inc. (Fayetteville, GA)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
JCB of Atlanta (Kennesaw, GA)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
Bobcat of Opelika (Opelika, AL)	✓	✓	✓				NO BID	
K & K Manufacturing, Inc. (Griffin, GA)	*	*	*				NO BID	

* Incomplete Bid

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Miscellaneous Equipment for Public Works - RFB No. 13-0028
February 6, 2013

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

Option 4: Asphalt Tack Distributor, 250-Gallon, Trailer

Submission Requirements	Add No. 1	Add No. 2	Add No. 3	Product Literature	Warranty Information	Response Pages	Manufacturer/Make/Model	Unit Cost
Road Products, Inc. (Fayetteville, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	CIMLINE TK-250	\$11,100.00
Reynolds-Warren Equipment Co., Inc. (Lake City, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	LeeBoy L250T	\$11,210.00
Verde, Inc. (Lake Wales, FL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Holden Industries, Inc. (Southwest City, MO)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Melson Tractor Company (Salem, AL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Carolina Trailer Sales (Campobello, SC)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Mason Tractor Company (McDonough, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Terex Utilities (Glen Allen, VA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Crafco, Inc. (Chandler, AZ)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Border Equipment (Augusta, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
JCB of Atlanta (Kennesaw, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Bobcat of Opelika (Opelika, AL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
K & K Manufacturing, Inc. (Griffin, GA)	*	*	*	NO BID				

* Incomplete Bid

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Miscellaneous Equipment for Public Works - RFB No. 13-0028
February 6, 2013

Option 5: Asphalt Sealer Tank

Submission Requirements	Add No. 1	Add No. 2	Add No. 3	Product Literature	Warranty Information	Response Pages	Manufacturer/Make/Model	Unit Cost
Road Products, Inc. (Fayetteville, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	CIMLINE MAGMA 150	\$48,415.00
Reynolds-Warren Equipment Co., Inc. (Lake City, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Crafco SS125-DC	\$51,695.00
Crafco, Inc. (Chandler, AZ)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Crafco, Inc. SS125	\$56,750.00
Verde, Inc. (Lake Wales, FL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Holden Industries, Inc. (Southwest City, MO)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Melson Tractor Company (Salem, AL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Carolina Trailer Sales (Campobello, SC)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Mason Tractor Company (McDonough, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Terex Utilities (Glen Allen, VA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Border Equipment (Augusta, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
JCB of Atlanta (Kennesaw, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Bobcat of Opelika (Opelika, AL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
K & K Manufacturing, Inc. (Griffin, GA)	*	*	*	NO BID				

* Incomplete Bid

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Miscellaneous Equipment for Public Works - RFB No. 13-0028
February 6, 2013

Option 6: Mid-Size Skid Steer with Milling Attachments

Submission Requirements	Add No. 1	Add No. 2	Add No. 3	Product Literature	Warranty Information	REVISED Response Pages	Manufacturer/Make/Model	Unit Cost
Bobcat of Opelika (Opelika, AL)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	*	Bobcat Skid Steer S590	\$37,242.30
Border Equipment (Augusta, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	Case SR200	\$45,053.29
JCB of Atlanta (Kennesaw, GA)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	JCB 205 Skid Steer	\$55,121.36
Verde, Inc. (Lake Wales, FL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Holden Industries, Inc. (Southwest City, MO)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Melson Tractor Company (Salem, AL)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Carolina Trailer Sales (Campobello, SC)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Mason Tractor Company (McDonough, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Terex Utilities (Glen Allen, VA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Crafco, Inc. (Chandler, AZ)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Reynolds-Warren Equipment Co., Inc. (Lake City, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
Road Products, Inc. (Fayetteville, GA)	✓	✓	✓	NO BID				
K & K Manufacturing, Inc. (Griffin, GA)	*	*	*	NO BID				

* Incomplete Bid