
Submission Requirements Legacy Ford
(McDonough, GA)

Wade Ford
(Smyrna, GA)

Carl Black Buick 
Chevrolet GMC
(Kennesaw, GA)

Rivertown Ford
(Columbus, GA)

Legacy Automotive of 
Columbus, LLC
(Columbus, GA)

Hardy Chevrolet Pontiac Buick 
Inc.

(Dallas, GA)

Family Ford Inc.
(Dallas, GA)

Addendum No. 1
Addendum No. 2
Addendum No. 3
Option 1 -- Chevrolet Tahoe SUVs, or equivalent
Product Literature
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model 2012 Ford Expedition 2012 Ford Expedition 
SSV 2012 Chevrolet Tahoe 2012 Ford Expedition XL 2012 GM Chevrolet Tahoe 

PPV
2012 Chevrolet Tahoe,

CC10706
Unit Cost $23,750.00 $24,298.00 $25,174.00 $25,420.00 $26,228.75 $26,467.00

38 Units - Total Cost $902,500.00 $923,324.00 $956,612.00 $965,960.00 $996,692.50 $1,005,746.00

Submission Requirements Mall of Georgia Ford
(Buford, GA)

Nextran Truck Center
(Macon, GA)

Stokes Brown Toyota
Hilton Head

(Bluffton, SC)

Brooker Ford Lincoln 
Mercury

(Dalton, GA)

Jay Buick GMC, Inc.
(Columbus, GA)

Allan Vigil Ford
(Morrow, GA)

Addendum No. 1
Addendum No. 2
Addendum No. 3
Option 1 -- Chevrolet Tahoe SUVs, or equivalent
Product Literature
Warranty Information
Response Pages
Manufacturer/Make/Model

Unit Cost
38 Units - Total Cost

  * Incomplete Bid

NO BID NO BID

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Various Vehicles - RFB No. 12-0008

October 5, 2011

Option 1: Chevrolet Tahoe SUVs, or equivalent

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid
opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.



Submission Requirements
Hardy Chevrolet Pontiac 

Buick Inc.
(Dallas, GA)

Carl Black Buick 
Chevrolet GMC
(Kennesaw, GA)

Legacy Automotive of 
Columbus, LLC
(Columbus, GA)

Wade Ford
(Smyrna, GA)

Mall of Georgia Ford
(Buford, GA)

Legacy Ford
(McDonough, GA)

Allan Vigil Ford
(Morrow, GA)

Option 2 -- Chevrolet Impalas, or equivalent
Product Literature
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model 2012 Chevrolet Impala, 
ILS

2012 Chevrolet Impala 
1WF19

2012 GM Chevrolet 
Impala 2012 Ford Taurus P2D 2012 Ford Taurus 2012 Ford Taurus 2012 Ford Taurus SE

Unit Cost $17,490.00 $18,380.00 $18,585.00 $20,066.00 $20,450.00 $20,450.00 $20,578.00
15 Units - Total Cost $262,350.00 $275,700.00 $278,775.00 $300,990.00 $306,750.00 $306,750.00 $308,670.00

Submission Requirements Rivertown Ford
(Columbus, GA)

Stokes Brown Toyota
Hilton Head

(Bluffton, SC)

Family Ford Inc.
(Dallas, GA)

Nextran Truck Center
(Macon, GA)

Brooker Ford Lincoln Mercury
(Dalton, GA)

Jay Buick GMC, Inc.
(Columbus, GA)

Option 2 -- Chevrolet Impalas, or equivalent
Product Literature
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model 2012 Ford Taurus SEL 2012 Toyota Camry SE / 
2550

Unit Cost $22,170.00 $25,508.00
15 Units - Total Cost $332,550.00 $382,620.00

  * Incomplete Bid

NO BID

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Various Vehicles - RFB No. 12-0008

October 5, 2011

Option 2: Chevrolet Impalas, or equivalent

NO BID NO BID NO BID

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid
opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.



Submission Requirements Rivertown Ford
(Columbus, GA)

Wade Ford
(Smyrna, GA)

Family Ford Inc.
(Dallas, GA)

Allan Vigil Ford
(Morrow, GA)

Legacy Ford
(McDonough, GA)

Brooker Ford Lincoln Mercury
(Dalton, GA)

Hardy Chevrolet Pontiac 
Buick Inc.

(Dallas, GA)

Option 3 -- 15 Passenger Vans
Product Literature *
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model 2012 Ford E-350 XL 2012 Ford E-350 2012 Ford E-350,
15 Pass. 2012 Ford E-350 Wagon 2012 Ford E-350 Ford E-350 2012 Chevrolet Express 

3500
Unit Cost $23,519.00 $23,582.00 $23,958.00 $24,169.00 $24,190.00 $24,611.00 $24,686.00

2 Units - Total Cost $47,038.00 $47,164.00 $47,916.00 $48,338.00 $48,380.00 $49,222.00 $49,372.00

Submission Requirements Mall of Georgia Ford
(Buford, GA)

Nextran Truck Center
(Macon, GA)

Carl Black Buick 
Chevrolet GMC
(Kennesaw, GA)

Jay Buick GMC, Inc.
(Columbus, GA)

Stokes Brown Toyota
Hilton Head

(Bluffton, SC)

Legacy Automotive of 
Columbus, LLC
(Columbus, GA)

Option 3 -- 15 Passenger Vans
Product Literature
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model  2012 Ford E-350 2012 Ford E-350 2012 Chevrolet 
Express

2012 GMC Savana
T933706

Unit Cost $24,800.00 $24,946.05 $26,299.00 $28,575.00
2 Units - Total Cost $49,600.00 $49,892.10 $52,598.00 $57,150.00

  * Incomplete Bid

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Various Vehicles - RFB No. 12-0008

October 5, 2011

Option 3:  15 Passenger Vans

NO BID NO BID

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid
opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.



Submission Requirements
Carl Black Buick 
Chevrolet GMC
(Kennesaw, GA)

Rivertown Ford
(Columbus, GA)

Wade Ford
(Smyrna, GA)

Brooker Ford Lincoln 
Mercury

(Dalton, GA)

Allan Vigil Ford
(Morrow, GA)

Legacy Ford
(McDonough, GA)

Mall of Georgia Ford
(Buford, GA)

Option 4 -- 1/2 Ton Crew Cab, 4x4 Pickup Trucks

Product Literature *
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model 2012 Chevrolet Silverado 
1500 CK10753 2012 Ford F-150 XL 2012 Ford F-150 Ford F-150 2012 Ford F-150 2012 Ford F-150 2012 Ford F-150 Crew 4x4

Unit Cost $23,699.00 $24,843.00 $24,844.00 $25,017.00 $25,240.00 $25,311.00 $25,500.00
2 Units - Total Cost $47,398.00 $49,686.00 $49,688.00 $50,034.00 $50,480.00 $50,622.00 $51,000.00

Submission Requirements Jay Buick GMC, Inc.
(Columbus, GA)

Hardy Chevrolet Pontiac 
Buick Inc.

(Dallas, GA)

Family Ford Inc.
(Dallas, GA)

Stokes Brown Toyota
Hilton Head

(Bluffton, SC)

Nextran Truck Center
(Macon, GA)

Legacy Automotive of 
Columbus, LLC
(Columbus, GA)

Option 4 -- 1/2 Ton Crew Cab, 4x4 Pickup Trucks
Product Literature
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model 2012 GMC Sierra 
TK10543

2012 Chevy Silverado
1500, CK10543

2012 Ford F-150,
XL Crew Cab 4x4

2012 Toyota Tundra / 
8359

Unit Cost $26,095.00 $26,536.00 $26,734.00 $30,500.00
2 Units - Total Cost $52,190.00 $53,072.00 $53,468.00 $61,000.00

  * Incomplete Bid

NO BID NO BID

COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Various Vehicles - RFB No. 12-0008

October 5, 2011

Option 4:  1/2 Ton Crew Cab, 4x4 Pickup Trucks

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid
opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.


