
Bid Tabulation Sheet 
 

Date:  February 16, 2011 
 
Bid Name: Service Contract for Fire Extinguishers (Annual Contract) 
 
Bid No.: RFB No. 11-0040   
 
 
EST.QTY 

 
VENDOR 

 

 
COLUMBUS FIRE & 
SAFETY EQUIP. INC. 

(Columbus, GA) 

 
SIMPLEY GRINNELL 

(Columbus, GA) 

 
 

 
SIZE/TYPE 

 
Recharge/ 
Unit Cost 

 
Testing/ 
Unit Cost 

 
Purchase/ 
Unit Cost 

 
Recharge/ 
Unit Cost 

 
Testing/ 
Unit Cost 

 
Purchase/ 
Unit Cost 

 
580 

 
2 ½ LB – ABC 

 
 $ 6.95 

 
 $ 10.50 

 
 $ 27.50 

 
 $ 20.44 

 
 $ 15.00 

 
 $ 32.50 

 
8 

 
4 LB – ABC 

 
 10.65 

 
 16.80 

 
 No Bid 

 
 23.16 

 
 16.00 

 
 41.33 

 
2 

 
4 LB - CO2 

 
 10.65 

 
 16.80 

 
 No Bid 

 
 15.30 

 
 15.00 

 
 153.57 

 
159 

 
5 LB - ABC 

 
 12.25 

 
 10.50 

 
 36.25 

 
 23.16 

 
 15.00 

 
 41.33 

 
16 

 
5 LB - CO2 

 
 10.65 

 
 16.80 

 
 122.95 

 
 15.30 

 
 15.00 

 
 153.57 

 
2 

 
6 LB - ABC 

 
 13.40 

 
 10.50 

 
 No Bid 

 
 23.16 

 
 15.00 

 
 41.33 

 
120 

 
10 LB - ABC 

 
 18.90 

 
 10.50 

 
 58.85 

 
 27.25 

 
 15.00 

 
 65.00 

 
19 

 
10 LB - CO2 

 
 15.75 

 
 16.80 

 
 178.35 

 
 24.53 

 
 15.00 

 
 221.30 

 
10 

 
15 LB - CO2 

 
 19.65 

 
 16.80 

 
 208.75 

 
 36.79 

 
 15.00 

 
 255.63 

 
54 

 
20 LB - ABC 

 
 28.35 

 
 10.50 

 
 108.35 

 
 31.34 

 
 15.00 

 
 102.53 

 
10 

 
20 LB - CO2 

 
 23.65 

 
 16.80 

 
 258.25 

 
 49.05 

 
 15.00 

 
 326.34 

 
5 

 
30 LB - ABC 

 
 37.80 

 
 10.50 

 
 No Bid 

 
 65.75 

 
 15.00 

 
 555.50 

 
2 

 
30 LB - CLASS D 

 
 54.35 

 
 10.50 

 
 No Bid 

 
 103.40 

 
 15.00 

 
 655.50 

 
1 

 
50 LB - ABC 

 
 108.15 

 
 16.80 

 
 1,417.25 

 
 77.68 

 
 20.00 

 
 1,628.05 

 
21 

 
2 ½ GAL PRES. WATER 

 
 8.40 

 
 10.50 

 
 90.50 

 
 15.30 

 
 15.00 

 
 101.79 

 
7 

 
BC (CO2) 

 
 15.75 

 
 16.80 

 
 178.35 

 
 2.50 per lb 

 
 15.00 

 
 2.50 per lb 

 
5 
 

 
33 GAL Fffp FORM, 
WHEEL UNIT 

 
140.65 

 
16.80 

 
3,780.00 

 
2,191.20 

 
50.00 

 
5,213.25 

REPAIR PARTS/MAINTENANCE SERVICE 
 COLUMBUS FIRE & 

SAFETY EQUIP. INC. 
(Columbus, GA) 

SIMPLEY 
GRINNELL 

(Columbus, GA) 

SIZE/TYPE UNIT COST UNIT COST 

PULL PIN 0.50 2.45 

COLLAR O’ RING 0.60 3.53 

VALVE STEM 4.55 14.43 

PRESSURE GAUGE 4.75 15.08 

RIVET 0.45 2.00 

HANDLE 3.70 5.00 

LEVER 3.70 4.50 

HOSE STRAP W/CLIP 2.90 16.04 

FIRE EXT MAINTENANCE (6YR)  3.00 8.58 

HAZARDOUS MATERIAL COMMUNICATION 

LABEL 

0.55 2.44 

ANNUAL MAINTENANCE OF FIRE 
EXTINGUISHERS 

4.75 4.00 

FIRE EXT. SERVICED & INSPECTED 4.75 4.00 

FIRE EXTINGUISHER REPAIR MAINTENANCE 

SERVICE 

4.75 45.00 

FIRE ALARM MONITORING SERVICES 25.25 425.00 

HOOD SYSTEM INSPECTION 65.00 110.00 

 

 


