COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Tables and Carts for Ice Rinks
RFB No. 11-0035
January 26, 2011

Mity-Lite Virco, Inc. The Gamble Group Commercial Concepts & Furn Facility Supply Group Palmer Snyder Furniture The Overby Co.
Description Qty (Orem UT) (Conway AR) (Columbus GA) (Independence MO) (Roswell GA) (Lexington KY) (Columbus GA)
Unit Ext. Brand Unit Ext. Brand Unit Ext. Brand Unit Ext. Brand Unit Ext. Brand Unit Ext. Brand Unit Ext. Brand

Performance Palmer

Rectangular Banquet Table 26 | 168.08 | 4,370.08 | Mity-Lite § 277.11 | 7,204.86 | Virco J 174.53 | 4,537.78 | Mity-Litej] 214.44 | 5,575.44 | Mity-Lite § 149.00| 3,874.00 Office 167.76 | 4,361.76 Synder 215.82 | 5,611.32 | Mity-Lite
Furnishings
Performance Palmer

Seminar Tables 50 § 140.69 | 7,034.50 | Mity-Lite § 237.39 | 11,869.50| Virco § 147.14 | 7,357.00 | Mity-Litej] 176.59 | 8,829.50 | Mity-Lite 87.50 | 4,375.00 Office 128.46 | 6,423.00 Synder 177.71 | 8,885.50 | Mity-Lite
Furnishings
Performance Palmer

Round Tables 20 j§ 193.81 | 3,876.20 | Mity-Lite § 301.85 | 6,037.00 | Virco j 200.26 | 4,005.20 | Mity-Litej 265.11 | 5,302.20 | Mity-Lite § 159.00| 3,180.00 Office 187.41 | 3,748.20 Synder 266.81 | 5,336.20 | Mity-Lite
Furnishings
Performance Palmer

Round Tables 20 | 285.94 | 5,718.80 | Mity-Lite § 409.70 | 8,194.00 | Virco j 292.39 | 5,847.80 | Mity-Litej] 346.26 | 6,925.20 | Mity-Lite § 229.00| 4,580.00 Office 246.35 | 4,927.00 Synder 348.48 | 6,969.60 | Mity-Lite
Furnishings
Performance Palmer

Cocktail Tables 24 f 142.03 | 3,408.72 | Mity-Lite §No Bid| No Bid Virco | 123.48 | 2,963.52 | Mity-Litej 187.18 | 4,492.32 | Mity-Lite § 129.00| 3,096.00 Office 128.46 | 3,083.04 Synder 188.38 | 4,521.12 | Mity-Lite
Furnishings
Performance Palmer

Carts for Round Tables 8 | 342.39 | 2,739.12 | Mity-Lite | 535.27 | 4,282.16 | Virco  348.85| 2,790.80 | Mity-Lite} 396.76 | 3,174.08 | Mity-Lite J 239.00| 1,912.00 Office 287.94 | 2,303.52 Synder 399.30 | 3,194.40 | Mity-Lite
Furnishings
Performance Palmer

Carts for Rectangular Tables 4 § 229.78 919.12 Mity-Lite § 306.14 | 1,224.56 | Virco [ 236.23 944.92 | Mity-Litef 260.14 | 1,040.56 | Mity-Lite § 229.00| 916.00 Office 345.24 | 1,380.96 Synder 261.80 | 1,047.20 | Mity-Lite
Furnishings
Performance Palmer

Carts for Cocktail Tables 3 J 454.50 | 1,363.50 | Mity-Lite f No Bid| No Bid Virco | 452.45| 1,357.35 | Mity-Litej 802.81 | 2,408.43 | Mity-Lite § 229.00| 687.00 Office 358.53 | 1,075.59 Synder 490.60 | 1,471.80 | Mity-Lite
Furnishings

TOTAL BID 29,430.04 38,812.08 29,804.37 37,747.73 22,620.00 27,303.07 37,037.14

The Gamble Group listed a total bid of $28,408.97, based on providing (4) Carts for Round Tables instead of the specified quantity of (8). The above pricing is based on the Gamble Group unit price for (8) carts.
Palmer Synder failed to include a copy their Business License; therefore, bid submitted by Palmer Snyder is deemed non-responsive and ineligible for award consideration.
Commercial Concepts & Furn failed to include a copy of Business License, Product Literature for all items and acknowledgement of Addendum No 1; therefore, the bid submitted by Commercial Concepts & Furn is deemed non-
responsive and ineligible for award consideration.




